
TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT

POLICE DEPARTMENT

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ)

VARIOUS SCUBA EQUIPMENT FOR THE DIVE TEAM

RFQ 6487  6/28/2023

ITEM/DESCRIPTION QTY  UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY  UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY  UNIT PRICE  TOTAL QTY  UNIT PRICE  TOTAL 

Bouncy compensator Device (BCD)

Backplate style BCD (Halcyon or equivalent) 7  $                765.00  $               5,355.00 7  $             1,116.00  $               7,812.00 7  $                990.00  $               6,930.00 7  $                682.00  $               4,774.00 

Backplate style BCD shall be equipped with the following

·         Integrated Weight pockets

·         Quick cinch harness

·         Minimum 30 lb wing

·         Backplate pad

Dry Suits

Ursuit One Endurance Dry suit, color Black. Each shall
be equipped with the following:

7  $             2,728.00  $             19,096.00 0  $    7  $             3,200.00  $             22,400.00 7  $             3,051.20  $             21,358.40 

Zipper Pocket

Cargo Pocket

Integrated boots

SiTech quick neck seals

SiTech round wrist seals

SiTech dry glove system

7 pairs of medium weight undergarments

Assorted Dive Gear

Dive Knives 7  $                  43.00  $                  301.00 7  $                  22.00  $                  154.00 7  $                  45.00  $                  315.00 7  $                  39.20  $                  274.40 

Scubapro Jet Fins with spring straps (pairs) 7  $                155.00  $               1,085.00 7  $ $ 7  $                200.00  $               1,400.00 7  $                171.20  $               1,198.40 

Fourth element 3mm dive hood 7  no bid  $                           -   7  $ $ 7  $                  55.00  $                  385.00 7  $                  52.00  $                  364.00 

Safety shears with case 7  $                  22.00  $                  154.00 7  $ $ 7  $                  19.95  $                  139.65 7  $                  12.00  $                     84.00 

7 dive masks 7  $                  23.00  $                  161.00 7  $                  87.30  $                  611.10 7  $                  85.00  $                  595.00 7  $                  47.00  $                  329.00 

1600 lumen Backup flashlight - rechargeable 7  no bid $ 7  $                  90.00  $                  630.00 7  $                139.00  $                  973.00 7  $                111.00  $                  777.00 

80 cubic foot aluminum dive tanks with K valve 5  $                295.00  $               1,475.00 5  $                245.00  $               1,225.00 5  $                250.00  $               1,250.00 5  $                270.00  $               1,350.00 
Mustang HIT Hydrostatic Inflatable PFD W/POLICE
placard

7  $                359.00  $               2,513.00 7  $ $ 7  $                270.00  $               1,890.00 7  $                355.00  $               2,485.00 

OTS MK-7 W/Headset 1  $             1,470.00  $               1,470.00 1  $ $ 1  $             1,432.00  $               1,432.00 1  $             1,469.48  $               1,469.48 
OTS Powercomm 3000S Wireless Communication
system

1  $             2,955.00  $               2,955.00 1  $ $ 1  $             3,299.00  $               3,299.00 1  $             3,149.10  $               3,149.10 

Full Face Masks W/ Communications Equipment
OTS Positive pressure full face mask equipped with the
following:

7  $             3,290.00  $             23,030.00 7  $ $ 7  $                799.00  $               5,593.00 7  $             3,298.14  $             23,086.98 
·         Air supply hose
·         Omni swivel fitting with quick disconnect
·         Gill system
·         OTS earphones W/hotmic
·         OTS Powercomm 3000D
·         Rail system for GoPro camera

Dive Computer    

Shearwater Perdix W/ Air Integration Transmitter 7  $             1,230.00  $               8,610.00 7  $             1,360.00  $               9,520.00 7 '950/300  $               8,750.00 7  $             1,287.00  $               9,009.00 

Regulators

1
st

 and 2
nd

 stage regulator system compatible with ice diving
(specify brand and model)

7  $                665.00  $               4,655.00 7  $                793.00  $               5,551.00 7  $             1,349.00  $               9,443.00 7  $                453.75  $               3,176.25 

Side Scan Sonar  no bid  no bid 

Tritech Starfish 990F Side Scan Sonar 1  $ $ 1  $ $ 1  $             7,885.00  $               7,885.00 1  not available  $                           -   

Urban Swiftwater Rescue Kit

Each Swiftwater rescue kit shall contain the following: 8  $             1,263.80  $             10,110.40 8  $ $ 8  $             1,200.00  $               9,600.00 8  $             1,431.22  $             11,449.76 
·         Swiftwater helmet
·         75 ft throwline bag
·         Water rescue gloves
·         Force 6 rescuer PFD or comparable
·         Storm whistle
·         Stearns I805 rapid rescue extreme dry suit or comparable
·         All terrain wet shoe – zip up
·         Swiftwater power fins
·         2 rescue knives

Dry suit lifetime warranty additional cost

Includes lifetime coverage for the following: 7  no bid  no bid 7  $ $ 7  $                500.00  $               3,500.00 7  $                600.00  $               4,200.00 

·         Zippers, seals, suit puncture repair w/leak test    

On site equipment setup and Buoyancy/Diving Training

·         Includes (3) 8-hour training days 8am-4pm (variable) 1  $             4,000.00  $               4,000.00 1  $ $ 1  $             3,000.00  $               3,000.00 1  $             4,500.00  $               4,500.00 

Kevin Bova

RFQ 6487  6/28/2023

Dive Rescue International, Inc.  201 N. Link
Lane, Suite A  Fort Collins, CO 80524

Scuba Shack Diving Services LLC.  1275 Cromwell Ave
A6  Rocky Hill , Ct  06067

Evolution Scuba LLC  440 Buttonball Dr.
Glastonbury, Ct. 06033

Dive Right In Scuba  24222 W Lockport St  Plainfield,
Il 60544

sj@diversescueintl.com  800.248.3483 info@scubashackct.com   860.563.0119 ehayes@evolutionscuba.com  860.682.0052 tim@diverightinscuba.com  815.267.8400

included
>

 $                425.00  $               2,975.00 
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