TOWN OF TRUMBULL

REQUEST FOR QUALIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FEES FOR
ON CALL General Contractor SERVICES

FOR THE PERIOD July 1, 2023 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2026
RFP: # 6484

June 14, 2023 @ 2:00PM

Hourly Rate
Proposed (36 months) Option YR 1 Option YR 2

1 BISMARK CONSTRUCTION CO INC. 100 BRIDGEPORT AVE MILFORD, CT 06460
GMRAUCCI@bismarkcontracution.com 203.410.5401

General Foreman/Supervisor S 91.00 S /Hr. S 93.00 S /Hr. S 95.00 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 84.00 S /Hr. S 86.00 S /Hr. S 88.00 S /Hr.
Painter S 80.00 S /Hr. S 82.00 S /Hr. S 84.00 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 75.00 S /Hr. S 77.00 S /Hr. S 79.00 S /Hr.
Mason S 95.00 S /Hr. S 97.00 S /Hr. S 99.00 S /Hr.
Laborer S 68.00 S /Hr. S 70.00 S /Hr. S 74.00 S /Hr.
Roofer S 90.00 S /Hr. S 92.00 S /Hr. S 94.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Overtime Hourly Rate
General Foreman/Supervisor S 118.00 S /Hr. S 120.00 S /Hr. S 122.00 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 114.00 S /Hr. S 116.00 S /Hr. S 118.00 S /Hr.
Painter S 110.00 $ /Hr. S 112.00 $ /Hr. S 114.00 $ /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 95.00 S /Hr. S 96.00 S /Hr. S 98.00 S /Hr.
Mason S 135.00 S /Hr. S 137.00 S /Hr. S 140.00 S /Hr.
Laborer S 89.00 S /Hr. S 92.00 S /Hr. S 94.00 S /Hr.
Roofer S 135.00 S /Hr. S 137.00 S /Hr. S 140.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge $ 50.00 @$/hrortrip S 60.00 @$/hrortrip $ 60.00 @ $/hrortrip
Materials Markup 12% @% 14% @% 15% @%
2 GLOBAL HILL CONSTRUCTION 224 PORTORS HILL RD MONROE, CT 06468
MASHOOD40@HOTMAIL.COM 646.256.1510
Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months) Option YR 1 Option YR 2
General Foreman/Supervisor S 150.00 S /Hr. S 150.00 S /Hr. S 150.00 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 125.00 S /Hr. S 125.00 S /Hr. S 125.00 S /Hr.
Painter S 100.00 $ /Hr. S 100.00 $ /Hr. S 100.00 $ /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 100.00 S /Hr. S 100.00 S /Hr. S 100.00 S /Hr.
Mason S 100.00 $ /Hr. S 100.00 $ /Hr. S 100.00 $ /Hr.
Laborer S 50.00 S /Hr. S 50.00 S /Hr. S 50.00 S /Hr.
Roofer S 75.00 S /Hr. S 75.00 S /Hr. S 75.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) S 80.00 S /Hr. S 80.00 S /Hr. S 80.00 S /Hr.
Overtime Hourly Rate
General Foreman/Supervisor S 175.00 S /Hr. S 175.00 S /Hr. S 175.00 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 175.00 S /Hr. S 175.00 S /Hr. S 175.00 S /Hr.
Painter S 125.00 S /Hr. S 125.00 S /Hr. S 125.00 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 125.00 S /Hr. S 125.00 S /Hr. S 125.00 S /Hr.
Mason S 125.00 S /Hr. S 125.00 S /Hr. S 125.00 S /Hr.
Laborer S 70.00 S /Hr. S 70.00 S /Hr. S 70.00 S /Hr.
Roofer S 85.00 S /Hr. S 85.00 S /Hr. S 85.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) S 80.00 S /Hr. S 80.00 S /Hr. S 80.00 S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge 100 TRIP @ $ /hrortrip 100 TRIP @ $ /hrortrip 100 TRIP @ $ /hrortrip

Materials Markup (over $1K) 10% @% 10% @% 10% @%



3 HILLER PAINTING LLC. 21 ORIOLE DR NORWALK, CT 06851
THEHILLERS1@optonline.net 203.606.9868

Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months) Option YR 1 Option YR 2

General Foreman/Supervisor S 55.00 S /Hr. S 56.00 S /Hr. S 57.00 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 45.00 S /Hr. S 47.00 S /Hr. S 47.00 S /Hr.
Painter S 37.00 S /Hr. S 38.00 S /Hr. S 40.00 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 35.00 S /Hr. S 36.00 S /Hr. S 37.00 S /Hr.
Mason S 48.00 S /Hr. S 49.00 S /Hr. S 50.00 S /Hr.
Laborer S 30.00 S /Hr. S 31.00 S /Hr. S 32.00 S /Hr.
Roofer S 60.00 S /Hr. S 62.00 S /Hr. S 65.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr. S 83.00 S /Hr.

Overtime Hourly Rate

General Foreman/Supervisor S 82.00 S /Hr. S 82.00 S /Hr. S 83.00 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 67.00 S /Hr. S 68.00 S /Hr. S 69.00 S /Hr.
Painter S 64.00 S /Hr. S 65.00 S /Hr. S 68.00 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 48.00 S /Hr. S 49.00 S /Hr. S 50.00 S /Hr.
Mason S 74.00 S /Hr. S 75.00 S /Hr. S 77.00 S /Hr.
Laborer S 45.00 S /Hr. S 46.00 S /Hr. S 47.00 S /Hr.
Roofer S 85.00 S /Hr. S 86.00 S /Hr. S 88.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge $ 27.00 @S /hrortrip S 28.00 @ $/hrortrip $ 28.00 @ $/hrortrip
Materials Markup 20% @% 20% @% 20% @%
4 PREMIER BUILDING ASSOCIATES 31 ACORN RD BRANFORD, CT 06405
DAN@pbaroofing.com 203.836.1435
Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months) Option YR 1 Option YR 2
General Foreman/Supervisor S 75.00 S /Hr. S 75.00 S /Hr. S 79.00 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 65.00 S /Hr. S 65.00 S /Hr. S 70.00 S /Hr.
Painter S 60.00 S /Hr. S 60.00 S /Hr. S 65.00 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 55.00 S /Hr. S 55.00 S /Hr. S 59.00 S /Hr.
Mason S 62.00 S /Hr. S 62.00 S /Hr. S 66.00 S /Hr.
Laborer S 55.00 S /Hr. S 55.00 S /Hr. S 59.00 S /Hr.
Roofer S 85.00 S /Hr. S 85.00 S /Hr. S 87.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Overtime Hourly Rate
General Foreman/Supervisor S 85.00 S /Hr. S 85.00 S /Hr. S 87.00 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 75.00 S /Hr. S 75.00 S /Hr. S 79.00 S /Hr.
Painter S 70.00 S /Hr. S 70.00 S /Hr. S 74.00 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 65.00 S /Hr. S 65.00 S /Hr. S 69.00 S /Hr.
Mason S 72.00 S /Hr. S 72.00 S /Hr. S 76.00 S /Hr.
Laborer S 65.00 S /Hr. S 65.00 S /Hr. S 69.00 S /Hr.
Roofer S 127.50 S /Hr. S 127.50 S /Hr. S 129.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge $ 50.00 @$/hrortrip S 50.00 @$/hrortrip $ 55.00 @$/hrortrip

Materials Markup 10% @% 10% @% 12% @%



5 RAM BUILDING GROUP LLC 50 QUALITY ST, PO BOX 110681 TRUMBULL, CT 06611
RMARINI@rambuildinggroup.com 203.650.9396

Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months) Option YR 1

General Foreman/Supervisor S 53.90 S /Hr. S 58.90 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 43.90 S /Hr. S 47.90 S /Hr.
Painter S 36.40 S /Hr. S 40.90 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 34.90 S /Hr. S 38.90 S /Hr.
Mason S 48.90 S /Hr. S 52.90 S /Hr.
Laborer S 29.90 S /Hr. S 33.90 S /Hr.
Roofer S 4590 S /Hr. S 48.90 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.

Overtime Hourly Rate

General Foreman/Supervisor S 81.35 S /Hr. S 88.85 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 66.35 S /Hr. S 72.35 S /Hr.
Painter S 55.10 S /Hr. S 61.85 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 51.35 S /Hr. S 58.45 S /Hr.
Mason S 74.85 S /Hr. S 80.85 S /Hr.
Laborer S 44.85 S /Hr. S 49.85 S /Hr.
Roofer S 68.85 S /Hr. S 73.45 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge $25.00 trip @ $ /hrortrip $35.00 trip @ $ /hrortrip
Materials Markup 15% @% 15% @%
6 SILKTOWN ROOFING, INC 27 PLEASANT ST MANCHESTER, CT 06040
BILLCROCE@silktownroofing.com 203.410.6736
Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months) Option YR 1
General Foreman/Supervisor NOBID S /Hr. NOBID S /Hr.
Carpenter NOBID S /Hr. NOBID S /Hr.
Painter NOBID S /Hr. NOBID S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice NOBID S /Hr. NOBID S /Hr.
Mason NOBID S /Hr. NOBID S /Hr.
Laborer NOBID S /Hr. NOBID S /Hr.
Roofer S 102.50 S /Hr. S 104.50 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Overtime Hourly Rate
General Foreman/Supervisor NOBID S /Hr. NOBID S /Hr.
Carpenter NOBID S /Hr. NOBID S /Hr.
Painter NOBID S /Hr. NOBID S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice NOBID S /Hr. NOBID S /Hr.
Mason NOBID S /Hr. NOBID S /Hr.
Laborer NOBID S /Hr. NOBID S /Hr.
Roofer S 155.00 S /Hr. S 158.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge S].O TRIP @ $ /hrortrip Sll TRIP @ $ /hrortrip

Materials Markup 15% @% 15% @%
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7 T. ARDUINI COMPANY INC 312 RIVER STREET BRIDGEPORT, CT 06606
TARDUINI@tarduinicompany.com 203.395.4762

Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months) Option YR 1 Option YR 2

General Foreman/Supervisor S 113.70 S /Hr. S 103.15 S /Hr. S 108.30 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 122.50 S /Hr. S 111.10 S /Hr. S 116.70 S /Hr.
Painter n/a $/Hr. n/a S /Hr. n/a $/Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice n/a $/Hr. n/a S /Hr. n/a $/Hr.
Mason S 120.80 S /Hr. S 109.50 S /Hr. S 115.00 S /Hr.
Laborer S 107.80 S /Hr. S 97.80 S /Hr. S 102.70 S /Hr.
Roofer n/a $/Hr. S - S /Hr. n/a S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.

Overtime Hourly Rate

General Foreman/Supervisor S 136.10 S /Hr. S 123.50 S /Hr. S 129.60 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 140.75 S /Hr. S 127.70 S /Hr. S 134.10 S /Hr.
Painter n/a $/Hr. n/a S /Hr. n/a $/Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice n/a $/Hr. n/a S /Hr. n/a $/Hr.
Mason S 142.40 S /Hr. S 129.20 S /Hr. S 135.60 S /Hr.
Laborer S 127.70 S /Hr. S 115.80 S /Hr. S 121.60 S /Hr.
Roofer n/a $/Hr. n/a S /Hr. n/a $/Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge $36.25 p/hr @ $ /hrortrip $36.25 p/hr @ $ /hrortrip $36.25 p/hr @ $ /hrortrip
Materials Markup 15% @% 15% @% 15% @%
Kevin Bova

RFP: # 6484

June 14, 2023 @ 2:00PM



TOWN OF TRUMBULL

REQUEST FOR QUALIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FEES FOR
ON CALL General Contractor SERVICES

FOR THE PERIOD July 1, 2023 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2026

RFP: # 6484
June 14, 2023 @ 2:00PM

1 BISMARK CONSTRUCTION CO INC. 100 BRIDGEPORT AVE MILFORD, CT 06460
GMRAUCCI@bismarkcontracution.com 203.410.5401

Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months) Option YR 1

General Foreman/Supervisor S 91.00 S /Hr. S 93.00
Carpenter S 84.00 S /Hr. S 86.00
Painter S 80.00 S /Hr. S 82.00
Journeyman Apprentice S 75.00 S /Hr. S 77.00
Mason S 95.00 S /Hr. S 97.00
Laborer S 68.00 S /Hr. S 70.00
Roofer S 90.00 S /Hr. S 92.00
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A

Overtime Hourly Rate

General Foreman/Supervisor S 118.00 S /Hr. S 120.00
Carpenter S 114.00 S /Hr. S 116.00
Painter S 110.00 S /Hr. S 112.00
Journeyman Apprentice S 95.00 S /Hr. S 96.00
Mason S 135.00 S /Hr. S 137.00
Laborer S 89.00 S /Hr. S 92.00
Roofer S 135.00 S /Hr. S 137.00
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A
Vehicle Charge S 50.00 @$/hrortrip S 60.00
Materials Markup 12% @% 14%

2 GLOBAL HILL CONSTRUCTION 224 PORTORS HILL RD MONROE, CT 06468
MASHOOD40@HOTMAIL.COM 646.256.1510

Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months) Option YR 1

General Foreman/Supervisor S 150.00 S /Hr. S 150.00
Carpenter S 125.00 S /Hr. S 125.00
Painter S 100.00 S /Hr. S 100.00
Journeyman Apprentice S 100.00 S /Hr. S 100.00
Mason S 100.00 S /Hr. S 100.00
Laborer S 50.00 S /Hr. S 50.00
Roofer S 75.00 S /Hr. S 75.00
Other (list trade) S 80.00 S /Hr. S 80.00

Overtime Hourly Rate
General Foreman/Supervisor S 175.00 S /Hr. S 175.00
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Carpenter S 175.00 S /Hr.
Painter S 125.00 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 125.00 S /Hr.
Mason S 125.00 S /Hr.
Laborer S 70.00 S /Hr.
Roofer S 85.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) S 80.00 S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge 100 TRIP
Materials Markup (over $1K) 10% @%

@ S /hror trip
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3 SILKTOWN ROOFING, INC 27 PLEASANT ST MANCHESTER, CT 06040

BILLCROCE@filktownroofing.com 203.410.6736

Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months)

General Foreman/Supervisor NO BID
Carpenter NO BID
Painter NO BID
Journeyman Apprentice NO BID
Mason NO BID
Laborer NO BID
Roofer S 102.50
Other (list trade) N/A

Overtime Hourly Rate

General Foreman/Supervisor NOBID S /Hr.
Carpenter NOBID S /Hr.
Painter NOBID S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice NOBID S /Hr.
Mason NOBID S /Hr.
Laborer NOBID S /Hr.
Roofer S 155.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge S10 TRIP
Materials Markup 15% @%

4 PREMIER BUILDING ASSOCIATES 31 ACORN RD BRANFORD, CT 06405

DAN@pbaroofing.com 203.836.1435

Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months)

General Foreman/Supervisor S 75.00
Carpenter S 65.00
Painter S 60.00
Journeyman Apprentice S 55.00
Mason S 62.00
Laborer S 55.00
Roofer S 85.00

Other (list trade) N/A
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Overtime Hourly Rate

General Foreman/Supervisor S 85.00 S /Hr. S 85.00 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 75.00 S /Hr. S 75.00 S /Hr.
Painter S 70.00 S /Hr. S 70.00 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 65.00 S /Hr. S 65.00 S /Hr.
Mason S 72.00 S /Hr. S 72.00 S /Hr.
Laborer S 65.00 S /Hr. S 65.00 S /Hr.
Roofer S 127.50 S /Hr. S 127.50 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge S 50.00 @s$/hrortrip S 50.00 @S5S /hrortrip
Materials Markup 10% @% 10% @%
5 T. ARDUINI COMPANY INC 312 RIVER STREET BRIDGEPORT, CT 06606
TARDUINI@tarduinicompany.com 203.395.4762
Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months) Option YR 1
General Foreman/Supervisor S 113.70 S /Hr. S 103.15 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 122.50 S /Hr. S 111.10 S /Hr.
Painter n/a S /Hr. n/a S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice n/a S /Hr. n/a S /Hr.
Mason S 120.80 S /Hr. S 109.50 S /Hr.
Laborer S 107.80 S /Hr. S 97.80 S /Hr.
Roofer n/a $/Hr. S - S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Overtime Hourly Rate
General Foreman/Supervisor S 136.10 S /Hr. S 123.50 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 140.75 S /Hr. S 127.70 S /Hr.
Painter n/a $/Hr. n/a $/Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice n/a S /Hr. n/a S /Hr.
Mason S 142.40 S /Hr. S 129.20 S /Hr.
Laborer S 127.70 S /Hr. S 115.80 S /Hr.
Roofer n/a S /Hr. n/a S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge $36.25 p/hr  @s$/hrortrip  $36.25 p/hr @ $ /hror trip
Materials Markup 15% @% 15% @%

6 RAM BUILDING GROUP LLC 50 QUALITY ST, PO BOX 110681 TRUMBULL, CT 06611
RMARINI@rambuildinggroup.com 203.650.9396

Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months) Option YR 1

General Foreman/Supervisor S 53.90 S /Hr. S 58.90 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 43.90 S /Hr. S 47.90 S /Hr.
Painter S 36.40 S /Hr. S 40.90 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 3490 S /Hr. S 38.90 S /Hr.
Mason S 48.90 S /Hr. S 52.90 S /Hr.
Laborer S 29.90 S /Hr. S 33.90 S /Hr.
Roofer S 4590 S /Hr. S 48.90 S /Hr.



Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.

Overtime Hourly Rate

General Foreman/Supervisor S 81.35 S /Hr. S 88.85 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 66.35 S /Hr. S 72.35 S /Hr.
Painter S 55.10 S /Hr. S 61.85 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 51.35 S/Hr. S 58.45 S /Hr.
Mason S 74.85 S /Hr. S 80.85 S /Hr.
Laborer S 44.85 S [Hr. S 49.85 S /Hr.
Roofer S 68.85 S /Hr. S 73.45 S [Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge $25.00trip @ $ /hrortrip $35.00 trip @ /hrortrip
Materials Markup 15% @% 15% @%
7 HILLER PAINTING LLC. 21 ORIOLE DR NORWALK, CT 06851
THEHILLERS1@optonline.net 203.606.9868
Hourly Rate Proposed (36 months) Option YR 1
General Foreman/Supervisor S 55.00 S /Hr. S 56.00 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 45.00 S /Hr. S 47.00 S /Hr.
Painter S 37.00 S /Hr. S 38.00 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 35.00 S /Hr. S 36.00 S /Hr.
Mason S 48.00 S /Hr. S 49.00 S /Hr.
Laborer S 30.00 S /Hr. S 31.00 S /Hr.
Roofer S 60.00 S /Hr. S 62.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Overtime Hourly Rate
General Foreman/Supervisor S 82.00 S /Hr. S 82.00 S /Hr.
Carpenter S 67.00 S /Hr. S 68.00 S /Hr.
Painter S 64.00 S /Hr. S 65.00 S /Hr.
Journeyman Apprentice S 48.00 S /Hr. S 49.00 S /Hr.
Mason S 74.00 S /Hr. S 75.00 S /Hr.
Laborer S 45.00 S /Hr. S 46.00 S /Hr.
Roofer S 85.00 S /Hr. S 86.00 S /Hr.
Other (list trade) N/A S /Hr. N/A S /Hr.
Vehicle Charge S 27.00 @$/hrortrip S 28.00 @S /hrortrip
Materials Markup 20% @% 20% @%
Kevin Bova
RFP: # 6484

June 14, 2023 @ 2:00PM



Option YR 2
95.00 S /Hr.
88.00 S /Hr.
84.00 S /Hr.
79.00 S /Hr.
99.00 S /Hr.
74.00 S /Hr.
94.00 S /Hr.

N/A S /Hr.

wvrnnumv:kon;o e n

122.00 S /Hr.
118.00 S /Hr.
114.00 S /Hr.
98.00 S /Hr.
140.00 S /Hr.
94.00 S /Hr.
140.00 S /Hr.
N/A S /Hr.
S 60.00 @3 /hrortrip
15% @%

wvrnnuv:n;m e n

Option YR 2
150.00 S /Hr.
125.00 S /Hr.
100.00 S /Hr.
100.00 S /Hr.
100.00 S /Hr.
80.00 S /Hr.
75.00 S /Hr.
80.00 S /Hr.

w vvv v nn

S 175.00 S /Hr.



S 175.00 S /Hr.
S 125.00 S /Hr.
S 125.00 S /Hr.
S 125.00 S /Hr.
S 70.00 S /Hr.
S 85.00 S /Hr.
S 80.00 S /Hr.
100 TRIP @ $ /hrortrip
10% @%

Option YR 2
NOBID S /Hr.
NOBID S /Hr.
NOBID S /Hr.
NOBID S /Hr.
NOBID S /Hr.
NOBID S /Hr.
S 106.50 S /Hr.
N/A S /Hr.

NOBID S /Hr.

NOBID S /Hr.

NOBID S /Hr.

NOBID S /Hr.

NOBID S /Hr.

NOBID S /Hr.

S 160.00 S /Hr.

N/A S /Hr.

S12 TRIP @ $ /hrortrip

15% @%

Option YR 2
79.00 S /Hr.
70.00 S /Hr.
65.00 S /Hr.
59.00 S /Hr.
66.00 S /Hr.
59.00 S /Hr.
87.00 S /Hr.

N/A S /Hr.

wvrnnumv:n;m e n



S
S

87.00
79.00
74.00
69.00
76.00
69.00
129.00
N/A
55.00
12%

Option YR 2

108.30
116.70
n/a
n/a
115.00
102.70
n/a
N/A

129.60
134.10
n/a
n/a
135.60
121.60
n/a
N/A

$36.25 p/hr

wvrnnumv:n;m e n

15%

Option YR 2

59.90
51.00
44.90
41.90
55.90
36.90
52.90

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

@ S /hror trip
@%

S /Hr.
S /Hr.
S /Hr.
S /Hr.
S /Hr.
S /Hr.
S /Hr.
S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

S /Hr.

@ S /hror trip
@%

S /Hr.
S /Hr.
S /Hr.
S /Hr.
S /Hr.
S /Hr.
S /Hr.



N/A S /Hr.

91.55 S /Hr.
75.85 S /Hr.
64.35 S /Hr.
59.85 S /Hr.
84.85 S /Hr.
52.35 S/Hr.
78.45 S [Hr.

N/A S /Hr.

$35.00 trip @ $/hrortrip
15% @%

wvrnnumv:n;m e n

Option YR 2
57.00 S /Hr.
47.00 S /Hr.
40.00 S /Hr.
37.00 S /Hr.
50.00 S /Hr.
32.00 S /Hr.
65.00 S /Hr.
83.00 S /Hr.

w vV v nn

83.00 S /Hr.
69.00 S /Hr.
68.00 S /Hr.
50.00 S /Hr.
77.00 S /Hr.
47.00 S /Hr.
88.00 S /Hr.

N/A S /Hr.
S 28.00 @ $/hrortrip
20% @%

wvrnnumv:nm o n
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