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~ |Pack |Size Description  |Brand ~ |CASE PRICE o
05085 6|#10 CAN  |FRUIT APPLES SLICED SOLID AMBROSIA 63.75
01266 6/#10 CAN  |SAUCE CRANBERRY JELLIED SUNSOURCE MERIT |49.20
01368 200(1.160Z  |FRUIT CRAISINS WATERMELON OCEAN SPRAY 49.20
01370 1|101LB FRUIT SWEET DRY CRANBERRY OCEAN SPRAY 27.52
01373 250(1.3 02 FRUIT AMAZIN RAISIN STRAWBERRY AMAZING FRUIT  |49.20
01375 200(1.160Z |FRUIT CRAISINS STRAWBERRY OCEAN SPRAY 49.20
01376 200{1.160Z _|FRUIT CRAISINS DRIED CHERRY GF OCEANSPRAY  |43.20 7
01378 | 200/1.160Z |FRUIT CRAISINS ORANGE ~ |OCEANSPRAY  |a920 |
01381 | 200/1.160Z  |FRUIT CRAISINS RASPBERRY LEMONADE OCEAN SPRAY 49.20
01388 125/0.340Z  |FRUIT DRIED CRISPS APPLE US TREE TOP 41.22
01420 6|#10 CAN  |FRUIT MIX IMPORTED LS PACKER 56.50 1
01545 6/#10 CAN  |FRUIT PEACH DICED - LIGHT SYRUP HORN OF PLENTY  |48.04
01610 6|#10 CAN  |FRUIT PEACH GREEK SLICED LS NEMCO 51.47
01645 6/#10 CAN  |FRUIT PEAR DICED IMPORTED LS NEMCO 47.55
01740 6|#10 CAN  |FRUIT PINEAPPLE CHUNK JUICE NEMCO 40.74
01860 6/#10 CAN  [FRUIT PINEAPPLE TIDBT JCE NEMCO 35.58 .
01936 | 24/6CT FRUIT RAISINS SNACK PACK 13302 SUN-MAD 38.28
01944 | 1/301B |FRUIT RAISINS MIDGET ~ |PACKER  |s64l
100334 250(1.3 02 FRUIT AMAZIN' RAISIN WATERMELON  |AMAZING FRUIT 184,38
05090 6/#10 CAN  |FRUIT APPLESAUCE UNSWEETENED MUSSELMAN'S 39.32
04175 6/3.24LB  |POTATO REAL MASHED IDAHOAN 63.79
101011 6/#10 CAN  |VEG BEAN GREEN CUT SUNSOURCE MERIT |39.12
02766 6|#10 CAN  |VEG BEAN BLACK LOW SOD FURMANO'S 33.48
02880 6/#10 CAN  |VEG BEAN KIDNEY DARK RED SUNSOURCE MERIT |39.52 ]
02881 6/#10CAN  |VEG BEANSLS INSAUCE FURMANO'S 35.76
02885 |  6#10CAN VEGCHICKPEASLS | FURMANO'S (3331 |
03042 |  B|#10CAN |VEGBEANCUTWAX SUNSOURCE MERIT (39.37 |
101221 6#10 CAN |VEG BEAN WHITE GREAT NORTHERN  |SUNSOURCE MERIT 36,7 )
03300 6/#10 CAN  |VEG BEETS SLICED SALAD SUNSOURCE 42.62
03382 6|#10 CAN  |VEG CARROTS DICED SUNNY FARM 36.32
03570 6/#10 CAN  |VEG CORN WHOLE KERNEL SUNSOURCE MERIT |42.22
03605 6/#10 CAN  |VEG MIXED SUNSOURCE MERIT |45.06
03660 6|/#10CAN  |VEG MUSHROOM S & P - HOLLAND NEMCO 65.71 B
12|16 0z VEG MUSROOM S&P HOLLAND NEMCO |
03780 63LB VEG ONIONS CHOPPED DEHYDRATED | OLAM 11458
03920 | el #10 CAN  |VEG PEAS FANCY 4 SIEVE | SUNSOURCE MERIT |41.89 -
04500 | 6|#10 CAN  |VEG SAUERKRAUT ~ |SUNSOURCE MERIT 3801 |
05254 6/#10 CAN  |SALSA ENHANCED NUTRITION ~ |RED GOLD 147.03
05080 6/#10 CAN | KETCHUP 29% LO SODIUM BELLS VISTA 39.54
05290 6/#10 CAN | TOMATO CRUSHED BASIL BELLS VISTA 31.48
05400 6/#10 CAN  |TOMATO PASTE HUNTS 60.76
06305 12|46 0z JUICE APPLE VITAMIN C PET RUBY KIST 46.21
101403 12|46 07 JUICE GRAPE VITAMIN C PET RUBY KIST 27.89 8/482
06160 4/1GAL JUICE LEMON 413913 REALEMON 44.10 }
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06220 12]460zZ JUICE ORANGE UNSWEET PET RUBY KIST 34.84
101465 - 24|7602 JUICE SWITCH KIWI/BERRY SWITCH l17.16 plus deposit]
101463  24|7.60Z JUICE SWITCH BLACK CHERRY SWITCH 17.16 plus deposit
101467 24|7.6 0z JUICE SWITCH WATERMELON/STRAWBERR SWITCH 17.16 plus deposit
101466 2417.607 JUICE SWITCH ORANGE TANGERINE SWITCH 17.16 plus deposit
Pack |Size Description Brand CASE PRICE ;
06881 40(4.230Z  |JUICE APPLE 100% TOTALLY JUICE 8.18
06883 40(4.230Z | JUICE PUNCH 100% FRUIT TOTALLY JUICE 8.18
06885 | 40[4.230Z |JUICE OORANGE TANGERINE 100% JUICE | TOTALLY JUICE 8.18
06887 140/4.230Z  |JUICE STRAWBERRY KIWI 100% | TOTALLYJUICE |88 |
06792 44/4.230Z  |JUICE GRAPE | ARDMORE 11.01
06793 4442307  |JUICE FRUIT PUNCH ARDMORE 11.30
101148 24|8 07 APPLE JUICE-MIDDLE/HIGH ONLY MOTTS 15.61
101151 24|80z FRUIT PUNCH-MIDDLE/HIGH ONLY MOTTS 15.61
101377 48/7.602Z DRINK SMOOTHIE STRAWBERRY BANNANA BARFRESH 48.63
101378 48(7.6 0z DRINK SMOOTHIE MANGO PINEAPPLE | BARFRESH 48.63 i
08221 | 12 5007 SOUP MINESTRONE |  lcam PBELL'S 6539
06523 | 12500z  |SOUPTOMATO  lcamBEl's  laosa
08320 12|50 0Z SOUP VEGETABLE ~ |CAMBELL'S  |61.13
08984 6/1LB BASE CHICKEN LS MAIOR 35.72
09240 6|1 LB BASE VEGETABLE NO MSG MINOR'S 43.59
07855 4(21LB ADULT-CHICKEN NOODLE KETTLE 46.06
07885 4218 ADULT-CHICKEN TORTILLA KETTLE 53.26
08130 4|21B ADULT - ITALIAN WEDDING KETTLE 46.69
07976 4218 ADULT-LOAD POTATO KETTLE 56.28
07890 4218 ADULT-NE CLAM CHOWDER KETTLE 62.03
07865 Cal21 ADULT - LOBSTER BISQUE - KETTLE 5944 |
07867 | 42LB | ADULT-TOMATOBASL  |kemie  la9.31
100895 4218 ADULT - PASTA FAGIOLI KETTLE 45.86
100896 4|21B ADULT - BROCCOLI CHEDDAR KETTLE 51.96
09709 CEREAL CINN TST CRNCH WG CIN TOAST CRNCH 3211
09706 CEREAL GOLDEN GRAHAM WG GOLDEN GRAHAMS |32.11
09713 CEREAL TRIX RS WG TRIX 32.11
09716 CEREAL CHEERIOS BOWL WG CHEERIOS 32.11
09809 GRANOLA - BULK MALT O MEAL 42.47
09720 ~ |CEREAL CRISPY RICE GF - MALTO MEAL |26, 54
09809 |CEREAL CINNAMON GRANOLA LF WG |MALTOMEAL  |4247 |
09605 CEREAL CORN FLAKES MALT O MEAL 26.54
09827 4|340z7 CEREAL TOASTY O'S WG MALT O MEAL 33.68
10109 96/1.550Z  [SNACK BAR NUTRIGRAIN BLUEBERRY WG |KELLOGG'S 37.73
10110 96/1.550Z  |SNACK BAR NUTRIGRAIN STRAWBERRY WC KELLOGG'S 37.73
10116 96/1.4 0Z SNACK BAR CEREAL TRIX WG TRIX 34.94
10121 96/1.550Z  |SNACK BAR NUTRIGRAIN APPLE IWWG  |KELLOGG'S 37.73
10132 96|1.4 02 SNACK BAR COCOA PUFFS WG COCOA PUFFS 34.94
10134 96(1.40Z  |SNACK BAR CINN TOAST WG [CIN TOAST CRNCH |34.94
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10135 96|14207  [SNACK BAR GOLDEN GRHM WG _ GOLDEN GRAHAMS |34.94
10385 24/1.510Z  |OATMEAL CUP APPLEBAKED  |QUAKER 30.16
10460 12|42 07 CEREAL QUICK OATS RALSTON 69.42 -
11776 104(.6250Z  |SMART FOOD POPCORN SMARTFOOD 46.61
11777 64102 SMART FOOD POPCORN SMARTFOOD 41.46
1/600CT |SNACK RICE KRISPIE TREAT MINI IW WG | RICE KRISPIE TR n/a
10141 | 80[1410Z  [SNACK BAR RICE KRISPY WG KELLOGG'S 39.36
10152 | 60[1.03 OZ  |SNACK SIMPLY CHEX S STRAWBERRY YOGURSIMPLY CHEX (2573 |
10153 | 60.920Z  |SNACK SIMPLY CHEX CHEDDAR WG SIMPLY CHEX  |25.73 :
10274 120(1.7 02 POPTART STRAWBERRY FROSTED WG POP-TARTS 48.05
11121 100{1.250Z  |SNACK GRAHAM HONEY ORGANICWG  |ANNIE'S 35,88 )
Pack |Size Description Brand CASE PRICE ]
11240 200/2 CT CRACKER HONEY GRAHAMS WG .5007 | HONEY MAID 22.88 ‘
11244 150|107 CRACKER ANIMAL WG KEEBLER 38.05
11317 175].75 0Z CRACKER CHEEZ IT WG CHEES-IT 42.05
11370 150.5 07 CRACKER OYSTER NATURAL NE WESTSOY 20.11
11596 150(3 CT CRACKER GRAHAM HONEY WG MIM 2454 |
11606 | 1/100CT  |CRACKER SAVORY 2 GRAIN 45GR WG MM 3778
1700 | 72].70 0z CHIP CHEETOS PUFFS RF WG - RRITos 2046
11723 72/102 CHIP DORITO COOL RANCH RF WG DORITOS 29.46
11728 60|.8750Z  |CHIP BAKED SOUR CREAM & ONION RF | LAY'S 23.13 |
11769 60|.8750Z  |CHIP LAYS BAKED BBQ RF LAY'S 23.13 i
11770 60(.8750Z  |CHIP BAKED LAYS RF LAY'S 23.13
11792 72/102 CHIP DORITO NACHO CHEESE RF WG DORITOS 29.46
11803 72/102 CHIP DORITO SPICY CHILI RF WG DORITOS 29.46 i
11852 1/350CT  |COOKIE FORTUNE W/ GOLDEN BOWL  |27.14 ‘
11892 300/.750Z  |SNACK GOLDFISH CHEDDAR WG PEPPERIDGE FARM |67.61 |
11998 | 1002 0Z  |COOKIE SUNRISE BITE MAPLEWG MM lsz76 |
20426 72|.8750Z  |CHIP TOSTITO BAKED SCOOPS RFWG  |FRITOS 28.32 )
99734 104].7 0Z PRETZELS HEARTZELS WG ROLD GOLD 38.79 -
100334 500(.2 0z CRACKER SALTINES ORIGINAL 2PK KEEBLER 84.38
11980 SPLITIBAKING POWD DBL ACT RED STAR 12.64 75.86/cs
12020 BAKING SODA PACKER 25.10
12040 COCONUT MEDIUM SHRED SPARROW 24.03
12060 CORN STARCH GF ' ARGO 34.53
12078 | | VEAST INSTANT DRY - |SAF- INSTANT 10000 |
12216 | _ |CORN MEALREGULAR#250  |BUNGE  |2ass |
12218 CEREAL ROLLED OATS PACKER 37.76 -
12345 SUGAR LITE BROWN DOMINO 29.48
12440 1|50 LB SUGAR GRANULATED (EFG) DOMINO 41.49
101454 6/6 LB MIX BROWNIE JIFFY 61.03
101452 6(5LB MIX CAKE YELLOW JIFFY 46.74
13640 6|1 GAL OIL SOYBEAN PURE VEGETABLE LA SPAGNOLA 57.64
13705 6|14 0Z SHRTNING SPRAY VEGALENE PREMIUM  |VEGALENE  |20.81
13745 12131B |SHRTNINGCRISCO |CRISCO 10805
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14175 2[10 1B PASTA ROTINI BARILLA 33.92
14180  1/101B PASTANOODLES MEDIUM  |ZIABRIOSA 23.17
14195 2|10 LB PASTA ELBOWS BARILLA | 33.92
14226 1/10LB PASTA ORZO ZIA BRIOSA 1253
14300 6|24 07 PASTA CHOW MEIN NOODLES LA CHOY 40.08
14315 2|10 LB PASTA PENNE RIGATI BARILLA 2791 n
14540 2|10LB PASTA CUT ZITI apb 25.77
14360 2|10LB PASTA SHELLS MEDIUM ~ |zIABRIOSA 125.77
14480 | 1/101B PASTA ROTINI RAINBOW  (z1A BRIOSA 1640 |
14692 12518 [RIcE PARBOILED - HIGHLAND MARKET |18.26 |
100671 11251 [RICE BROWN ORIGINAL PARBOILED WG BEN'SORIGINAL (3057 |
6/#10CAN |VEG BEANS BLACK TACO FIESTA BUSH'SBEST  |n/a .

02712 i ranchero beans BUSH'S BEST 46.14
15401 12|24 0z GELATIN RED RASPBERRY 31.22
15415 12(24 07 GELATIN MIX ASSORTED REDS HIGHLAND MARKET |47.35

Pack |Size Description ~ |Brand . CASE PRICE . ;
e e e e ——————— i P T
17585 4/1GAL  |DRSG BALSAMIC VINGRET " KEN'SFOODS  |60.25
17588 4|1 GAL DRSG ITALIAN LITE KEN'S FOODS 37.75
17590 4|1 GAL SAUCE BBQ - BARBECUE KEN'S FOODS 37.00
18055 41 GAL MAYO REDUCED CALORIE DRSG KEN'S FOODS 47.14
18160 4]1 GAL MUSTARD DELI ADMIRATION 19.45
18520 4|1 GAL VINEGAR CIDER ADMIRATION 11.38
18540 411 GAL VINEGAR WHITE ADMIRATION 9.44
18580 4/1GAL VINEGAR RED ADMIRATION 37.62 N
18720 | & #10CAN  |OLIVES PITTED MEDIUM IMP INEMcO 4748 |
R e Fe e AL B T L R -
20140 1 6/66.50Z | FISH TUNA CHUNK LITE ' NEMCO 57.55 a
20640 1|54 TACO SEASONING FOOTHILL FARMS  [21.24
20343 6/10# CAN  |REFRIED BEANS AMBROSIA 55.84

1 [

20805 1/1000CT  |KETCHUP PC 7GR HEINZ 21.73
21201 500/5.5 GR MUSTARD PACKET PPI 13.11
21285 1/2000CT  |SUGAR PACKET - .107 DOMINO 17.87
21315 1/2000CT  |SUGAR SWEET'N LOW PACKETS S\TVEET'N Low 2185
21340 | 1[3000cCT SPICE PEPPER PACKETS - .1 GR  |DIXE o |1Ba7 '
21360 | 1/3000CT  |SEASONING SALT PACKETS IODIZED - .6 GR DIXKE  leso0 |
21381 200|9 GR RELISH SWEET PC HEINZ 112.78
101560 100(1 07 SAUCE BBQ CUPS - LOW SODIUM FLAVOR FRESH B4  |16.67
21505 2007 GR SAUCE HOT TEXAS PETE PACKET TEXAS PETE'S 15.49
100752 500|9 GR MAYO POUCH 39.44
21802 32|14 02 COFF BREAKFAST BLEND NE COFFEE 17973
21810 32[14 07 COFF BREAKFAST BLEND DECAFE NE COFFEE 190.34
22904 1|10 LB TOPP SPRINKLES-LIGHT GREEN PACKER 23.97
22910 1/10LB TOPP SPRINKLES-RED PACKER 23.97
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22916 1]101B TOPP SPRINKLES-YELLOW PACKER 23.97
22930 |  1/101B TOPP SPRINKLES-RAINBOW  |PACKER 23.97 o
22950 1|10 LB TOPP SPRINKLES-CHOCOLATE PACKER 2523
23738 150/1.2 0Z SEEDS SUNFLOWER LS GF HNYROA SUNRICH NATURAL |42.09
23863 2|58 PEANUT SUNBUTTER NUT FREE SUNBUTTER 38.90
24146 6/#10 CAN  |IELLY GRAPE ALL FRUIT POLANER 58.31
24397 6/5LB 'HONEY WILDFLOWER SWEET HARVEST ~ [159.11 |
24420 11GAL MOLASSES *SPLIT* HORN OF PLENTY  (68.48 ]
24510 | 41 GAL PANCAKESYRUP I\ RicE |33.01
24860 425 LB |CROUTONS CHEESE & GARLICWG FRESH GOURMET ~ (31.35 |
25267  8/140Z  |GRAVY BROWN MIX LS ~|CHEFs s COMPANION |40.24
21591 - 2lsa0z SAUCE TERIYAKI PREMIUM CHEF MYRON'S 42.28
25613 | 4l5GA SAUCE ORANGE ZESTY |MINOR'S 55.63
25850 4|1 GAL SAUCE RED DEVIL PEPPER TRAPPEY 31.53 N
25930 1 1GAL SAUCE SWEET & SOUR LA CHOY 23.92
s A R | = E
17830 6/8.9 02 SPICE SEASON FAJITA NO MSG FOOTHILLFARMS ~ 20.96
101027 | 11602 SPICE CHILI POWDERDARK  HIGHLAND MKT E 1267 7
100652 | 11802 SPICECINNAMON GROUND spice mill 1200 |
101111 | 11207 SPICE OREGANO GROUND HIGHLAND MKTP  14.22
100567 | 1 6oz SPICE BASIL LEAVES ~ spice mill 7.15
100143 1]20 02 SPICE GARLIC POWDER spice mill 12.50

Pack |Size Description Brand l@s_l_i : PRICE R
27317 1160z SPICE CAYENNE PEPPER HIGHLAND MKTE 4.0
101122 1/5LB SPICE PEPPER BLACK GROUND HIGHLAND MKTE  82.51
28360 112 02 SPICE PEPPER CRUSHED RED _ HIGHLAND MKTE 933 | |
100573 1/16 0z SPICEPAPRIKASPANISH ~ spice mill 842 |
27682 | 6/320Z  |SPICEGARLICCHOPPED INOIL COSMO 20.48
28880 1(25 1B SEASONING SALT PLAIN 25LB BAG |PACKER o
20463 6/5LB SAUCE QUESO BLANCO ™ 94.16
20468 6/5LB SAUCE CHEESE RF ™ 80.56 T
20469 6/5LB SAUCE ALFREDO RF ™ 83.11
29530 4|58 CHSE PIZZA BLEND SHREDDED GREAT LAKES 59.61 |
29814 20010z CHSE CHEDDAR CUBES RF LAND O LAKES 78.24
29825 4/51B CHSE AMERICAN YELLOW 160 SLRFRS | BONGARDS |57.46
29855 168|1 oz CHSE STRING STICKS  [BoNGARDS 4034 '
100757 100{10Z  |CHSECREAM PCCUPS g&c 3117 |
98616 ALIT CHSE MOZZ LOW MOISTURE PARTSKIM SH/LAND O LAKES 63.22
99952 4(518B CHSE CHEDDAR YELLOW SHREDDED MILD |LAND O LAKES 64.10
29900 1/171B BUTTER CONTINENTAL CHIPS - 59 CT GRASSLAND DAIRY |76.21
30124 30|1LB BUTTER BLEND 4% ZTF ADMIRATION 37.59
30416 24(80Z SOY MILK - PLAIN KIKKOMAN 22.03 N
29024 2|58 HUMMUS CLASSIC ALLNATURAL |CEDAR'S MED 30,32
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30365 1/400CT  [CREAMER 3/8 HALF & HALF 10ML HOOD 13.56
30440 12|16 07 TOPP ONTOP NON-DAIRY DESSRT lonTop 50.05
30476 12132 07 MILK LACTAID LACTAID 25.13
30500 48407 VANILLA YOGURT UPSTATE FARMS  116.34
30520 48(4 07 STRAWBERRY YOGURT UPSTATE FARMS  |16.34
30521 484 0z RASPBERRY YOGURT UPSTATE FARMS  |16.34
30523 48]4 0z PEACH YOGURT UPSTATE FARMS _ |16.34
30524 48|40z STRAWBERRY/BANANA YOGURT UPSTATE FARMS 116,34
30585 451B YOGURT VANILLA NF UPSTATE FARMS  |26.34
31130 1|201B VEG BEANS GREEN CUT US/CAN CHILL RIPE 24.77
31321 1{20LB VEG BLEND ORIENTAL REGAL CROWN 31.03
31505 1/20(B VEG CARROT DICED US/CAN CHILL RIPE 33.03
31555 1|2018 VEG CARROT CC SLIC US/CAN CHILL RIPE 21.67
31565 6/2.5 B VEG EDAMAME SHELL SOYBEAN SIMPLE GOODNSS _ |46.10
31665 1]201B VEG CUT CORN US/CAN CHILL RIPE 28.79
31685 11208 VEG MIX 4 WAY US/CAN CHILL RIPE 29.73
31690 1/20(B VEG BLEND CALIFORNIA US/CAN/MX CHILL RIPE 33.39
31735 1|2018 VEG PEAS SWEET US/CAN CHILL RIPE 33.46
31819 12|12 LB VEG BROCCOLI FLORETS FROZEN HARVEST  |44.75
31860 12|14 1B VEG SQUASH BUTTERNUT FROZEN HARVEST  |44.23
42324 1120 LB VEG SPINACH CHOPPED IQF US CHILL RIPE 35.90
32098 6|2.518 POTATO SWEET GEMS SIMPLOT SWEETS  |44.28
32121 6/5LB FRIES FLAVORLAST SHOESTRING OUR CHEF CHOICE |52.58
32167/10 65 LB FRIES WEDGE SEASONED MCCAIN 5IG 57.79
32715 6|58 FRIES 8 CUT WEDGE SKIN ON MCCAIN SIG 55.41
32230 6]2.518 FRIES SWEET POTATO DEEP GROOVE HARVEST FRESH  |37.35
32380 6/5.0LB FRIES TATER PUFFS MCCAIN 5228
Pack B ._S_i_z_g - Description B_ﬁigg CASE PRICE .
32506 70(4 0Z JUICE APPLE 100% PURE FROM CONCENTR|ARDMORE FARMS  113.83
32513 70]4 0Z JUICE CHERRY STARFRUIT VEGGIE/FRUIT | ARDMORE FARMS _ |16.16
32606 70(4 0z JUICE GRAPE ECO ARDMORE FARMS | 16.80
32702 7014 07 JUICE MANGO VEGGIE/FRUIT BLEND ECO |ARDMORE FARMS _|16.40
32703 70402 JUICE DRAGONFRUIT VEGGIE/FRUIT BLEND ARDMORE FARMS | 15.84
32706 70/4 0Z JUICE ORANGE ECO 100% FROM CONCENT| ARDMORE FARMS |16.88
32736 70(4 0Z JUICE FRUIT PUNCH BLEND ECO ARDMORE FARMS  |13.86
35480 89(3.6 0z FISH POLLOCK & CHEESE RECTANGLES WG | HIGH LINER 77.80
35633 14411 02 EGGS PATTY ROUND €N FC 3.5" PAPETTIS 26.83
35670 1512 LB EGGS EASY LIQUID WHOLE W/CITRIC ACID PAPETTI'S 58,92
35558 450(1.13 02 CHICKEN TENDER CRISPY WG TYSON 84.02
35560 14813 0Z CHICKEN PATTY CRISPY WG TYSON 54.43
35563 1750 CT CHICKEN CHUNK CRISPY WG TYSON 93,28
35570 14835 0Z CHICKEN PATTY HOT & SPICY WG TYSON 92.04
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36145 53[30z CHICKEN BREAST FILLET GRILLED FC TYSON RED LABEL  |71.43

36181 2[5 1B CHICKEN STRIP BREAST GRILLED FC |TYSON RED LABEL 42,07 B

39500 124/3.8 07 CHICKEN POPCORN CN FC WG TYSON 10157

36293 11018 CHICKEN DICED WHITE 1/2 tyson 54.35 |

37316 12|118 PASTA TORTLINI CHEESE PEDE BROS. 28.55

100735 221(2.107 PASTA RAVIOLI CHEESE MINI WG TASTY BRANDS 97.61

98757 110/4.3 07 PASTA LASAGNA ROLL-UP WG TASTY BRANDS 97.93

37560 1018 |EGGPLANT ROUND BREADED PEELED CUTLETS [DOMINEX 3336

37605 | 3201507 |BEEFMEATBALLS ’ |ADVANCE  |50.06

37624 6|5LB BEEF CRUMBLES CN FC30Z MAID-RITE 140.56

41688 18(17 0z PIZZA CRUST 16" WG PARBAKED RICH'S 42.86 ]

20400 24/12¢CT TORTILLA FLOUR 6" PRESSED MISSION 42.05

37700 12|12¢CT TORT 10"WHT/WHEAT BLEND WG FATHER SAM'S 30.77

41214 50(4.6 07 TACO STICK BEEF & CHEESE IW WG INTEGRATED FOOD |68.08

38177 100/25 02 PORK RIB SUPER BONELESS FC CN ADVANCE 67.93

39019 | 8 38 MOZZ STIX BREAD LOW SODIUM WG FARMRICH (3421

39096 4251 |ONION RING MOORES ~ IMOORE'S  |3s21 -

40824 36/2.70Z CINNAMON ROLL HADLEY 18.08

41145 48(3.402 RASPBERRY CREAM CHEESE BAR HADLEY 30.21

40957 72(202 BAGEL CINNAMON RAISIN SLICED IW WG AESOPS BAGELS 37.90

40953 721202 BAGEL WHITE WHEAT SLICED WG 2 07 LENDERS BAGEL 2667

40944 96/2 0z MUFFIN CORN IW WG SMART CHOICE 31.69

41439 108140z FRENCH TOAST STICK WG |BAKECRAFTERS |26

43648 144]1307 | PANCAKE BUTTERMILKWG BAKE CRAFTERS  |25.45

43637 ~ 8880(3 07 $/0 FRENCH TOAST stick IW WG BAKE CRAFTERS 22.86

41034 12|12 ¢T MUFFIN ENGLISH SLICED WG - 144 CT SMART CHOICE 27.69

40946 962 07 MUFF APPLE CINNAMON IW WG SMART CHOICE 31.69 ]

40951 96(2 07 MUFFIN BLUEBERRY IW WG SMART CHOICE 31.639

40954 96/2 07 MUFFIN CHOCOLATE CHIP IW WG SMART CHOICE 31.69

5l Pack |Size Description Brand CASE PRICE )

100796 75(3.40Z LEMON BREAD SUPER BAKERY 5349 |

100795 75/3.402 PUMPKIN BREAD | SUPER BAKERY 49.13 -

40658 | 4830z ROLL SANDWICH GF IW CRCHS s

10678 6{16CT  |ROLLHAMBRGR SLICED WG 3" |HOMESTEAD 18.26 -

40679 6|16 CT ROLL HOTDOG SLICED WG 5.5 HOMESTEAD 18.06 i

40682 10(24's BREAD SLICED WHEAT PULL WG HOMESTEAD 23.35

40696 96 CT ROLL GRINDER WHEAT 6" WG HOMESTEAD 28.13

40697 8l12cT ROLL CROWN SLICED WG 3.5" HOMESTEAD 2437

41622 195(2.2 02 FLATBREAD 6X6 OVENFIRE WG RICH'S 52.12

100792 75/3.402 BANANA BREAD SUPER BAKERY 48.04

100794 75/3.402 | BLUEBERRY BREAD SUPER BAKERY  |48.04
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41383 210[1.4 07 COOKIE SUGAR - SMART CHOICE IW SMART CHOICE 45.29
41392 210/1.4 07 COOKIE CHOCOLATE CHIP SMART CHOICE W | SMART CHOICE 45.29
41767 360|107 COOKIE DOUGH SUGAR WG DAVID'S COOKIES  |55.18
41772 240(15 07 COOKIE DOUGH CHOCOLATE CHIP RF - 51% WG OTIS SPUNKMEYER  |60.11
41773 384107 COOKIE DOUGH CHOCOLATE CHIP RF - 51% WG DELICIOUS ESSNL 165,78
41781 384|107 COOKIE DOUGH CARNIVAL RF - 51% WG OTIS SPUNKMEYER 16578
41847 180|130z COOKIE DOUGH M&M RF WG REDI-BAKE 51.96
41836 18013302 | COOKIE DOUGH GOLDEN SUGAR RF WG REDI-BAKE 38.27
41917 722202 | APPLE FRUDEL |PILLSBURY 39.45 |
41977 | 192/11.9307  |PizzA MAX STICK 50/50CH WG |THEMAX 6407
41958 80(5.490Z  |PIZZA CHEESE 5" RD WG IW WILD MIKE'S 88.91
42027 96/4.8 07 CHEESE QUESADILLA WG THE MAX 69.22
42286 60/4.9402  |PIZZA FRENCH BREAD 6" WG TONY'S 63.50
41111 48/5.2 07 SANDWICH SUNWISE GRAPE BULK IW WG | SUNWISE 61.33
42228 100(2.2 07 PRETZEL SOFT WG SUPERPRETZEL 27.86
39365 | 48350z  |BU RGERS VEGGIE GARDEN PATTY MORNINGSTAR FRM |58.35 o
42388 | 503202 BURGERS BEEF PATTY FROZEN (NORTHFARMS  |a4g7 |
4764 | 2|51B FRANKS LOW SODIUM BEEF 8-1 ARMOUR 137.76
43622 128(1.440Z  |SAUSG TURKEY PATTY CN JIMMY DEAN 29.65
43673 1|214 CT SAUSG TURKEY LINK FC GF .750Z JONES DAIRY 50.80
43957 2|150 T BACON HARDWOOD SMOKED FULLY COOKED | FARMLAND 44.30
46887 1000|CASE FOIL BAGS 63.24
47004 850|CASE PLASTIC BAGS WITH HANDLES a 2632
46135 500/CASE  |BROWN BAGS #6 o 1590
52741 | |THS-SHURGUARD QUAT SANITIZER juse2 |
52562 1/5gal |THS - ULTRA TEMP RINSE 7141
51930 THS - MINI MAX DETERGENT 48.86
53260 THS - DELIMER 89.37
51758 4|1gal THS - SPECIAL GREEN 34.06
52966 1|5 gal dawn pot and pan 97.08
51932
24(4.6 02 PIZZA CHEESE 6" GF kevins 49.31
40647 24/1¢s BREAD SLICE IW GF 6112 |
14166 8(120Z |PASTA PENNE GF BARILLA 252 |
99873 | 24/350Z  |BAGEL PLAIN GLUT FREE IW luprs g0 |




TOWN OF TRUMBULL
BOARD OF EDUCATION
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

BID 6473 FOOD/GROCERY BID 2023-2024

11-May-23

BID RESULTS

GORDON FOOD SERVICE



RFQ-BID-6473 proposal page

GROCERY BID
2023-2024

please include in bid package submission

GORDON FOOD SERVICE

Pack iSize Description Brand CASE PRICE GES tem Code
6{#10 CAN FRUIT APPLES SLICED SOLID AMBROSIA $66.42 117773
G[#10 CAN SAUCE CRANBERRY JELLIED SUNSOURCE MERIT 550.39 164740

200i1.16 OZ FRUIT CRAISINS WATERMELON OCEAN SPRAY $48.48 121732
11018 FRUIT SWEET DRY CRANBERRY OCEAN SPRAY $26.79 350882
25011302 FRUIT AMAZIN RAISIN STRAWBERRY AMAZING FRUIT $48.48 531681
200116 0Z FRUIT CRAISINS STRAWBERRY OCEAN SPRAY $48.48 531681
200]1.16 OZ FRUIT CRAISINS DRIED CHERRY GF OCEAN SPRAY $48.48 636402
200|1.16 02 FRUIT CRAISINS ORANGE OCEAN SPRAY 548.48 614902
200{1.16 02 FRUIT CRAISINS RASPBERRY LEMONADE OCEAN SPRAY $48.48 204520
125/6.34 0Oz FRUIT DRIED CRISPS APPLE US TREETOP no hid
6{#10 CAN FRUIT MIX IMPORTED LS PACKER $61.26 182330
6|#10 CAN FRUIT PEACH DICED - LIGHT SYRUP HORN OF PLENTY $60.21 248502
61#10 CAN FRUIT PEACH GREEK SLICED LS NEMCO $63.05 433201
6.#10 CAN FRUIT PEAR DICED IMPQRTED LS NEMCO $45.76 311146
6|#10 CAN FRUIT PINEAPPLE CHUNK JUICE NEMCO $55.39 683291
6i#10 CAN FRUIT PINEAPPLE TIDBT JCE NEMCO $51.09 189979
24/6CT FRUIT RAISINS SNACK PACK 1.3307 SUN-MAID $37.13 340701
1;30LR FRUIT RAISINS MIDGET PACKER $50.10 492242
250(1.3 0Z FRUIT AMAZIN' RAISIN WATERMELON AMAZING FRUIT $76.75 512132
6#10 CAN FRUIT APPLESAUCE UNSWEETENED MUSSELMAN'S $57.2% 271497
6{3.241B POTATO REAL MASHED IDAHOAN $78.16 166872
6[#10 CAN VEG BEAN GREEN CUT SUNSOURCE MERIT $50.55 118737
6{#10 CAN VEG BEAN BLACK LOW SOD FURMANQ'S $31.28 231981
6[#10 CAN VEG BEAN KIDNEY DARK RED SUNSOURCE MERIT $46.77 118761
6{#10 CAN VEG BEANS LS IN SAUCE FURMANOQ'S $43.34 298913
6[#10 CAN VEG CHICKPEAS LS FURMANQ'S $31.28 508731
6|#10 CAN VEG BEAN CUT WAX SUNSOURCE MERIT $43.05 329169
6[#10 CAN VEG BEAN WHITE GREAT NORTHERN SUNSOURCE MERIT $41.16 113753
6{#10 CAN VEG BEETS SLICED SALAD SUNSOURCE 540.34 118885
6[#10 CAN VEG CARROTS DICED SUNNY FARM $38.22 312926
6|#10 CAN VEG CORN WHOLE KERNEL SUNSOURCE MERIT 547.91 118966
G[#10 CAN VEG MIXED SUNSOURCE MERIT $49.13 380300
6;#10 CAN VEG MUSHROOM S & P - HOLLAND NEMCO 568,91 182530
12|16 OZ VEG MUSROOM S&P HOLLAND NEMCO no bid
6i3 LB VEG ONIONS CHOPPED DEHYDRATED CLAM 579.75 259173
6|#10 CAN VEG PEAS FANCY 4 SIEVE SUNSOURCE MERIT no bid
5{#10 CAN VEG SAUERKRAUT SUNSOURCE MERIT 530.79 179951
G|#10 CAN SALSA ENHANCED NUTRITION RED GOLD $54.63 863564
6{#10 CAN KETCHUP 29% LO SODIUM BELLS VISTA $30.82 100188
G[#10 CAN TOMATO CRUSHED BASIL BELLS ViSTA 539,71 275492
6;#10 CAN TOMATO PASTE HUNTS 548.32 358929
12146 0Z JUICE APPLE VITAMIN C PET RUBY KIST $32.95 584339
12146 OZ JUICE GRAPE VITAMIN C PET RUBY KIST $37.70 100471
4,1 GAL JUICE LEMON 413913 REALEMON $30.11 864063,
1246 0z JUICE ORANGE UNSWEET PET RUBY KIST $41.88 584312
2418 OZ JUICE SWITCH KiWI/BERRY SWITCH $16.75 417950
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24i18 QZ JUICE SWITCH BLACK CHERRY SWITCH 516.75 417946
24,80z JUICE SWITCH WATERMELON/STRAWBERRY SWITCH $16.75 417948
248 07 JUICE SWITCH ORANGE TANGERINE SWITCH $16.75 417949

Pack |Size Description Brand CASE PRICE
40[4.23 02 JUICE APPLE 100% TOTALLY JUICE $8.67 698744
40(4.23 02 JUICE PUNCH 100% FRUIT TOTALLY JUICE $10.55 698240
40(4.23 0z JUICE ORANGE TANGERINE 100% JUICE TOTALLY JUICE 513.86 623698
40i4.23 OZ JUICE STRAWBERRY KIW| 100% TOTALLY JUICE $11.05 214534
44142307 JUICE GRAPE ARDMORE $10.55 698211
4414,2302 JUICE FRUIT PUNCH ARDMORE $10.55 698240
2418 0Z APPLE JUICE-MIDDLE/HIGH ONLY MOTTS No Bid
24|18 0Z FRUIT PUNCH-MIDDLE/HIGH ONLY MOTTS No Bid
48|7.6 OZ DRINK SMOOTHIE STRAWBERRY BANNANA BARFRESH $50.82 838062
4817.6 02 DRINK SMOGTHIE MANGO PINEAPPLE BARFRESH $50.82 838652
12/5002 SOUP MINESTRONE CAMPBELL'S $35.90 855766
12|50 0Z SCUP TOMATO CAMBELL'S 544,12 101427
12|500Z SOUP VEGETABLE CAMBELL'S $37.29 427941

6{1LB BASE CHICKEN LS MAIOR $61.50 580589
6/1LB BASE VEGETABLE NO MSG MINCR'S $69.07 694371
41218 ADULT-CHICKEN NOODLE KETTLE $36.67 429191
412 LB ADULT-CHICKEN TORTILLA KETTLE 547.09 217801
41218 ADULT - ITALIAN WEDDING KETTLE $37.48 855731
4i2LB ADULT-LOAD POTATO KETTLE 544.64 449771
4(2LB ADULT-NE CLAM CHOWDER KETTLE $65.92 118931
412 LB ADULT - LOBSTER BISQUE KETTLE 553.54 181080
4|2LB ADULT - TOMATO BASIL KETTLE $39.20 429321
4{2LB ADULT - PASTA FAGIOLI KETTLE $36.51 429251
41218 ADULT - BROCCOLI CHEDDAR KETTLE $41.27 449761
96,102 CEREAL CINN TST CRNCH WG CIN TOAST CRNCH $30.00 595934
96|1 02 CEREAL GOLDEN GRAHAM WG GOLDEN GRAHAMS $30.00 509434
96{10Z CEREAL TRIX RS WG TRIX 530.00 265782
96|/102 CEREAL CHEERIOS BOWL WG CHEERIOS £30.00 264702
415002 GRANOLA - BULK MALT O MEAL $52.29 711664
4320z CEREAL CRISPY RICE GF MALT O MEAL $29.20 500450
4150 0Z CEREAL CINNAMON GRANOLA LF WG MALT O MEAI, $49.57 210360
4|34 0Z CEREAL CORN FLAKES MALT O MEAL 518.96 210371
4134 0Z CEREAL TOASTY O'S WG MALT O MEAL $34.79 455873
96|1.55 07 SNACK BAR NUTRIGRAIN BLUEBERRY WG KELLOGG'S 532,14 498170
96/1.550Z SNACK BAR NUTRIGRAIN STRAWBERRY WG KELLOGG'S 532,14 209761
961.4 0Z SNACK BAR CEREAL TRIX WG TRIX $32.46 268690
96|1.55 0Z SNACK BAR NUTRIGRAIN APPLE IW WG KELLOGG'S $32.14 209741
96/1.4 OZ SNACK BAR COCOA PUFFS WG COCOA PUFFS $32.46 265901
96/1.4 0Z SNACK BAR CINN TOAST WG CIN TOAST CRNCH $32.46 265891
96(1.420Z SNACK BAR GOLDEN GRHM WG GOLDEN GRAHAMS $32.46 265921
2411.51 0Z OATMEAL CUP APPLE BAKED QUAKER $29.83 617511
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12142 02 CEREAL QUICK OATS RALSTON $59.58 240869
1044.6250Z SMART FOOD POPCORN SMARTFQOD $31.20 419480
64107 SMART FOOD POPCORN SMARTFOOD $39.19 712610
11600 CT SNACK RICE KRISPIE TREAT MINI IW WG RICE KRIiSPIE TR $154.50 859570
80114102 SNACK BAR RICE KRISPY WG KELLOGG'S $39.03 765457
60/1.03 0Z SMNACK SIMPLY CHEX STRAWBERRY YOGURT WG| SIMPLY CHEX $31.45 266020
60j.92 0z SNACK SIMPLY CHEX CHEDDAR WG SIMPLY CHEX $31.45 599282
120(1.7 OZ POPTART STRAWBERRY FROSTED WG POP-TARTS $42.17 695890
100{1.25 02 SNACK GRAHAM HONEY ORGANIC WG ANNIE'S $31.97 643012
Pack |Size Description Brand CASE PRICE

20012 CT CRACKER HONEY GRAHAMS WG 5007 HONEY MAID $23.83 282471
150(1 0Z CRACKER ANIMAL WG KEEBLER $36.80 682840
175].75 02 CRACKER CHEEZ IT WG CHEES-IT $36.33 282422
150[.5 0z CRACKER OYSTER NATURAL NE WESTS0Y $18.43 565270
150/3CT CRACKER GRAHAM HONEY WG MIM $23.83 282471
1100 CT CRACKER SAVORY 2 GRAIN 45GR WG MM No Bid
721.700Z CHIP CHEETOS PUFFS RF WG FRITOS $23.13 537871
72:102Z CHIP DORITC COGL RANCH RF WG DORITOS $23.13 541502
60|.875 07 CHIP BAKED SOUR CREAM & ONION RF LAY'S $19.38 192331
60,875 0Z CHIP LAYS BAKED BBQLRF LAY'S $19.38 575570
60(.875 0z CHIP BAKED LAYS RF LAY'S $19.38 714230
72{10z CHIP DORITC NACHO CHEESE RF WG DORITOS $23.13 456090
72110zZ CHIP DORITQ SPICY CHILI RF WG DORITOS $23.13 788670
1/350CT COOKIE FORTUNE |wW GOLDEN BOWL $33.50 565142
300|.75 0Z SNACK GOLDFISH CHEDDAR WG PEPPERIDGE FARM $68.10 736280
100|2 0Z COOKIE SUNRISE BITE MAPLE WG MiM No Bid
72{.875 0z CHIP TOSTITO BAKED SCOOPS RF WG FRITOS $21.60 696871
1041.7 02 PRETZELS HEARTZELS WG ROLD GOLD $32.01 893711
500(.2 02 CRACKER SALTINES ORIGINAL 2PK KEEBLER $23.86 870400
1518 SPLITIBAKING POWD DBI. ACT RED STAR $94,20 345640
12/12 LB BAKING SODA PACKER $33.00 345660
1/10LB COCONUT MEDIUM SHRED SPARROW $19.97 374124
24/118B CORN STARCH GF ARGO 534.19 108413
20i1LB YEAST INSTANT DRY SAF-INSTANT $66.40 194122
1|50 LB CORN MEAI, REGULAR #250 BUNGE $26.99 373901
1{50 LB CEREAL ROLLED QATS PACKER $56.33 452360
121218 SUGAR LITE BROWN DOMINO 533.88 382472
1/50 LB SUGAR GRANULATED (EFG) DOMING 540.80 787970
6|5LB MIX BROWNIE CONTIN MILLS $75.41 584126
G|5 LB MIX CAKE YELLOW CONTIN MILLS $34.81 126591
6|1 GAL OIL SOYBEAN PURE VEGETABLE LA SPAGNOLA $75.81 292702
6114 OZ SHRTNING SPRAY VEGALENE PREMIUM VEGALENE 526.52 415360
12/31B SHRTNING CRISCO CRISCO No Bid
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Pack |Size Description Brand CASE PRICE GFS Item Code
2110 1B PASTA ROTINI BARILLA 530.17 635511
1|13 LB PASTA NOODLES MEDIUM ZIA BRIOSA $27.32 368771
2/10LB PASTA ELBOWS BARILLA $29.66 654550
1110 LB PASTA QRZO ZIA BRIGSA $31.68 418061
6|24 02 PASTA CHOW MEIN NOQDLES LA CHOY $57.80 904994
2|10 LB PASTA PENMNE RIGATI BARILLA $28.93 635501
211018 PASTA CUT ZITI BARILLA $34.14 582549
2|10LB PASTA SHELLS MEDIUM ZIA BRIOSA $23.50 777361
1/10 LB PASTA ROTINI RAINBOW ZIA BRIOSA $37.08 413340
1:251.8 RICE PARBOILED HIGHLAND MARKET $26.24 722987
1{25LB RICE BROWN CRIGINAL PARBOILED WG BEN'S ORIGINAL $19.60 516371
6|#10 CAN VEG BEANS BLACK TACO FIESTA BUSH'S BEST $31.28 231981
12|24 QZ GELATIN RED RASPBERRY 535,92 500127
12/240Z GELATIN ivIX ASSORTED REDS HIGHLAND MARKET 543.22 500135
Pack |Size Description Brand CASE PRICE

4|1 GAL DRSG RANCH LITE KEN'S FOODS $48.58 631430
411 GAL DRSG BALSAMIC VINGRET KEN'S FOODS $51.07 166732
411 GAL DRSG ITALIAN LITE KEN'S FOODS $37.13 731470
4|1 GAL SAUCE BBQ - BARBECUE KEN’S FOODS $46.84 433388
411 GAL MAYO REDUCED CALORIE DRSG KEN'S FOODS $47.49 188921
4/1 GAL MUSTARD DELI ADMIRATION $18.95 807651
411 GAL VINEGAR CIDER ADMIRATION $31.58 430795
411 GAL VINEGAR WHITE ADMIRATION 518.28 629640
411 GAL VINEGAR RED ADMIRATION $24.08 644481
6|#10 CAN OLIVES PITTED MEDIUM IMP NEMCO $67.87 440809
4]1 GAL RELISH SWEET B&G FOODS 546.39 517186
6/66.5 QF FISH TUNA CHUNK LITE NEMCO $69.79 852103
1|5# TACO SEASONING FOOTHILL FARMS $10.06 413429
6;10# CAN REFRIED BEANS AMBROSIA $62.56 416631
1{1000CT KETCHUP PC 7GR HEINZ $18.20 852406
500(5.5 GR MUSTARD PACKET PPI $14.83 792365
1/2000CT SUGAR PACKET -.10Z DOMING $30.83 166070
112000 CT SUGAR SWEET'N LOW PACKETS SWEET'N LOW 521,94 584010
1/3000CT SPICE PEPPER PACKETS - .1 GR DEXIE 518.56 431515
1/3000 CT SEASONING SALT PACKETS IODIZED - .6 GR DIXIE $15.06 301957
200(9 GR RELISH SWEET PC HEINZ $13.45 852414
100({1 0Z SAUCE BBQ CUPS - LOW SODIUM FLAVOR FRESH B4 $20.69 714520
200|7 GR SAUCE HOT TEXAS PETE PACKET TEXAS PETE'S $14.55 269422
500{9 GR MAYO POUCH 513.65 545793
32114 OZ COFF BREAKFAST BLEND NE COFFEE $112.17 536490
32114 0Z COFF BREAKFAST BLEND DECAFE NE COFFEE $81.14 418821
ijloL8 TOPP SPRINKLES-LIGHT GREEN PACKER $23.67 416601
110 LB TOPP SPRINKLES-RED PACKER 523.67 416741
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Pack [Size Description Brand CASE PRICE GFS Item Code
1|10LB TOPP SPRINKLES-YELLOW PACKER $23.67 416761
11018 TOPP SPRINKLES-RAINBOW PACKER $23.67 416682
1/101LB TOPP SPRINKLES-CHOCOLATE PACKER $25.57 416542

150|1.2 07 SEEDS SUNFLOWER LS GF HNYROA SUNRICH NATURAL $44.47 606001
2151B PEANUT SUNBUTTER NUT FREE SUNBUTTER $37.61 149011
6|#10 CAN JELLY GRAPE ALL FRUIT POLANER $48.90 222042
6|5LB HONEY WILDFLOWER SWEET HARVEST $109.84 321152
1|1 GAL MOLASSES *SpLIT* HORN OF PLENTY $73.02 234303
411 GAL PANCAKE SYRUP i. RICE $42.71 433746
4i2.51B CROUTONS CHEESE & GARLIC WG FRESH GOURMET $38.83 707831
8|14 0z GRAVY BROWN MIX LS CHEFS COMPANION $37.96 552050
2|64 OZ SAUCE TERIYAKI PREMIUM CHEF MYRON’S 545.65 466425
415 GA SAUCE ORANGE ZESTY MINOR'S $52.82 340731
4|1 GAL SAUCE RED DEVIL PEPPER TRAPPEY $39.75 750835
11 GAL SAUCE SWEET & SOUR LA CHOY $44.25 466700
618.9 02 SPICE SEASON FAJITA NO MSG FOOTHILL FARMS $16.44 527971
1|16 OZ SPICE CHiLI POWDER DARK HIGHLAND MKT £ 58.73 331473
1116 0Z SPICE CINNAMON GROUND HIGHLAND MKT E $8.01 224723
1|12 0Z SPICE OREGANO GROUND HIGHLAND MKT P 58.01 224723
11502 SPICE BASIL LEAVES HIGHLAND MKT E $8.91 513628
119027 SPICE GARLIC POWDER HIGHLAND MKT E $13.25 224839

Pack |Size Description Brand CASE PRICE
116 OZ SPICE CAYENNE PEPPER HIGHLAND MKT E $11.95 225088
1j5LB SPICE PEPPER BLACK GROUND HIGHLAND MKT E $15.40 225061
1|120z2 SPICE PEPPER CRUSHED RED HIGHLAND MKT E $8.97 430196
1116 02 SPICE PAPRIKA SPANISH HIGHLAND MKT E $13.13 225002
6|32 0Z SPICE GARLIC CHOPPED IN OIL COSMO $24.00 3383831
1125LB SEASONING SALT PLAIN 258 BAG PACKER No Bid
61518 SAUCE QUESO BLANCO IT™M $66.25 722110
6|5 LB SAUCE CHEESE RF v $62.90 271081
6i5LB SAUCE ALFREDO RF 1T $60.88 155661,
4|58 CHSE PIZZA BLEND SHREDDED GREAT LAKES $56.63 458092

200|102 CHSE CHEDDAR CUBES RF LAND O LAKES $70.10 265022
45 LB CHSE AMERICAN YELLOW 160 SL RF RS BONGARDS $54.33 349988
168|102 CHSE STRING STICKS BONGARDS $50.78 579050
100(1 0Z CHSE CREAM PC CUPS SMITHFIELD $29.93 228427
4|51B CHSE MOZZ LOW MOISTURE PARTSKIV SHREDD LAND O LAKES $67.66 645170
4/5LB CHSE CHEDDAR YELLOW SHREDDED MILD LAND O LAKES $71.36 150250
1117 LB BUTTER CONTINENTAL CHIPS - 58 CT GRASSLAND DAIRY 475.02 272020
30|1LB BUTTER BLEND 4% ZTF ADMIRATION $43.15 825580
24i8 0Z SOY MILK - PLAIN KIKKOMAN $21.75 494222
2/51B HUMMUS CLASSIC ALLNATURAL CEDAR'S MED $27.83 636361
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1{400CT CREAMER 3/8 HALF & HALF 10ML HOOD $24.82 108019
12]16 02 TOPP ONTOP NOM-DAIRY DESSRT ON TOP $40.10 330442
12i32 0z MILK LACTAID LACTAID $24.95 345247
48:4 0OZ VANILLA YOGURT UPSTATE FARMS $20.41 352594
48:4 0Z STRAWBERRY YOGURT UPSTATE FARMS 517.82 817920
48|4 0z RASPBERRY YOGURT UPSTATE FARMS 520,17 222600
48/4 02 PEACH YOGURT UPSTATE FARMS $520.17 817910
4814 OZ STRAWBERRY/BANANA YOGURT UPSTATE FARMS $20.17 338150
4|5 LB YOGURT VANILLA NF UPSTATE FARMS 527,28 675591
1j20LB VEG BEANS GREEN CUT US/CAN CHILL RIPE $45.80 519804
1|20 LB VEG BLEND QRIENTAL REGAL CROWN $54.09 265004
1:2018 VEG CARROT DICED US/CAN CHILL RIPE 429,12 791311
1/20 LB VEG CARROT CC SLIC US/CAN CHILL RIPE $30.29 118421
6/2.5LB VEG EDAMAME SHELL SOYBEAN SIMPLE GOODNSS $43.37 147270
1120 1B VEG CUT CORN US/CAN CHILL RIPE $53.04 285620
1|20 LB VEG MIX 4 WAY US/CAN CHILL RIPE 549.13 380300
1[20LB VEG BLEND CALIFORNIA US/CAN/MX CHILL RIPE $38.83 610891
120 L8 VEG PEAS SWEET U5/CAN CHILL RIPE No Bid
12|12 1B VEG BROCCOLI FLORETS FROZEN HARVEST $47.20 610902
1214 LB VEG SQUASH BUTTERNUT FROZEN HARVEST $39,28 424611
1/20 LB VEG SPINACH CHOPPED IQF US CHILL RiPE $37.07 266757
6i2.5LB POTATO SWEET GEMS SIMPLOT SWEETS 533.84 872570
6|5 LB FRIES FLAVORLAST SHOESTRING OUR CHEF CHOICE $34.47 399131
6/5LB FRIES WEDGE SEASONED MCCAIN SI1G $32.80 199080
6|5 LB FRIES 8 CUT WEDGE SKIN ON MUCCAIN SIG $30.21 509661
6|2.5LB FRIES SWEET POTATO DEEP GROOVE HARVEST FRESH $26.08 628100
6/5.0LB FRIES TATER PUFFS MCCAIN $32,51 141510
Pack Size Rescription Brand CASE PRICE
70i4 QZ JUICE APPLE 100% PURE FROM CONCENTRATE [ARDMORE FARMS $11.49 207990
70407 JUICE CHERRY STARFRUIT VEGGIE/FRUIT ARDMORE FARMS 516.42 556891
70|14 0z JUICE GRAPE ECO ARDMORE FARMS $15.76 199342
7014 OZ JUICE MANGO VEGGIE/FRUIT BLEND ECO ARDMORE FARMS S14.77 510562
70|14 0z JUICE DRAGONFRUIT VEGGIE/FRUIT BLEND ECO|ARDMORE FARMS $16.42 510571
70l4 0z JUICE ORANGE ECO 100% FROM CONCENTRATE| ARDMORE FARMS $15.10 208682
70|40z JUICE FRUIT PUNCH BLEND ECO ARDMORE FARMS 513.68 199422
89,3.6 0z FISH POLLOCK & CHEESE RECTANGLES WG HIGH LINER No Bid
144|102 EGGS PATTY ROUND CN FC 3.5" PAPETTI'S $22.01 208990
15218 EGGS EASY LIQUID WHOLE W/CITRIC ACID PAPETTI'S $48.50 849370
450|1.12 02 CHICKEN TENDER CRISPY WG TYSON $80.10 283951
14813 02 CHICKEN PATTY CRISPY WG TYSON $84.76 281622
1750 CT CHICKEN CHUNK CRISPY WG TYSON $100.19 561301
I 148[3.5 07 CHICKEN PATTY HOT & SPICY WG TYSON no bid
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53/30Z CHICKEN BREAST FILLET GRILLED FC TYSON RED LABEL $65,10 185033
2|58 CHICKEN STRIP BREAST GRILLED FC TYSON RED LABEL $43,55 411181
124/3.8 02 CHICKEN POPCORN CN FC WG TYSON $93.65 228781
1/10L8 CHICKEN DICED WHITE 1/2 PROVIEW No Bid
12118 PASTA TORTLINI CHEESE PEDE BROS. No Bid
221:2,1 02 PASTA RAVIOLI CHEESE MIN!I WG TASTY BRANDS $90.69 323457
110/4.3 02 PASTA LASAGNA ROLL-UP WG TASTY BRANDS $50.78 234041
1/10LB EGGPLANT ROUND BREADED PEELED CUTLETS DOMINEX $34.13 247790
320/.50Z BEEF MEATBALLS ADVANCE 556.80 753954
6|5 LB BEEF CRUMBLES CN FC 307 MAID-RITE $206.28 122863
18117 02 PIZZA CRUST 16" WG PARBAKED RICH'S $36.44 682943
24)12CT TORTILLA FLOUR 6" PRESSED MISSION $35.50 713320
12|12 CT TORT 10"WHT/WHEAT BLEND WG FATHER SAM'S $27.94 136610
5014.6 OZ TACC STICK BEEF & CHEESE IW WG INTEGRATED FOOD No Bid
160|2.5 QZ PORK RIB SUPER BONELESS FC CN ADVANCE $568.21 218912
8|3 LB MOZZ STIX BREAD LOW SODIUM WG FARM RICH 597.56 214080
12|28 ONION RING MOORES MOORE'S $82.53 351345
36/2.702 CINNAMON ROLL HADLEY 569.45 505333
4813.402 RASPBERRY CREAM CHEESE BAR HADLEY $27.60 193970
72{20Z BAGEL CINNAMON RAISIN SLICED IW WG AESOPS BAGELS 545,53 401042
72207 BAGEL WHITE WHEAT SLICED WG 2 OZ LENDERS BAGEL 528,72 240972
96|12 0Z MUFFIN CORN IW WG SMART CHOICE $19.78 159791
108/1.4 02 FRENCH TOAST STICK WG BAKE CRAFTERS $24.02 548912
144(1.3 0z PANCAKE BUTTERMILK WG BAKE CRAFTERS $27.00 156101
14413 0Z PANCAKE BUTTERMILK WG BAKE CRAFTERS $35.81 353705
280|302 5/0 FRENCH TOAST BITES IW WG BAKE CRAFTERS No Bid
12)112CT MUFFIN ENGLISH SLICED WG - 144 CT SMART CHOICE $27.36 681830
96202 MUFF APPLE CINNAMON IW WG SMART CHOICE $34.53 558011
9612 0Z MUFFIN BLUEBERRY IW WG SMART CHOICE 534.78 557970
96|2 0Z MUFFIN CHOCOLATE CHIP IW WG SMART CHOICE $32.68 273681
Pack [Size Description Brand CASE PRICE

75/3,402 LEMON BREAD SUPER BAKERY $48.22 320907
75|3.40Z PUMPKIN BREAD SUPER BAKERY $48.97 319812
48|30z ROLL SANDWICH GF Iw RICH'S $32.42 417276
6/16 CT ROLL HAMBRGR SLICED WG 3¢ HOMESTEAD $27.07 242472
6|16 CT ROLL HOTDQG SLICED WG 5.5" HOMESTEAD $37.38 258641
10j24 S BREAD SLICED WHEAT PULL WG HOMESTEAD $40.77 710650
9|6 CT ROLL GRINDER WHEAT 6" WG HOMESTEAD §33.55 556062
8|12CT ROLL CROWN SLICED WG 3.5" HOMESTEAD No Bid
195/2.2 QZ FLATBREAD 6X6 OVENFIRE WG RICH'S $42.98 644182
7513.402 BANANA BREAD SUPER BAKERY 548.49 319413
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7513.402 BLUEBERRY BREAD SUPER BAKERY $48.49 319418
210|140z COOCKIE SUGAR - SMART CHOICE IW SMART CHOICE $37.10 113161
21011402 COOKIE CHOCOLATE CHIP SMART CHOICE IW  |SMART CHOICE 527.04 543140
360|102 COOKIE DOUGH SUGAR WG DAVID'S COQKIES $57.12 414250
240,1.5 0Z COOKIE BOUGH CHOCOLATE CHIP RF - 51% WG | OTIS SPUNKMEYER $59.64 806661
384(1 02 COOKIE DOUGH CHOCOLATE CHIP RF - 51% WG | DELICIOUS ESSNL $63.22 243371
384|107 COCKIE DOUGH CARNIVAL RF - 51% WG OTIS SPUNKMEYER $67.63 243400
18011302 COOKIE DOUGH M&M RF WG REDI-BAKE 563.68 179801
180(1.3302 COOKIE DOUGH GOLDEN SUGAR RF WG REDI-BAKE $57.99 668721
722,202 APPLE FRUDEL PILLSBURY $36.44 838340
192|193 0Z PIZZA MAX STICK 50/50CH WG THE MAX $56.18 789310
80|5.49 0Z PIZZA CHEESE 5" RD WG W WILD MIKE'S $81.57 841180
96{4.8 0Z CHEESE QUESADILLA WG THE MAX $63.72 231771
60|4.94 OZ PIZZA FRENCH BREAD 6" WG TONY'S $52.31 154321
48:5.2 02 SANDWICH SUNWISE GRAPE BULK W WG SUNWISE $57.21 705432
100j2.2 0Z PRETZEL SOFT WG SUPERPRETZEL $22.59 142411,
48{3.502 BURGERS VEGGIE GARDEN PATTY MORNINGSTAR FRM $49.84 561649
50(3.202 BURGERS BEEF PATTY FROZEN NORTH FARMS §77.31 538354
2|51LB FRANKS LOW SODIUM BEEF 8-1 ARMOUR $46.74 743171
12811.44 07 SAUSG TURKEY PATTY CN JiMiviY DEAN $40.60 240991
11214CT SAUSGE TURKEY LINK FC GF .7507 JONES DAIRY $38.92 171450
2|156CT BACON HARDWQOOD SMOKED FULLY COOKED |FARMLAND $84.52 623491
1000|CASE FOIL BAGS 534,68 341721
850|CASE PLASTIC BAGS WITH HANDLES $36.81 803355
S00|CASE BROWN BAGS #6 $101.97 285324
THS - SHURGUARD QUAT SANITIZER $108.92 666807
THS - ULTRA TEMP RINSE $278.64 738557
THS - MINI MAX DETERGENT No Bid
THS - DELIMER $132.81 184438
THS - SPECIAL GREEN No Bid
24.4.6 0Z PIZZA CHEESE 6" GF MR. SIPS No Bid
2411CS BREAD SLICE IW GF MR. S5IPS No Bid
8|120Z PASTA PENNE GF BARILLA $20.00 643852
24:3,5 0Z BAGEL PLAIN GLUT FREE IW UDI's $36.39 213541




