BID RESULTS
~ BID 6478
HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND
PERSONNEL
4/27/2023

A&A CRANE & RIGGING
LIF OUTDOOR MAINTENANCE, LLC.
MONROE TRACTOR
NAGY BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION, LLC

RED COACH TRUCKING
RELIABLE EXCAVATING CO INC.
T. ARDUINI COMPANY, INC.



A&A CRANE & RIGGING
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Bid 6478
Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 6 of 10
© TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
BID # 6478 DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL continued
Alse inelude hourly rates and pricing for the following support personnel:
Flagman: $ 5 JHR Overtime s 155 JHR
Ty
Laborer: $ MHR Overtime $ /HR
Supuvisor: $. HR Overtime $ /HR
ullziverial Markup percent___ O % (Town will not allow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and cerlifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
widitions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications requested are clearly and completely noted. Any alternate proposals
o pecbaied B asimilar format o those requested and are atfached herein. Itis understood -hat the Town reserves the right to reject

any or all proposals,

A £A Crone and Riqqfﬂq %

i ety Nam.e Y \J By (Signature)

‘ %C) H{JU&QJLOFHC Ave Jobn JE&/'/IQ/\J&Q”
Sreet Address Print Name

Bffq/@ﬂ[?_otf T 0c60 Owaes

iy, ¥ 2 Title

April 25 2023 (203 35¢ 0007
I d Telephone/Call

Ro.croneser Uf(c@mcrp\nﬁand r l'ﬁjlrﬂ -0

Lt Wabsite

TOWN OF TRUMBULL



Bid 6478
Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment

Page4 of 10
TOWN OF TRUMBUIL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
SID #6478 DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
7 4 . I
3i0 REspoNsE Form For_ AKA Crane and /? 9 j ‘fij
{Company Name) v
RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR)
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
_g,""-' {8 hours) {40 hours) (160 hours)
L.ow Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator

1|13 Cu Yd. fwith operator} $ /l// A $ $ 5

12 [Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd $ /{ / / /{ $ $ $

13 Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 11/2 yd. $ /V//{ $ $ §

]4 Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawier Excavator 2 yd. S A/ /’4 $ $ $

f!ﬁ Crawler Excavator wf 50-foot reach $ /(/ /A $ $ $

6 ICrawler Excavafor wf 75-fo0t reach $ /U / /[ $ § $

«  Packhoe-Crawier Excavator 3/4 yd.

___lequipped with a hydrautic rock hammer § /W 5 § §
IBackhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd, § % $ $ g
equipped with a hydraulic rock hammer /

,  Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. 4

.. [equipped with a hydraulic rock hammer 5 /‘/ / /l §

10 $ragiine 112 yd $ $

o Vi

£ Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd $ A/ / /} §

12 5i::ac!mue«\f\:’heel Loader 1/2 yd. $ /Vﬁ
uekat Leader-Wheel 2 172 v 3

e : onder-Whee! 31/2 yd $ j/{//j
tLeadar-Wheel Sy V4 ///
b lizor Crawior80 hp $ /V/ﬂ $ $ $
deizar Oraver-130 hp $ /(/// $

v stbey i Growiei 190 hp $ /%

©“r | & | &
e« | 9 | o | = | o | e
S | e | 2 | &= | > | e

&>
=

=%
E=3




Bid 6478
Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment

Page 5 of 40
g Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week iPer Month
Z {8 hours) (40 hours) {180 hours}
19 Vibratory Reller 10-12 Tons 3 4//;/ 3 § $
20 | Lo-Bed Tractor Trailer w/35T Geoseneck $ ///% $ $ $
.4 1Snowplow 42,060 GVWR or Greater w/ '
N ' leander § //// $ $ $
122 Truslc-Triasde 18-yard Dump 8 W $ $ $
© iSaritary Sewer vidso equipment (maludes
123 [recordar, labor & vehicles), (8" - 24") size $ J 3 $ $
L oipes /V///
- ilorm Sewer video equipment wirecorder
" 24 (12" pips orlarger) $ 3 ) $
__llinclides all labor & vehicles) M
25 Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $ A4 NE 5 $
76 1 25 Ton Boom Truck b /ES 3320 |5 6000 | sz €, 400
27 1 45Ton biobil Crene b 2/2.508 |00 |$ g c0d | § 3% 000
| j‘tf‘,nr»n Mobil Crane $ 72 ¢ |8 /¥o? |8 % dﬂd $3¢, po©
%) | 85 Yon Mobil Grane 5 $2290 |$ 11,400 | §4S, 1,40
i 1L Ton bl Crane $ V3,220 |$/46¢00 | §6¢, 420
Vil g o with Support Truck $ 1%s $ /090 |§ 35,400 $ 2/ 400
L astor Trallor with Flat Bed $ /35 $ Log0O % % yp0 § 21,400




Bld 6478

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 7 of 10
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
BID #6478 DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested fo list any additional equipment at their disposal {along
with rental rates) that may be available to the town. Some eguipment and hand tools may typically be rented with or without an operator

following section. Any equipment specified to be supplied WITHOUT OPERATOR will be considered bare rental without fuel being
supplied by the contractor,

Pleass indicate those ftems below:

RENTAL RATE (WiTH OPERATOR unless specified)

[iiom T Eqiimant Deser iption Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
e Truching § 135 $ $ $
> Rigogo b 15 § ; $

gz:r:,o\,éﬂ/ Ber 5 $ ,00 $ $

| Mo Besket ; R ;

5'_5’- ' Debris Bycket 5 $ /00 $ $

| Feck lifY ’ 5320 s 5

e E )Pomq'n\c} LocT § Y50 $ $

5 " f Eavef Bug et § $ /00 $ $

o Conerete By het 5 $ $o ¢ 3

i Pt § $ 50 s )
: f ; s $ $

§ $ $ $

! § $ $
” | b $ s $

? $ $ $ $
o § § § $
1 - $ : $ :

nd of proposal
TOWN OF TRUMBULL



LJF OUTDOOR MAINTENANCE, LLC.
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Bid 6478
Town of Trumbuli
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 6 of 10
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
.BID #6478, DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM

PROPOSAL continued

Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following support personnel:

Flagman: $ /HR Overtime $ " /HR
Laborer: $ é go 00 HR Overtime $ féj & Sy JHR
S 74, A | T
Supervisor: - $ 7{ v MR Overtime $_ / 5 ~ 7 R
Material Markup percent / ﬂ % (Town will not allow more than 15%) ré&ommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications requested are clearly and sompletely noted. Any alternate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are attached herein. It is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject
any or all proposals,

( TF Outome Mot L(C {%‘W’Q/ 2%2
)

Company Name By {Signature

Fo B 40652 Ltsurd T /5 dbiese s

Street Address Print Name

%@A/M? CT7 vidis e riez / Op ez i
City, State & Zip ; Titie £ ,
%//cf’/ﬁ,-/éj R I3 - X5 - G/ G

Date Telephone/Cell

(TF OQuatohoe Wiaee
Emil @ @ /4%”/,* é’ﬁ/ﬂ?’ Website

TOWN OF TRUMBULL



Bid 6478

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 4 of 10
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
BID-# 6478 DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM

D ResPoNSE FoRmFor_ L o 7 (U 7&4@ o e /L LEC

{Company Name)

RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR)

Equipment . Per Hour PerDay .  [PerWeek Per Month
E (8 hours) (40 hours) ..~ | {160 hours)
© .ow Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator $ g 3 ' 5
1__1/3 CurYd. (with operator). ‘
2~ |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd $ $ $ $
3 [Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 vd, $ $ $ $
4 [Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd, ~ |§ $ $ $
9 [Crawler Excavator w/ 50-foot reach $ $ $ $
6 |Crawler Exca;fator wf 75-foot reach $ $ $ .$
7 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd. $ g $ s
equipped with a hydraulic rock hammer
8 Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd, g § '$ §
equipped with a hydraulic rock hammer
9 Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd., $ s $ $
equipped with a hydraulic rock hammer
10 [Dragline 1 1/2 yd $ $ $ $
11 Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd $ $ $ 3
12 [Backhoe-Wheel Loader /2 yd. $ $ $ $
13 [Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2 yd $ $ $ $
14 |Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 1/2 yd $ $ b $
5 [Bucket Loader-Wheel 5yd
8 |Bulldozer Crawler-80 hp $ 3 $
17 Bulldozer Crawler-130 hp $ $ $ $
$
18 (Bulldozer Crawler-190 hp $ $ $




Bid 6478
Town of Trumbull-
Rer?tai of Censtruction Equipment

Page 5 of 10
E Equipment Per Hoﬁr Per Day Per Week: Per Month
2 {8 hourg) (40 hours) {160 hours)
19 WVibratory Roller 10-12 Tons $ $ $ $
20 | Lo-Bed Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooséneck $ $ $ $
Snowplow 42,000 GVWR or Greater w/
21 sander § § § ;
22 [Truck -Triaxle 18-yard Dump § $ $ $
Sanitary Sewer video equipment (includes
23 [recorder, labor & vehicles), (8" - 24 size § $ S $
pines : -
Storm Sewer video equipment wirecorder
24 (12" pipe or larger) $ § $ b
(includes alf labar & vehicles) )
25 [Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass _ $ $ 1§ 3
26 | 25-Ton Boom Truck $ $ $ $
27 | 45 Ton Mobil Crane $ $ $ $
28 | 55 Ton Mobil Crane $ $ $ $
29 | 85 Ton Mobil Crane $ § $ $
30 | 110 Ton Mobil Crane § § $ $
31 | Rigger with Support Truck $ $ $ §
32 | Tractor Trailer with Flat Bed $ $ $ $




Bid 6478
Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
. Page7of 10 .

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT .
- REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL

BID # 6478 DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional equipment at their disposal (along
with rental rates) that may be available fo the town. Some equipment and hand tools may typically be rented with or without an operator
and either or both rates may be included in this bid. Specify any rates that are WITHOUT OPERATOR in the Equipment Description in the
following section. Any equipment specified to be supplied. WITHOUT OPERATOR will be considered bare rental without fuel being
supplied by the contractor.

" Please indicate those items below:

RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR unless specified)

' item : Equipment Description . Per Hour Per Day PerWeek. Per Month
VT %ﬁ@ﬁ 7/ %ff S U250\ 8 [oag- ov| 3 5000, gy 2 4, i
b. | AL $ IR : I '
o |\&EY wi g}" ernedt S ) 7500 | 37 %00, 24| s Teie 7w AL gt
d — .8 s $ R
© T b elietn S Jo5 0| 510000 | 5w |5 0,000
f | - 3 8 Bk 5
g |Wecker éﬂcfaé;:z.“j T \3425 po |3/ teg. oo SS5ae0 20 | $25, 0000
h R 3 s s i
i / Mard Fuckes | 5 $ §
i 5 § 8 3
k. /G0 g2/ MJ@ -8 $ § $ |
! . &”eojﬂ/;" MM;)% e $ 23 ﬂféﬂ?@& { & dey Scg %/{—m $ s it j
m T7ze o/ $ K 5 $
n, $ $ 5 $
° G50 Lhevy - |sgs. a0 |sf50.00]53 AN A
p. 5 o d d A{Mﬁﬁ $ $ $ $
Q “Trzuck $ ; § K

End of proposal
TOWN OF TRUMBULL



MONROE TRACTOR
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Bid 6478
Town of Trumbull
Rental of Canstruction Equipment

Page 6 of 10
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
BID # 6478 DUE: April 27,2023 @ 2:00 PM

PROPOSAL continued
Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following support personnel:
Flagman: $ HR Overtime $ MHR
Laborer: $ /HR Overtime $ HR
Supervisor: $ HR Overtime $ /HR

Material Markup percent

% (Town will not allow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications requested are clearly and completely noted. Any alternate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are attached herein. It is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject

any or all proposals.

Midnrpe Trace ‘If«a o
Company Name

4 Sandra  DAve
Street Address

g,gu,‘fﬂ WindSe”, T UJO 7%}
City, State & Zip

04/27/2023

Date

€ Son SHepm (':) MLncD e +/Zi¢_" '71(;{: ( 0
Email

)

By (Signature

Eric  Spastrom

Print Name

14 6} ey g .m,“/ S /r."J' £, ELWR Cin 'T[L‘E /H/C
Title

Beo= Y¥71 - 1474
Telephone/Cell

Wnn's Morg e 7'7.:1 & ?&g) o Lo
Website




Bid 5478
Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment

Page 4 of 10
TOWN OF TRUMBULL,
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
BID # 6478 DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
BID RESPONSE FORM FOR MONROE TRACTOR
(Company Name)
RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR)
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
£ (8 hours) (40 hours) (160 hours)

low Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator 3 3 3 $
1 1143 Cu Yd. (with operator) '
2 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd $ $ $1,300 $3,700
3 [Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ $ $1,400 34,050
4 |Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 vd, 5 3 S $
9  [Crawler Excavator w/ 50-foot reach $ § § $
6  (Crawler Excavator w/ 75-foot reach $ $ § $

Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd.
7 equipped with a hydraulic rock hammer ¥ $ $2.300 §6,600

Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. " 1
8 equipped with a hydraulic rack hammer ¥ $ $2.400 $6,950
9 Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. $ 3 3 g

equipped with a hydraulic rock hammer
10 [Dragline 1 /2 yd $ $ $ $
1 [Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd b $ $ $
12 [Backhoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd. $ $ $ $
13 Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2 yd $ 3 $-,700 35,100
14 |Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 1/2 yd $ $ $1,800 $5,400
(5 |Bucket Loader-Wheel 5yd $3,300 $9,800
16  [Bulldozer Crawler-80 hp $ $ $1.600 $4,700
t7  [Bulidozer Crawler-130 hp $ $ $2,000 $8,000

5

18 |Bultdozer Crawler-190 hp $ $ $




Hid 8478

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment

Page 5 of 10

£ Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

£ (8 hours) 140 hours) {180 hours)

19 Vibratory Roller 10-12 Tons $ $ $2,100 $6,100

20 | Lo-Bed Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck $ $ § $
Snowplow 42,000 GYWR or Greater w/

21 sander ¥ $ $ $

22 (Fruck -Triaxle 18-yard Dump $ $ $ $
Sanitary Sewer video equipment (includes

23 [recorder, labor & vehicles), (8" 24") size $ $ $ $
pipes
Storm Sewer video equipment wirecorder

24 (12" pipe or larger) $ $ $ $
(includes all labor & vehicles)

25 |Temparary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $ $ 3 $

26 | 25 Ton Boom Truck $ $ $ $

27 | 45 Ton Mobil Crane § $ $ $

28 | 55 Ton Mobil Crane $ $ S $

29 | 85 Ton Mobil Crane § $ $ $

30 | 110 Ton Mobil Crane $ $ $ $

31 | Rigger with Support Truck $ $ $ $

32 | Tractor Trailer with Flat Bed $ $ $ $




Bid 6478

Town of Trumbull

Rental of Canstruction Equipment
Page 7 of 10

TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL

BID # 6478 DUE: April 27,2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to fist any additional equipment at their disposal (along
with rental rates) that may be available to the town, Some equipment and hand tools may typically be rented with or without an operator
and either or both rates may be included in this bid. Specify any rates that are WITHOUT OPERATOR in the Equipment Description in the
following section. Any equipment specified to be supplied WITHOUT OPERATOR will ke considered bare rental without fuel being supplied
by the contractor.

Please indicate those items belowr:

RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR unless specified)

item Equipment Description Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
a. Tracked Skid Steer Without Operator $ § $1,100 $3,300
b, gg:ﬂ;? Skid Steer Without g g $900 $2,500
c. $ $ $ $
d. $ $ $ $
e. $ $ $ $
f. $ $ $ $
g $ $ ¥ $
. $ $ $ $
i $ $ $ §
i 3 b $ §
k. $ $ $ $
A $ $ § $
m, $ $ $ $
n. $ $ $ $
0. $ $ $ $
p. $ $ $ $
g $ $ $ $

End of proposal



NAGY BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION, LLC



NAGY BILOS

Bid 6478
Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment

Page 6 of 10
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
BID # 6478 DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL continued
Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following support personnel;
Flagman: $ 56, ~ IHR Overtime $ P~ MR
-
Laborer: $ S HR Overtime $ 5. HR
Supervisor: $ o=~ /HR Overtime $ bl IHR
Material Markup percent i2 % (Town will not allow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications requested are clearly and ccmpletely noted. Any alternate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are attached herein. It is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject

any or all propcsals.
?/:%MLB /&ﬂ/
U

Com Name

By (Signatufe)
L8 M SHipeed NL MMyl W, NS
Street Address Print Name i
Nbacne, T, Dleby, Wngg el
City, State & Zip Tile 4

#2592 (%3) Bis. $L53

Date = Telephona/Cell
Ll{uiﬂy& Gpl. (v Nedon ¢ gpl, com
Email..J Webgith

TOWN OF TRUMBULL



Bid 6478

Town of Trumbull

Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 4 of 10

TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUGTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL

BID # 6478

BID RESPONSE FORM FOR 1\ G E

(Company Name)

DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM

PROPOSAL FORM

RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR)

Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

E (8 hours) (40 hours) (160 hours)

Low Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator 2 ity —
1143 Cu Yd. (with operator) S yze — [$ yooo— | B,0pv— | § 20,000, ~
2 [Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd ($ Vep. — |% i JAU = $ Hhaaop $.;Lff‘, EUE
3 [Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ 92p.-. |8 L Tebo— | § 5 g0 | § A N
4 [Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. 260, 3 Ay DOB $ D) 00D, | § YD) (00 s
9 |Crawler Excavator w/ 50-foot reach $ 28¢. . | A0u40 |3 Oy | § YO, B0~
6  [Crawler Excavator w/ 75-foot reach $ $ $ b

Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd. PP s o o
4 equipped with a hydraulic rock hammer Y250, — S 3000 — |8 V00D — | 3 WD O,
8 Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ . . $ . . S T

equipped with a hydraulic rock hammer AP~ |* 2000 — | P00 e oy
9 Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. § 5 5 $

equipped with a hydraulic rock hammer
10 [Dragline 1 1/2 yd $ $ $ $
11 [Bucket l.oader-Crawler 3 yd $ Vil —  |% hagp — |3 Y oe.... $ R, b, -
12 [Backhoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd. $ jas. . |8 | DL $ 5000.— | $2p ) OOD%
13 Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2 yd $ igo.- |8 by V20 em| 8 5,00, — $ 22, dpp.
14 Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 1/2 yd $ tb. - |5 1280 - | S wupp.. | $ 25 wov.
15 |Bucket Loader-Wheel Syd | ol |, RGO~ 0. A, DD .
16 [Bulldozer Crawler-80 hp $iyo.— [$ oD — [$ & pop... $ an.4e0.
17 [Bulldozer Crawler-130 hp $ b — |Si,280. . |$ wor ~ | $ A5 Lrp. -

$

18  [Bulldozer Crawler-190 hp $ $ $




Bid 6478

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construstion Equipment
Page 5 of 10
E Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
2 (8 hours) (40 hours) (160 hours)
19 [Vibratory Roller 10-12 Tons ¥ =m0 - $ dqppee. |3 G $ 4 aun.—
20 | Lo-Bed Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck $13p.— |8, Oup. -~ |3 5app.. | 8 AP, e
Snowplow 42,000 GVWR or Greater w/
2l sander $ § $ $
22 |Truck -Triaxle 18-yard Dump $ o0 e |8 Gubw |5 YEpp.— | § W 2 —
Sanitary Sewer video equipment (includes
23 [recorder, labor & vehicles), (8" - 24") size $ 3 $ $
pipes
Storm Sewer video equipment wirecorder
24 (12" pipe or larger) $ $ $ $
{includes all labor & vehicles)
25 Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $ b $ 3
26 | 25 Ton Boom Truck $ $ $ $
27 | 45 Ton Mobil Crane $ $ $ $
28 | 55 Ton Mobil Crane $ $ $ $
29 | 85 Ton Mobil Crane $ $ b $
30 | 110 Ton Mobil Crane $ $ $ $
31 | Rigger with Support Truck $ $ $ $
32 | Tractor Trailer with Flat Bed $ $ $ $




PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

Bid 6478
Town of Trumbul!

Rental of Construction Equipment

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL

DUE: April 27,2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

BID # 6478

In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional equipment at their disposal
with rental rates) that may be available to the town, Some equipment and hand tools may typically be rented with or without an o

and either or both rates may be included in this bid. Specify any rates that are WITHOUT OPERATOR |
WITHOUT OPERATOR will be consider

following section. Any equipment specified to be supplied
supplied by the contractor,

Please indicate those items below:

RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR unless specified)

Page 7 of 10

item Equipment Description Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

a ASN 50 Tl sloid sheer™ | $ §(p. — § 80— |$ dypD. = | $ VHiolt o
b AS 1D - Traek suidsicer” |8 oo |S dqup . |8 yezp— | 8 A, 20
i Aot 66 Tuck Sutdoreer | ¥ izp . |8 you.— |3 Baep— | $ apges
¢ CATN 35 Roboortie Guaintiel © 205 — |8 vop— |$ @ b= | 8 BB
¢ OTMBD Prrierine, Cycaveld ¥ 20— |9 Yibr — | § Srp— | $ B AL =
¥ CAT D b $ i5p. . $yavp— |8 igorp— $ 2% LOD
9 Mppy Seken ol Rpad ¥ ige. $ 300~ Swo00.~ | S .
h. -tz.urﬁ; Seseener QL Y s |8 w— | B4O0, - | Svdppp.
I, $ $ $ $

J- $ $ $ $

k. $ b $ $

l $ $ $ $

m. $ $ $ §

n. $ $ $ $

0. $ $ § §

p. $ $ $ $

q. $ $ $ $

End of proposal
TOWN OF TRUMBULL

(along
perator
n the Equipment Description in the
ed bare rental without fuel being



RED COACH TRUCKING
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Bid 6478
Town of Trumbyl
Rental of Construction Equipmen!
Page 6 of 10

TOWN OF TRUMBULL

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION 8, HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
BID # 6473 DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL continued

Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following support personnel;

Flagman; Overtime S - __HR
Laborer; Dvertime o e [HR
Supervisor: Overtime S = JHR
Material Markup percent % (Town will not allow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the Specifications requested are clearly and cempletely note, Any altemate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are atlached herein. |t is understood tat the Town reserves the right to reject
any or all proposals,
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Equipment
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
BID # 6478 DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM

PROPOSAL continued
Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following support personnel;
Flagman: $ D0, 00 /HR Overtime $ ©%.c0 MR
Laborer: $ 5% po __HR Overtime $ ©@2.00  mR
Supervisor: $ ©%, o0 /HR Overtime 5 9i.25 HR

Material Markup percentu__,_if{%% (Town will not allow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein, Any substitutions to the specifications requested are clearly and ccmp ly noted. Any alternate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are attached . Itis understood e Town res he right to reject

any or all proposals.
/m%/
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RELIABLE EXCAVATING C0., |
0 15 Bates Place, Danbury, CT 06810
TOWN OF TRUMBULL Ph: (203)743-4856, Fax: (203)743-131¢
Web: www.reliableexcavatingco.oom

E-mail: reliableco@sheglobal net
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL e
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
BID # 6478 DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
BID RESPONSE FORM FOR Reliable Excavating Co., Inc.
(Company Name)
RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR)
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
E (8 hours) (40 hours) (160 hours)
Low Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator
1 1/3 Cu Yd. (with operafor) $ 150.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 24,000.00
2 |Backnoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd $ 150.00 | $ 1,20000 | $  6,000.00 | $ 24.000.00
3 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd, $ 150.00 ($  1,200.00 |$  6,000.00 | $ 24,000.00
4 |Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd.| $ 175.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 7,000.00 [ $  28,000.00
5 [Crawler Excavator w/ 50 foot reach No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6  |Crawlsr Excavator w/ 75 foot reach No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd.
1 equipped with the hydraulic rock hammer ; 20000 | § 100000 | & 8.00000 | $ 32,000.00
Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd.
4 equipped with the hydraulic rock hammer ¢ 225.00 | 1BI0001 % 900000 1§ 36,000.00
Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 2 yd. equipped
9 with the hydraulic rock hammer $ 300.00 | $ 2,400.00 [ $  12,000.00 $  48,000.00
10 |Draglire 1 1/2 yd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 (Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd $ 275.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $  11,000.00 | $  44,000.00
12 |Backhoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd. $ 125.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $  20,000.00
13 |Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2 yd $ 135.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $  5400.00 | $ 21,600.00
14 |Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 1/2 yd $ 150.00 | § 1,200.00 | $ 6,000.00 [ $  24,000.00
15 |Bucket Loader-Wheel 5yd $ 175.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $  28,000.00
16 |Bulldozer Crawler-80 hp $ 125.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
17 |Bulldozer Crawler-130 hp $ 150.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $  6,000.00 | $ 24,000.00
18 |Bulldozer Crawler-190 hp $ 325.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $  13,000.00 | $ 52,000.00
RELIABLE EXCAVATING CQ., [NC,
14 Bates Place| Danbury, CT 0680
FIT 2033888+ ki

7 .
Web www. reliableexcavatingeo. ot
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" mail: reliableco@sbeglobal net



Bid 6478

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 5 of 10
Equipment Per Hour Per Day [Per Week Per Month
E (8 hours) {40 hours) (160 hours)
19 |Vibratory Roller 10-12 Tons $ 100.00 | $ 800.00 | $  4,000.00 |$ 16,000.00
20 | Lo-Bed Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck | $ 13500 [ 1,080.00 | $ 540000 | § 21,600.00
21 [Snowplow 42,000 GYWR or Greater $ 250008 200000{$ 10000.00]% 40,0000
w/sander
22 [Truck -Triaxle 18-yard Dump $ 125.00 | $ 1,000.00 { $ 500000 |$  20,000.00
Sanitary Sewer video equipment (includes
23 Irecorder, labor & vehicles), (8"-24") size | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
pipes
Storm Sewer video equipment wirecorder
24 |{12" pipe or larger) (includes all labor & No Bid No Bid ivo Bid No Bid
vehicles)
25 |Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $ 500.00 |  4,000.00 |$ 20,000.00 ] § 80,000.00
26 | 25 Ton Boom Truck No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 | 45 Ton Mobil Crane No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 | 55 Ton Mabil Crane No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
29 | 85 Ton Mobil Crane No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30| 110 Ton Mobil Crane No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 | Rigger with Support Truck No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid
32 | Tractor Trailer with Flat Bed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

RELIARLE SXCAVATING GO, NG,
14 Bafes Place, Danbury, CT 06810
P {3000 VAR ADNS, Fasx; {208 T4B-F 16
Wl swwrelinbloexcavatinguo com
oailhiableco@sboglobat.ngs
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
BID #6478 DUE: April 27, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to fhe equipment specified in the hid request, responders are requested o fist any addifonal equipment at their disposal {along
with rental rates) that may be avallable to the town. Some equipment and hand tools maey fyplcally be rented with or without an operator
and elther or both rates may be Included in this big. Specify any rates that are WITHOUT QPERATOR in the Equipment Description in the
following  section.  Any equipment  specified to be supplied WITHOUT OPERATOR will be consldered bare rental without fuel being

supplled by the contractor.

Please indicale thoss ltems below:

RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR unless specified)

liem Equipment Description Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

a, Roller 1-3 Ton $ 75.00 | § 600.00 | $ 300000 )%  11,999.90
b. Roller 3-5 Tons $ 85.001% 680.00 | § 340000 1§ 13,599.90
c. Roller 5-8 Tons $ 100.00 ] $ §00.00 | $ 4,0600.00 | §  15,990.90
d. Roller Dirt Compactor 10-20 Tons $ 125.00 | $ 1,000.00 { & 5,000.00 | $ 19,999.90
e, Blow Knox Paver 14' PF115 5 22500 | % 1,800.00 | 900000 [ $  35,999.90
f. Alr Compressor/Mammer 3 85.00 | $ 680.00 | $ 3,400.00 | $  13,509.90
g. . Cement Mixer $ 50008 400.00 | $ 2,000.00 | 7,999,860
h. Cut off saw 14" 3 25001 % 200,06 [ $ 1,000.00 | § 3,989.90
i Concrete/Asphalt 16"-18" Saw § 7500 $ 6800.00 | & 3,000.00 [ $ 11,999.90
I Concrete/Asphalt 36" Road Saw 3 12500 [ $ 1,000,00 | $ 5,000.00 $  19,999.90
k. Skid Steer New Holland 180-L $ 100.00 | $ 800.00 [ $ 4,000.00 [ 3 15,999.90
I Skid Steer New Holiand 180-L w/broom; § T15.00 1 $ 920.00 | $ 460000 [$ 18,399.00
m. o Holland 18" Willer for ASphalt & [~ $  220000($ 11,00000 | § 4399990
n. Pump 2-3" $ 25001 % 20000 | § 1,000.00 | 3,990.90
. Curb Machine 4"-6" mold $ 85.00 [ $ 680.00 | $ 340000 1§ 13,599,90
p. Trench Box $ 100.00 | $ 800.00 [ % 4,000.00 ($ 15999.090
q. Road Plates % 7500 | $ 600.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ - 11,995.90

TOWN OF TRUMBULL PELIABLE EXCAVATING (0., ING.

14 Bates Place, Danbury, CT 06810

0 TAR-ARSG, Fan (203) P43-FAM6

wiets g reliableescavatinglo.com
sl ielisbieco@shoeglobai i
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
BID # 6478 DUE: April 27, 2020 @ 2:00 PN

PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to the equipment speciiied In the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional equipment at thefr disposal (along
with rental rates) that may be available to the fown. Some equipment and hand tools may typically be rented with or without an aperator
and efther or both rates may be included in this bid. Speclfy any rates that are WITHOUT OPERATOR in the Equipment Description in the
following  section.  Any equipment specified to be supplied  WITHOUT OPERATOR will be considered bare rental without fuel being

supplied by the confractor,

Pleass indicata those items below:

RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR unless specified)

ftem Equipment Description Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

5. Excavator PC-78 $ 115.00 | $ 92000 |$ 460000 % 18,399.90
t. Excavator PC-228 $ 13500 /% 108000 [$ 540000 |$ 21599.90
u. Excavator PC-308 $ 150.00 /% 1,200.00 ($  6,000.00 |$ 23.099.90
V. Brush Stump Grinder $ 325.00 $ 2,800,000 | % 13,00000 [ $ 51,009.90
w. 1995 Brush Wood chipper $ 100.00 | $ 800.00 | $  400000(5 15999.90
X. Road Grader $ 25000 | $ 200000 |$ 1000000 (§ 39,999.90
2 Komatsu PC78 5/8 ¢y $ 12500 1§ 100000 {$  500000]% 10.999.90
2. EEE%E;E::Z}Z%::z::z::rr:::: 5 _ 190001%  1,04000($ 5200005 2079990
aa. bucket 1.5vd - 2.6 v $ 15000 /' $ 120000 [$ 600000 % 23999.00
bb. Excavator/Hybreak Hammer 3,500lbs | $ 250,00 $ 2,000.00|$  10,000.00 $  39,999.00
cc. “l_’g:;’ ooere 510C 4x41,000 Fiybreaker | 125.00 |§ 100000 ($ 500000 |3 19.999.90
dd. John Deere 410C 4x4 Extenhoe $ 100.00 | § 800.00 (8 400000 (% 15999.00
ee. John Deere York Rake 7" $ 100.00 | § 800.00 | $§  4,000.00 3% 15,899.90
ff. Utility Traiter 10 Tons $ 75.00 | $ 600.00 | $  3,00000]% 11,999.90
9g. Low bed 40 Tons $ 12500 1% 1,000001% 500000 ($ 19.999.90
hh. Low bed to move Machines 50 Tons | § 150.00 [$  1,200.00 |'$ 6,000.00 | §  23,999.00

TOWN OF TRUMBULL

RELIABLE EXCAVATING GO, 1IN,
15 Bates Place, Danbury, CT 068810
Ph: (207 743-4856, Fag: {203) FA3-7316
Welb: m--ww.r@lfableexcewaﬁngcm.corn
Linail: refiableco@sboglobal.net
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL

BID # 6478 DUE: April 27, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addilion to the equipment specified In the bld request, responders are requested to Jist any addiional equipment at thelr disposal {along
with rental rafes) that may be available to the town, Some eguipment and hand tools may typlcally be rented with or without an operalor
and sither or both rates may be Included In this bid, Specily any rates that are WITHOUT CPERATOR fn the Equipment Description in the
following  saction. Any equipment specified to be supplied  WITHOUT OPERATOR will ke considered bare rental without fusl being

supplied by the contractor,

Fiease indicats those Items betow:

RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR uniess specified)

Item Equipment Description Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
i- Screener Reeds RDY0 $ 150.00 1 % 1,200.02 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 23,999.90
kk. Sander or Salter $ 75.00 | % 600.00 | $ 300000 ($ 11,999.00
. Hay Blower $ 100.00 | & 800.00 | 4,000.00 | $ 15,880.90
mm. Dozer D& 3 150.00 | 1,200,00 | & 6,000.00 | $ 23,999.00
nn, Dozer D8K Ripper $ 350.00 | 2,800.00|$  14,000.00 $ 5599990
00, Track Crusher 36x42 $ 650.00 | 8 5,200.0C [ $  26,000.00 $ 103,999.90
pp. Foreman $ 65.00 | $ 52000 | § 2,600.00{$  10,399.90
dq. Mason Labor $ 60.00 % 480.00 1 % 2,400.00 | $ 9,5998.90
IT. Mechanic with Tools $ G5.001 % 520.00 | § 280000 % 10,390.90
§s. Carpenter with tools 5 750018 €600.00 | & 3,000.00 [ $  11,909.90
it. Truck with hand toois $ 100.00 | 3 800.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $  15,990.90
utt. Tree Crew with Truck and Chipper $ 400.00 | $ 320000 | $  16,000.00 $ 63999.00
w. fandscape & Mah Crew with Truck and | 5 250.00 |$ 200000 [$ 10,0000 | §  39,099.00
| .| DSralionas oy 3900 Flow TR | $  1800.00|%  9,00000$ 2699000

End of proposal
TOWN OF TRUMBULL

RELIARLE EXCAVATING CO., NG,
17 Bates Place, Danbury, CT 06340
Fie: (203} 7434856, Fax: {203) 743-7346
Yot www.reliable@xcavaiingcu.{:Um
E il seliableco@sheglobal. net
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Bid 6478

Town of Trumbull

Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 6 of 10

st} L)
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL

BID # 6478 DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM

PROPOSAL continued

Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following support personnel:

Flagman: §_45.00 JHR Overtime $ 67.50 JHR
Laborer: § 90.70 IHR Overtime g 113.32 JHR
Supervisor; $ 97.27 HR Overtime $_118.06 HR
Material Markup percent, 15 % (Town will not allow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications requested are clearly and completely noted. Any alternate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are attached herein. It is understood *hat the Town reserves the right to reject

any or all proposals, \/\

T. Arduini Company, Inc.

Company Name By\tSignafure)

312 River Street Tania Arduini-Petitti

Street Address Print Name

Bridgeport, CT 06606 President

City, State & Zip Title

4/27/2023 203 366-0093/203 395-4762
Date Telephone/Cell

tarduini@tarduinicompany.com
Email Website

TOWN OF TRUMBULL
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
BID #6478 DUE: April 27, 2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
BID RESPONSE FORM FOR T Arduini Company, Inc.
(Company Name)
RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR)
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
E {8 hours) (40 hours) (160 hours)
Low Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator § $ $ $
1__11/3 Cu Yd. (with operator)
2 [Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd $250.00 |[%1 ,800.00 | %9.000.00 | $ 36,000.00
3 [Backhoe-Crawier Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $275 00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00 | $40,000.00
4 Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd, $ $ $ $
5 [Crawler Excavator w/ 50-foot reach $ $ $ $
6 [Crawler Excavator w/ 75-foot reach $ $ $ $
Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd.
"_loquipped with a hycraulic ook hammer $360.00 |$2,580.00 | $10,320.00| $41,280.00
8 Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ $ 5 $
equipped with & hydraulic rock hammer 400.00 2,900.00 11,600.00 46,400.00
9 Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd, $ $ s $
equippzd with a hydraulic reck hammer
10 [Dragline 1 1/2 yd $ $ $ $
1 [Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd $ $ $ $
(2 [Backhoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd. $ L} $ $
13 Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2 yd $230.00 $1,600.00 $6,400.00 $25,600.00
14 Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 1/2 yd § 250.00 |$ 2,000.00 |$10,000.00 | $ 40,000.00
15 [Bucket Loader-Wheel 5yd
16 [Bulldozer Crawler-80 hp $ § 3 $
17 [Bulldozer Crawler-130 hp $ $ $ $
$
18 [Bulldozer Crawler-190 hp $ $ $




TARDUINI CO

Bld 6478
Town of Trumbudl
Rentat of Construction Equipment
Page 5 of 10
E Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
= {8 hours) (40 hours) {160 hours)
19 \Vibratory Reller 1012 Tons § $ $ §
20 | Lo-Bed Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck $ $ § $
Snowplow 42,000 GYWR or Greater w/
21 sander $ ’ ¥ $
22 [Truck -Triaxle 18-yard Dump $175.00  $1,400.00 |$7,000.00 | $28,000.00
Sanitary Sewer video equipment (includes
23 [recorder, labor & vehicles), (8" - 24" size $ $ $ $
pipes
Storm Sewer video equipment wirecorder
24 (12" pipe or larger) $ $ $ $
(includes all tabor & vehicles)
25 [Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $500.00  [$4,000.00 |$20,000.00 | $ 80,000.00
26 | 25 Ton Boom Truck $ $ $ $
27 | 45 Ton Mobil Crane $ $ $ $
28 | 55 Ton Mobil Crane $ $ $ $
29 | 85 Ton Mobil Crane $ $ $ $
30 1 110 Ton Mobil Crane $ B $ $
31 | Riggar with Support Truck $ $ $ $
32 | Tractor Trailer with Flat Bed $250.00 $2.000.00 %1 0,000.00 | $40,000.00




T. Arduini Company, Inc.

Bid 6478
Town of Trumbulf
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 7 of 10
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUGCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL

BID #6478 DUE: April 27,2023 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional equipment at their disposal (along
with rental rates) that may be available to the town. Some equipment and hand tools may typically be rented with or without an operator

~and either or both rates may be included in this bid. Specify any rates that are WITHOUT OPERATOR in the Equipment Description in the
following section. Any equipment specified to be Supplied WITHOUT OPERATOR will be consldered bare rental without fuel being
supplied by the contractor.

Please indicate those items below:

RENTAL RATE (WITH OPERATOR unless specified)

ltem Equipment Description Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

a. JDEERE 324 LOADER 1.5 C/Y] $175.00 $1400.00 [ $7000.00 | $28000.00
b. KOBELCO 70 1/3 C/Y $165.00 $1320.00 | $6600.00 | $26400.00
e J DEERE 50 $155.00 | % 1240.00 |%6200.00 |$ 24800.00
d. J DEERE 35 % 150.00 $1200.00 | %6000.00 |$24000.00
€. J DEERE 36 $150.00 | $1200.00 |%6000.00 | % 24000.00
f ROLLER 1.5 TON $150.00 | $1200.00 | $6000.00 | $24000.00
g. UTILITY BODY W/ TOOLS | $50.00 $700.00 | $2000.00 | $8000.00
h. $ $ $ $

] $ $ $ $

i $ $ $ $

k. $ $ $ $

! $ $ $ $

m. $ $ $ $

I, $ $ $ $

0. $ $ $ $

b, $ $ $ $

q $ $ $ $

End of proposal
TOWN OF TRUMBULL



