
TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 

TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

BID NUMBER 6430 

DUE: September 14, 2021 @ 2:00 PM 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 

ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

Bids: 

The Chas C. Hart Seed Co. 

Harrell's, LLC. 

Westchester Turf Supply, Inc. 

Synergy Turf Supply 

Executive Turf Products 

Valley Green, Inc. 

Tom Irwin Inc. 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
T ASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @ 2:00 PM 

PROPOSAL (To be submitted with proposal) 

ADDENDA 
The following Addenda have been received. The modifications to the Bid Documenls noted therein have been considered and all costs 
thereto are Included in the Base Bid. 

Addenda# 

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) tisted on the following items listed on Pages 5 - 9 of this request and certifies that 
the following proposal meets all the specifications and conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications 
requested are clearly and completely noted. Any alternate proposals are presented in a similar format to those requested and 
are attached herein. It is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject any or all proposals. If you cannot supply a quote 
please put NA 

All proposed pricing shall remain be firm fixed for a period of 1 year (Agency Products subject to Agency Pricing) 

Proposal of: The Chas. C. Hart Seed Co. 
(COMPANY NAME) 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @ 2:00 PM 

BID PROPOSAL FORM 

***All prices are effective 09/15/2021 *** 

Oescrietion-Seed Fertilizer1 Chemical Bid UNIT SIZE Price eer unit 
Appear2 2 gallon $296.00/2 gal. 
Banner Maxx 2 5 gallon $224.50/1 gal. 
Barricade 4FL 1 gallon $147.30/1 gal. 
Daconil Action 5 gallon $208.65/2.5 gal. 
Daconil Ultrex 20Ibs $260.00/20 lbs. 
Daconil ZN 5 gallon $180.25/2.5 gal. 
Divanem .5 gallon $1,622.25/0.5 gal. 
Headway 1 gallon $451.15/1 gal. 
Heritage Gib jug $1,996.20/6 lb. 
Heritage SC 8xlpt. Case No bid 
lnstrata 5 gallon $417 .25/2 .5 gal. 
Posterity 105 oz.jug $1,545.00/105 oz. 
Posterity Forte 1 gallon $757.05/1 gal. 
Posterity XT 5 gallon $579.40/2.S gal. 

Primo 1 gallon/10gallon tote 
$298.70/1 gal. 
$2,822.00/10 gl. LP 

Renown 5 gallon $574.25/2.S gal. 
Scimitar GC 1 quart $188.15/1 quart 
Secure 5 gallon $1,588.75/2.5 gal. 
Secure Action 5 gallon $1,673.75/2.5 gal. 

1 gallon/10gallon Link $554.15/1 gal. 
Subdue Maxx Pak $5,407.50/10 gl. LP 
Tenacity 1 gallon $798.25/1 gal. 
Trimmit 2SC 5 gallon $1,094.40/2.5 gal. 
Velista 6x22oz bottles $226.60/22 oz. btl. 
Briskway+Velista Multipak 
Oaconil Action+ Appear 2 Multipak $355.00/Multipak 
Daconil Action+Banner Maxx 2 Multipak $390.00/Multipak 
Daconil Action+Heritage Action Multipak $769.00/Multipak 
Divanem+Heritage Action Multipak $3,003.00/Multipak 
Heritage Action+Velista Multipak $1,538.00/M ultipa k 



Descri~tion-Seed Fertilizer1 Chemical Bid 

Encartis 

Navicon 

Maxtima 

Xzemplar 

Honor 

Insignia SC 

Trinity 

Emerald 

Drive XLR8 

Bayleton 

Chipco 26019 Flo 

Chipco Signature 

Compass SO wg 

Densicor 

Exteris Stressgard 

Fiata Stressgard 

Indemnify 

Merit 2F 

Proxy 

Tartan Stressgard 

Tetrino 

Talstar P 

Fame SC 

3336F 

26/36 

Torque 

Game On 

Dimension Ultra 

Quali-Pro Suprado 

Mefenoxam 2 AQ 

Pendant SC 

Nufarm TM 4.5F 

Ocean Organics Topsail 

Ocean Organics XP 5-0-0 

Primer Select 

Sixteen 90 

CP Pellets 

Hydro-Cure pellets 

Hydro-Cure Supermax pellets 

UNIT SIZE 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

11.4 oz bottle 

36Ib. Case 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

50 bag Case 

1 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

22Ib. Case 

1 lb. Bottle 

51oz. Bottle 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

17.1 fl oz. Bottle 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

1 gallon 

1 gallon 

.5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

1 gallom 

1 gallon 

8x8x5oz.Case 

1 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

2 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallons 

5 gallons 

1 Case 

1 Case 

1 Case 
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Price ~er unit 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

$80.00/0.5 gal. 

$1,385.00/2.5 gal. 

$339.60/2.S gal. 

$1,317 .04/44Ib. cs 

No bid 

$600.00/51 oz. btl. 

$286.00/2.5 gal. 

$142.38/2.5 gal. 

$1,700.00/17.1 oz. 

No bid 

$234.50/2.5 gal. 

$850.00/2.5 gal. 

$400.00/1 gal. 

No bid 

$1,356.75/0.5 gal. 

$566.60/2.S gal. 

$631.50/2.5 gal. 

$169.80/1 gal. 

$265.00/2.S gal. 

$936.00/64x5oz cs 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

$334.60/5 gal. cs. 

$323.05/5 gal. cs. 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 



DescriQtlon-Seed Fertilizer, Chemical Bid 

Emerald isle True Foliar N 

Emerald isle True Foliar P 

Emerald isle True Foliar K 

Emerald isle True Foliar NPK Plus 

Emerald isle True Foliar Si 

Emerald isle True Foliar Ca 

Emerald isle True Foliar M gMn 

Emerald isle CPR 

Emerald isle Panasea Plus 

Emerald isle Sequential Micros Complex 

Emerald isle Fairway Sequential 

12-0-0 100% Chelated 6%Fe 3% Mn with Umaxx 

Runway marking foam 

lncide Out Tank Cleaner 

Knockdown Defoamer 

20-0-20 Rapid Green Water Soluble 

Biomax 4-0-0 

N30 plus 

Verde-Cal G 

Sustane 5-2-4 

Uflexx 46-0-0 

Earthworks Renovate Plus 

Stressmaster 0-0-31 

Naturesafe 18-0-4 with 1690 

Enhanced Organics Dark Venom 

Proscape 21-22-4 with Mesotrione 

0-0-50 Micro SOP 

Title Phyte 

Cal Max Granular 

19-0-17 Micro Tru-prill Homogenous Fert. 

24-0-12 Mini Polyon with Fe 

30-0-10 Polyon with Fe 

32-0-5 .058% Acelepryn .19% Dimension 

34-0-4 Mini .058% Acelepryn .19% Dimension 

UNIT SIZE 

S gallon 

S gallon 

5 gallon 

S gallon 

S gallon 

S gallon 

S gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

S gallon 

5 gallon 

1 case 

1 case 

1 case 

25Ibs 

5 gallon 

S gallon 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

5 gallon 

50 lbs 

5 gallons 

SOlbs 

SO lbs 

5 gallon 

50 lb bag 

SO lb bag 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 
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Price Qer unit 
No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 



Descri~tion-Seed Fertilizer1 Chemical Bid 

007 Creeping Bentgrass 

Al-A4 Creeping Bentrgrass 

Luminary Bentrgrass, 

Futura Creeping Bentrgrass 

Piranha Bentgrass 

Barricuda Bentgrass 

Penncross Tee2Green Bentgrass 

Barrenburg Yellowjacket coated Perennial Rye 

Trifecta Perennial Rye 

Low Down's Bluegrass 

GLS Resistant Perenial Rye 

Northeast Rough Mix Supreme 

link's Fescue Mix 

Double Eagle Perennial Rye 

USGA Fine Greens Topdressing 

Kiln Dried USGA Fine Greens Topdressing 

USGA Spec 60-40 Sand Compost Divot mix 

HD Bunker Sand 

Green Divot mix 

3/4 process stone 

pea stone 

Stone dust 

Cart Path Material 3/8" 

Screened loam 1/4" 

UNIT SIZE 

25Ibs 

25 lbs 

25 lbs 

25Ibs 

25 lbs 

25Ibs 

25 lbs 

25Ibs 

50Ibs 

50 lbs 

S0lbs 

50 lbs 

50 lbs 

50 lbs 

50 lbs 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

50 lb bag/1pallet 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per tonJie.liltered / 
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Price Rer unit 
No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

No bid 

~-YI ... L / 
The Chas. C. Hart Seed Co. /_A~, --· _. ,. Company Name 

304 Main St. 
Address 

Wethersfield, CT 06109-1826 
Company Name 

September 10, 2021 
Date 

turf@hartseed.com 
Email 

www.HartsTurfPro.com 
Website 

i,r{Signature) 

William T. Hart 
Print Name 

President 
Title 

(860)529-2537 I (860)563-7221 
Telephone/Fax 

(860)529-2537 
24 Hour Telephone 

• 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @ 2:00 PM 

PROPOSAL (To be submitted with proposal) 

ADDENDA 
The following Ad:lenda have bean received. The modifications to fie Bid Documents noted thereii have been considered and an costs 
thereto are included in the Base Bid. 

Addenda# 

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(&) listed on the following items listed on Pages 5 - 9 of this request and certifies that 
the following proposal meets aN the specifications and cond~ions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications 
requested are clearly and completely noted. Any alternate proposals are presented In a similar format to those requested and 
are attached herein. It is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject any or all proposals. If you cannot supply a quote 
please put NA. 

AU proposed pricing shall remain be firm fixed for a period of 120 days 

Proposal of: Harrell's, LLC 
(COMPANY NAME) 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @2:00 PM 

BIO PROPOSAL FORM 

-All prices are effective 09/15/2021 * .. 

D!:!~cri11!IQ[!-Seed Ft!li!11~r1 Chimical Bi~ UNITS1i~ frlc!:! R!:!' unit 
Appear2 2 gallon S29fi no 
Banner Maxx 2 5 gallon ~'>'>ii E;n/1.!!al r< 1 , 122.50/Sgal) 
Barricade 4FL 1 gallon <:147 :m 

Daconil Action 5 gallon 1<:411 ~o 
Daconil Ultrex 20lbs <;?1.n M 

Daconil ZN 5 gallon 1c.:t"n 50 
Divanem .5 Rallon S1.3Rr;. ~Ei 
Headway 1 gallon S4C.1 1c;. 
Heritage 61b jug <:1 _gcu:, ,n 
Heritage SC 8xlpt. Case nn hld 
lnstrata S gallon ~71n Rn (?i;+ gal 0 ns) 
Posterity 105 oz. jug ~1 c;.tJ.c;. nn 
Posteritv Forte lgallon S757 ni:; 
Posterity XT 5 gallon ~11r;,n Rn 
Primo 1 gallon/10gallon tote I~., S2n nn '1na 1 ~) 
Renown 5 gallon St 14R nn 
Scimitar Ge 1 quart 1c.?nn nn 
Secure Sgallon s~ 111 c;n 
Secure Action S gallon ,(.< :til.7 c;n 

1 gallon/10gallon link 
Subdue Maxx Pak $5 407 .SO (10e: L :i) 
Tenacity 1 gallon 1~798.71; 
Trimmlt2SC 5 gallon <:, 188.80 
Velista 6x22oz bottles 1<;1 ~C.Q.60 
Briskway+Velista Multipak 1~2 379 00 
Oaconil Action+ Appear 2 Multipak 1$355.00 
Daconil Action+Banner Maxx 2 Multipak 1~390.00 
Oaconil Actlon+Herltaae Action Multipak 1S769.00 
Divanem+Heritage Action Multipak IS3 003.00 
Heritage Action+Velis:a Multipak 1s1 s3s.oo 



OPscrintion-~ed Fertilizer Chemical Bid 

Encartis 

Navicon 

Maxtima 

Xzemplar 

Honor 

Insignia SC 

Trinity 

Emerald 

Drive XLRB 

Bayleton 

Chipco 26019 Flo 

Chlpco Signature 

Compass SO wg 

Densicor 

Exteris StressRard 

Fiata Stressgard 

Indemnify 

Merit 2F 

Proxy 

Tartan Stressgard 

Tetrino 

Talstar P 

Fame SC 

3336F 

26/36 

Torque 

Game On 

Dimension Ultra 

Quali-Pro Suprado 

Mefenoxam 2 AQ 

Pendant SC 

Nufarm TM 4.SF 

Ocean Organics Topsail 

Ocean Organics XP 5-0-0 

Primer Select 

Sixteen 90 

CP Pellets 

Hvdro-Cure pellets 

Hydro-Cure Supermax pellets 

UNl!Sl~E 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

11.4 oz bottle 

361b. Case 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

50 baRCase 
lgallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

221b. Case 

1 lb. Bottle 

51oz. Bottle 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

17.1 fl oz. Bottle 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

1 gallon 

1 gallon 

.5 gallon 

5 gallon 

S gallon 

lgallom 

1 gallon 

8x8x5oz.Case 

lgallon 

2.5 gallon 

2gallon 

5 gallon 

Sgallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallons 

5 gallons 

l Case 

1 Case 

1 Case 

TOIWI ofTrumbull 
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Pelee l!!~C unit 

ssso.oo 
$3,700.00 
S3 950.00 
$171.00 
54176.00 
53.110.00 
no bid 
$4,630.50 
no bid 
52 770.00 
5~29.36 
51 238.00 (4xlU 
no bid 
5600.00 
5572.00 
S284.76 
51 7nn.oo 
5263.46 (Mallet 2F) 
51g7Jt6 
s1 550.00 
S400 nn 
575.00 
no bid ~~,c. nn 
~6~1.sn 
s14onn 
~6nnn 
SQ~6.00 
no bid 
no hid 
nn hirl 

nn hid 
nobjd 
no hi..4 

no hirl 
c.~i;n nn IHv ~- O) 
c.:tnn nn 
c::mn nn 
~~nn nn 



D~g:Jg1J2n~ed Fe[!iliz~r, Chemi~I Bid 

Emerald isle True Foliar N 

Emerald isle True Foliar P 

Emerald isle True Foliar K 

Emerald isle True Foliar NPK Plus 

Emerald Isle True Foliar Si 

Emerald isle True Foliar Ca 

Emerald isle True Foliar MgMn 

Emerald Isle CPR 

Emerald isle Panasea Plus 

Emerald isle Sequential Micros Complex 

Emerald isle Fairway Seauential 

12-0-0 100% Chelated 6%Fe 3% Mn wlth Umaxx 

Runway marking foam 

lncide Out Tank Cleaner 

Knockdown Defoamer 

20-0-20 Rapid Green Water Soluble 

Biomax 4-0-0 

N30 plus 

Verde-Cal G 

Sustane 5-2-4 

Uflexx 46-0-0 

Earthworks Renovate Plus 

Stressmaster 0-0-31 

Naturesafe 18-0-4 with 1690 

Enhanced Organics Dark Venom 

Proscape 21-22·4 with Mesotrione 

0-0-50 Micro SOP 

Title Phyte 

Cal Max Granular 

19-0-17 Micro Tru-prill Homogenous Fert. 

24-0-12 Mini Polyon with Fe 

30-0-10 Polyon with Fe 

32-0-5 .058% Acelepryn .19% Dimension 

34-0-4 Mini .058% Acelepryn .19% Dimension 

UN!I~IZE 
5 gallon 

5 gallon 

S gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

S gallon 

5 gallon 

1 case 

1 case 

1 case 

25 lbs 

5gallon 

5 gallon 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

50 lbs 

5 gallon 

50 lbs 

5 gallons 

SOlbs 

SO lbs 

Sgallon 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 

Town of Trumbul 
Bk16430 ON CAI.I. Services F81tiizw, Seed, Pesticides 
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Prfi;e I!~[ ynil 

no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no hirl 

no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
~100.00 
S240.00 
S240.00 
S300.00 
S40.00 
$350.00 
$130.00 
$25.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
$45.00 
$250.00 
$17.50 
$70.00 
sso.oo 
$40.00 
$75.00 
590.00 



D11g:lgtl5m-se~ fertllj~er, !;;hemlgl §I~ 

007 Creeping Bentgrass 

Al-A4 Creeping Bentrgrass 

luminary Bentrgrass 

Futura Creeping Bentrgrass 

Piranha Bentgrass 

Barricuda Bentgrass 

Penncross Tee2Green Bentgrass 

Barrenburg Yellowjacket coated Perennial Rye 

Trifecta Perennial Rye Bentgrass 
Low Down's BlueRrass 

GLS Resistant Perenial Rye 

Northeast Rough Mix Supreme 

Link's Fescue Mix 

Double Eagle Perenrial Rye 

USGA Fine Greens Topdressing 

Kiln Dried USGA Fine Greens Topdressing 

USGA Spec 60-40 Sand Compost Divot mix 

HD Bunker Sand 

Green Divot mix 

3/4 process stone 

pea stone 

Stone dust 

Cart Path Material 3i8" 

Screened Loam 1/4" 

Harrell's, LLC 
Company Name 

5105 New Tam~a HWY 
Address 

Lakeland1 FL 33815 
Company Name 

9/9/2021 
Date 

Bids@Harrells.com 
Email 

www.Harrells.com 
Weooi1e 

UNIT~IZE 

25 lbs 

251bs 

25 lbs 

25 lbs 

25 lbs 

25 lbs 

251bs 

2Slbs 

SO lbs 

50 lbs 

SOlbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

50 lbs 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

SO lb bag/lpallet 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

~~ 
By ( Signature) 

Ella Kimbrel 
Print Name 

Sr. VP/HR 
Title 

800-282-8007 
Telephone/Fax 

860-930-8888 
24 Hour Taephone 

Town ofT r001bu~ 
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Pri~e (!er ynlt 

no bin 
~1i;. nn /1 lh 

nn hid 
~R nn /1 lb - Tri' p eta Blend 
~,.., nn /1 lb 
Sn nn/1 lb 
~q_no /1 lb 
no hirl 
~st 00 /1 lb - Trif ~, eta Blend 
~4.nn /1 lb 
~2.75 /1 lb 
~~.60 /1 lb 
53 75 /1 lb 
no bid 
no hid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
no bid 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 8430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @2:00 PM 

PROPOSAL (To be submitted with proposal) 

ADDENDA 
The following Addenda have been received. The modlftcaUons to the Bid Documents noted therein have been considered and all costs 
thereto are Included In the Base Bid. 

Addenda# 

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) listed on the foltowing Items (isled on Pages 5 - 9 of this request and certifies lhat 
the following proposal meets all the specifications and conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications 
requested are clearly and completely noted. Any alternate proposals are presented in a similar format to those requested and 
are attached herein. It is understood that the own reserves the right to reject any or all proposals. If you cannot supply a quote 
please put NA 

AU proposed pricing shall remain be flnn fixed for a period of __ 2~~(..,.1..,t,,.__ 
I 

Proposal of: vJ tt-~f a/lf.fl<f'fi.(<.. tvllf ?,,Mf)Lc1 we_. 
(COMPANY NAME) rr- I t 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @2:00 PM 

BID PROPOSAL FORM 

... All prices are effective 09/15/2021 ... 

Descrhrtlon-Seed Fertlllzer1 Chemical Bid UNIT SIZE 

Appear2 

Banner Maxx 2 

Barrlcade 4FL 

Daconll Action 

Daconll Ultrex 

Daconll ZN 

Divanem 

Headway 

Heritage 

Heritage SC 

lnstrata 

Posterity 

Posterity Forte 

Posterity XT 

Primo 

Renown 

SCimltarGC 

Secure 

Secure Action 

Subdue Maxx 
Tenacity 

Trlmmtt2SC 

Vellsta 

Brlskwav+Vellsta 

Daconil Action+ Appear 2 

Daconi1 Action+Banner Maxx 2 

Daconil Action+Heritage Action 

Divanem+Herltage Action 

Heritage Actlon+Vellsta 

II 

2 gallon 

Sgallon 

1 gallon 

5 gallon 

201bs 

S gallon 

.5 gallon 

1 gallon 

61b jug 

Bxlpt. Case 

Sgallon 

105 oz. Jug 

l gallon 

S gallon 

l gallon/10gallon tote 

S gallon 

l quart 

S gallon 

S gallon 
l gallon/10gallon Link 

Pak 

l gallon 

5 gallon 

6x22oz bottles 

Multlpak 

Mu1tlpak 

Multipak 

Multipak 

Multlpak 

Multipak 

WESTCHESTER TURF SUPPLY 
Serving The Fine Turf Profession 

P.O. Box 198 Llncolndale, NY 10540 
Office (845) 621-5067 FaK (845) 621-7180 

Price !:!er unit 
jp,Ze,t,•vo 
.t t( z.z,so 
., 147• .3c:, 
.-1 1 4f1 ' ZS 
~ 2 ~ ,<,O 

• I> ;~W) · r,o 

' ( :~~-3~ 
~ 45f , lb 

I. 'f 't 6 ' z_c 

,d 546· '1° 
◄., R_34,sc. 
• I 545-c0 
£tL '-1s1•<r> 
~ 1,156'-u; 

U1..'l9.•10 /J ~"'" 
~ t 14-B'"Go 

C I "I CJ • '-l:? 

! ~. i-11·~0 

.~ ·~ ._:z..4 7 'S:o 

&s~~ ,,s/4s-"° · 
tb11R'-£' I 
4~ 7 l~A • 7.l 

4' ( 3..5"C, • 61:1 

) ·2 I 3·1ci• CO 

~· , ~55•'-"" 
,!, I 3 '10" l,"V!) 

n 1/d,',i •<>O 
1 3, 00_ ~ I c\4:1 

..: t ,S-38 ,CQ 

II 



Descrl~tion-Seed Fertlllzer1 Chemlcat Bid UNIT SIZE 

Encartis 

Navlcon 
Maxtlma 

Xzemplar 

Honor 

Insignia SC 
Trinity 

Emerald 
DriveXLR8 

Bayleton 

Chlpco 26019 Flo 

Chioco Signature 

Compass 50 wg 
Densicor 

Exterls Stressgard 

Fiata Stressgard 
Indemnify 

Merit2F 
Proxy 

Tartan Stressgard 
Tetrino 

Talstar P 

Farnese 

3336F 

26/36 

Torque 

Game On 
Dimension Ultra 

Quall-Pro Suprado 

Mefenoxam 2 AQ. 

Pendant SC 
Nufarm TM 4.SF 

Ocean Organics Topsail 

Ocean Organics XP 5-0-0 

Primer Select 

Sixteen90 

CP Pellets 

Hydro-Cure pellets 
Hydro-Cure Supermax pellets 

II 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 1tallon 

11.4 oz bottle 
36Ib. Case 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

50 bag Case 

l gallon 
Sgallon 

5 gallon 

22Ib. Case 

l lb. Bottle 

51oz. Bottle 

S gallon 

Sgallon 
17.1 fl oz. Bottle 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

Sgallon 

1 gallon 
1 gallon 

.5 gallon 

s gallon 

5 gallon 

l gallom 

1 gallon 

8x8x5oz.Case 
l gallon 

2.S gallon 
2 gallon 

5 gallon 
5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallons 
5 gallons 

1 Case 

1 Case 

1 Case 

WESTCHESTER TURF SUPPLY 
Serving The Fine Turf Profession 

P.O. Box 198 Lincolndale, NY 10540 
Office (845) 621-5067 Fax (845) 621•7180 

Town ofTrumbuD 
Bid 6430 ON CAl1 Selvlces Fer111zar, Seed, Pesllcld8s 

Page8of 10 

Price ~er unit 

·-

. 

,<Ii, 7 00' ~ - --
~ D ,40S•OO 
.:~ ~a, •tJD 

_c,l.i, ,"'Z,("yy':¢ 

.4b I i 0d ,ce, 

$ 1 mm·<"" 
• . 

1 400-00 

II 



DescrlDtlon-Seed Fertlllzer1 Cbemfcal Bid 

Emerald Isle True Follar N 

Emerald Isle True Foliar P 
Emerald Isle True Foliar K 

Emerald isle True Foliar NPK Plus 
Emerald isle True Foliar Si 
Emerald isle True Foliar ca 
Emerald Isle True Foliar MgMn 

Emerald Isle CPR 

Emerald Jsle Panasea Plus 

Emerald isle Sequential Micros Complex 

Emerald Isle Fairway Sequential 

12-0-0 100% Chelated 6%Fe 3% Mn with Umaxx 
Runway marking foam 

lnclde Out Tank Cleaner 
Knockdown Defoamer 

20-0-20 Rapid Green Water Soluble 
Blomax 4-0-0 

N30 plus 
Verde-Cal G 

Sustane 5-2-4 
Uflexx 46-0-0 

Earthworks Renovate Plus 
Stressmaster 0-0-31 

Naturesafe 18-0-4 with 1690 
Enhanced Organics Dark Venom 

Proscape 21-22-4 with Mesotrione 
0-0-50 Micro SOP 

Title Phyte 

Cal Max Granular 
19-0-17 Micro Tru-prill Homogenous Fert. 

24-0-12 Mini Polyon with Fe 
30-0-10 Polyon with Fe 

32-0-5 .058% Acelepryn ,19% Dimension 
34-0-4 Mini .058% Acelepryn .19% Dimension 

UNITSIZE 

5 gallon 

5 e:allon 
5 11:allon 

5 gallon 

5 sallon 
5 gallon 

Sgallon 

5 gallon 

S gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

1 case 

1 case 
1 case 

2Slbs 
Sgallon 

Sgallon 
SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 
5 gallon 

SO lbs 
5 gallons 

SOlbs 
SO lbs 

5 gallon 

50 lb bag 

SO lb ba11: 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 
so lb bag 

50 lb bag 

Town ofTrumbua 
Bid 8430 ON CALL Services Fertllzer, Seed, PesUclde1 

Page 70110 

Price ~r unit 
., 

-

-- ---- --
..:ii, 7ts·00 

..ft 1JJO'l'O 
.-¥» 250•-.>I> 

-

-

-

II Serving The Fine Turf Profession 
WESTCHESTER TURF SUPPLY II 

P.O. Box 198 Lincolndale. NY 10540 
Office (845) 621-5067 Fax (845) 621-7180 



Dest[IHIIRD•lged fertlllzgr:.. ~bi:ml,RI Bid 
007 Creepln11 Bentgrass 

A1-A4 Cree0ln1 Bentrgrass 
luminary Bentrgrass 

Futura Creeping Bentrgrass 

Piranha Bentgrass 

Barrlcuda Bentgrass 

Penncross Tee2Green Bentgrass 

Barrenburg Yellowjacket coated Perennial Rye 
Trlfecta Perennial Rve 

low Down's Bluegrass 

GI.S Resistant Perenlal Rye 

Northeast Rough Mix Supreme 
link's Fescue Mix 

Double Eagle Perennial Rye 

USGA Fine Greens Topdressing 

KIin Dried USGA Fine Greens Topdressing 

USGA Spec 60-40 Sand Compost Divot mix 
HD Bunker Sand 

Green Divot mix 

3/4 process stone 
pea stone 

Stone dust 

Cart Path Material 3/8" 

Screened loam 1/4" 

Company Name 

WllfUdl,l'EA 11JRf SUPPLY, 1NO. 
11.0 801198 

Company Name 

1/2s/zc1ZJ 
Dale / l 

3o.iW£6rr11tF(!}tont~1Js1. N~r 
Enwlll 

Ufl!IISIZE 
25Ibs 

25Ibs 
25 lbs 

25 lbs 

25 lbs 
25 lbs 

25Ibs 

25Ibs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SOlbs 

50 lbs 
SO lbs 

SO lbs 
50Ibs 

per ton delivered 
per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 
50 lb bag/lpallet 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 
per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delfvered 

Town orTnmbuN 
Bid 6430 ON CALL Services Farlltar, Seed, Ptslicldea 

Page8 ol 10 

Price I!!!' YDlt 

. 

. 

-
. 

dl ~ ,9<=J L8 

:\i. 2JfO l...S. 

-

' 

. ' 
. 

. 

~ ti" -f/J_ -?---~ ---
By (Signature) I V 

f<o/34-1<.r /II L. i'ffllh11AI 
Print Name 

Telephone/Fax 

24 Hour Telephone 

WESTCHESTER TURF SUPPLY 
Serving The Fine Turf Profession 

P.O. Box 198 Lincolndale, NY 10540 
Office (845) 621-5067 Fax (845) 621-7180 II 





Town of Trumbull 
Bid 6430 ON CALL Services Fertilizer, Seed, Pesllcldes 

Page4of 10 

TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
T ASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @2:00 PM 

PROPOSAL (To be submitted with proposal} 

ADDENDA 
The following Addenda have been received. The modifications to the 81d Documents noted therein have been considered and all costs 
thereto are Included in the Base Bid. 

Addenda# 

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) listed on the following Items listed on Pages 5 - 9 of this request and certifies that 
the following proposal meets all the specmcaHons and conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications 
requested are clearly and completely noted. Any alternate proposals are presented in a similar format to those requested and 
are attached herein. lt is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject any or all proposals. If you cannot supply a quote 
please put NA. 

All proposed pricing shall remain be firm fixed for a period of 

Proposal ot 



Town ofTrumbull 
Bid 6430 ON CALL Services Fertlllzer, Seed, Pesllcldes 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @ 2:00 PM 

BIO PROPOSAL FORM 

--An prices are effective 09/15/2021 ttt 

Descri~tion-Seed Fertilizer1 Chemical Bld UNIT SIZE Price ~er unit 
Appear 2 2gallon NA 
Banner Maxx 2 5 gallon I 

Barricade 4FL 1 gallon 

Oaconil Action 5 gallon 
Daconil Ultrex 20 lbs 
Daconil ZN 5 gallon 
Divanem .5 gallon 
Headway 1 gallon 
Heritage 61b jug 
Heritage SC 8xlpt. Case 
lnstrata 5 gallon 
Posterity 105 oz. jug 
Posterity Forte 1 gallon 
Posterity XT 5 gallon 
Primo 1 gallon/lOgallon tote 
Renown 5 gallon 
ScimitarGC 1 quart 
Secure 5 gallon 
Secure Action 5 gallon 

Subdue Maxx 
1 gallon/lOgallon Link 
Pak 

Tenacity 1 gallon 
Trimmit 2SC 5 ga llon 
Velista 6x22oz bottles 
Briskway+Velista Mult ipak 

Daconil Action+ Appear 2 Multipak 
Daconil Action+Banner Maxx 2 Mult lpak 

Daconil Action+Heritage Action Multipak 
Divanem+Heritage Action Multipak / 
Heritage Actlon+Velista Multipak \" 



gescriRtlon-Seed Fertfllzer, Ch~mlcal Bid 

Encartls 

Navicon 
Maxtlma 

Xzemplar 

Honor 

Insignia SC 
Trinity 

Emerald 

Drive XLR8 

Bavleton 

Chlpco 26019 Flo 

Chlpco Signature 

Compass 50 wg 

Densicor 

Exteris Stressgard 
Fiata Stressgard 

Indemnify 

Merit 2F 

Proxy 

Tartan Stressgard 

Tetrino 

Talstar P 

Fame SC 

3336F 

26/36 

Torque 

Game On 

Dimension Ultra 

Quali-Pro Suprado 

Mefenoxam 2 AQ 

Pendant SC 

Nufarm TM 4.SF 
Ocean Organics Topsall 

Ocean Organics XP 5-0-0 

Primer Select 

Sixteen 90 

CP Pellets 

Hydro-Cure pellets 

Hydro-Cure Supermax pellets 

UNIT SIZE 

2.5 aallon 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

11.4 oz bottle 

361b. Case 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

so bag Case 

1 gallon 

5 itallon 

Saallon 

221b. Case 

1 lb. Bottle 

51oz. Bottle 

5 eallon 

5 gallon 

17.1 fl oz. Bottle 

5 aallon 

S gallon 

5 gallon 

1 aallon 

1 aallon 

.5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 izallon 

lgaltom 

1 gallon 

8x8x5oz.Case 

1 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

2 gallon 

5 gallon 
5 gallon 

5 gallon 

s gallons 

5 litallons 
1 Case 

1 Case 

1 Case 

TownofTnmbull 
Bid 6430 ON CALL ServiceS Fertilizer, Seed, Pesticides 

Page6 of 10 

Price eer unit 

HI) 

~ ~/ 

l t'JotJ. oa 
7t2(J, 111 

Al /l 
A.Id 

Z.1.7 d r) 
1.<-J-. S-o 
~' 2.. i-l) 

/2' ~ 
,/'/J. 
/'II~ 



Descrietion-Seed Fertilizer1 Chemical Bid 

Emerald isle True Foliar N 

Emerald Isle True Foliar P 

Emerald isle True Foliar K 

Emerald isle True Foliar NPK Plus 

Emerald isle True Foliar SI 

Emerald Isle True Foliar Ca 

Emerald isle True Foliar MgMn 

Emerald isle CPR 

Emerald Isle Panasea Plus 

Emerald isle Sequential Micros Complex 

Emerald Isle Fairway Sequential 

12--0-0 100% Chelated 6%Fe 3% Mn with Umaxx 

Runway marking foam 

lnclde Out Tank Cleaner 
Knockdown Defoamer 

20-0-20 Rapid Green Water Soluble 

Bio max 4-0-0 
N30 plus 

Verde-Cal G 

Sustane 5-2-4 

Uflexx 46-0-0 

Earthworks Renovate Plus 
Stressmaster 0--0-31 

Naturesafe 18-0-4 with 1690 

Enhanced Organics Dark Venom 

Proscape 21-22-4 with Mesotrione 
0-0-50 Micro SOP 

Tltle Phyte 

Cal Max Granular 

19-0-17 Micro Tru-prlll Homogenous Fert. 

24-0-12 Mini Polyon with Fe 

30-0-10 Polyon with Fe 

32-0~5 .058% Acelepryn .19% Dimension 

34-0-4 Mini .0S8%Acelepryn .19% Dimension 

UNIT SIZE 
Sgallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

S gallon 

5 gallon 

s gallon 

S gallon 

S gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

1 case 

1 case 
1 case 

251bs 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

50 lbs 

5 gallon 

50 lbs 

5 gallons 

SOlbs 

SO lbs 

5 gallon 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 
50 lb bag 

SO lb bag 
50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 

Town ofTrumbull 
Bid 6430 ON CALL Services FerUllzer, Seed, Peslicldes 

Page 7 of 10 

Price eer unit 

/9'..5. 00 
Zoo. oa 
Z-fO, OtJ 
1-.iS-;' (Jl} 

2.2t), 01 
N/3 

2.2S;()I) 
2 </O, dtJ 
~)/J, <JO 
ts1J:;::dO ,A/JJ 
IJ--(). QI 

AA 

/ ,, 



Descri~tlon-Seed Fertlllzeri Chemical Bid 

007 Creeping Bentgrass 

A1-A4 Creeping Bentrgrass 

Luminary Bentrgrass 

Futura Creeping Bentrgrass 

Piranha Bentgrass 

Barricuda Bentgrass 

Penncross Tee2Green Bentgrass 

Barrenburg Yellowjacket coated Perennial Rye 
Trifecta Perennial Rye 

Low Down's Bluegrass 

GLS Resistant Perenial Rye 

Northeast Rough Mix Supreme 

Link's Fescue Mix 

Double Eagle Perennial Rye 

USGA Fine Greens Topdressing 

Kiln Dried USGA Fine G·eens Topdressing 

USGA Spec 60-40 Sand Compost Divot mix 
HD Bunker Sand 

Green Divot mix 

3/4 process stone 

pea stone 

Stone dust 

Cart Path Material 3/8" 

Screened Loam 1/4" 

UNIT SIZE 
25Ibs 

2Slbs 

2Slbs 

25 lbs 

251bs 

251bs 

251bs 

2Slbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SOlbs 

50 lbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

50 lb bag/lpallet 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

By (Signature) 

Town ofT rumbull 
Bid 643D ON CAU. Services Fertiizsr, Seed, Pestk:ldes 

Pege8of 1D 

Price ger ynlt 

NA 
j 

1 

t 

'vi 
V 

/res)IM ,,eel ~.JteJ1%,,; ,Aly ~J (l~l.&' 
Add / Print Name 

Jv,N'll-(v ~4:-P~ S'tt-~J' /vf 'll\ltlj~g 
&~~~ , ~ 

t/,/2,1 
Dale Telephone/Fax 

24 Hour Telephone 

Website 



• 
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I Town omumbutl 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @2:00 PM 

PROPOSAL (To be submitted with proposaf 

ADDENDA 
The following Addenda have been received. The modifications to the Bid Documents noted therein have been oonsidered and al oosts 
thereto are included In the Base Bid. 

Addenda# 

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) llsted on the followlng Items listed on Pages 5 - 9 of this request and certifies that 
the followlng proposal meets a» the specifications and conditions requested herein. Any substiluUons to the specifications 
requested are clearly and completely noted. MY alternate proposals are presented in a similar format to those requested and 
are attached herein. It Is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject any or all proposals. If you cannot supply a quote 
please put NA. 

All proposed pricing shall remain be firm fixed for a period of (2( V..t'. 4./t!_.1 
7 

Proposal of: £?<Le~ /.;te_ 7::1(£ /4~ ~ 7J, 
(COMPANY NAME) 



TO'Ml olTrumbul 
Bid 6430 ON CALL SeM:es Ferttllzer, Seed, Pesdckles 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BIO NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @ 2:00 PM 

BID PROPOSAL FORM 

-An pricaa are effective 09/15/2021 -

De!crl~tiQn-Seed Fealliz!:r1 ~bemlcgl Bid UNIT SIZE Prl~ Q§r YDlt 

Appear 2 2 gallon NA -
Banner Maxx 2 5 gallon , 
Barricade 4FL 1 gallon 

Daconil Action S gallon 

Daconll Ultrex 20 lbs 

Daconil ZN 5 gallon 

Dlvanem .Sgallon 

Headway 1 gallon 

Heritage Gib Jug 
Heritage SC 8xlpt. Case 

lnstrata 5 gallon 

Posterity 105 oz. Jug 
Posterity Forte 1 gallon 

Posterity XT 5 gallon 

Primo 1 gallon/lOgallon tote 

Renown 5 gallon 

ScimltarGC l quart 

Secure 5 gallon 

Secure Action 5 gallon 
1 gallon/10gallon Link 

Subdue Maxx Pak 
Tenacity 1 gallon 

Trimmlt 2SC 5 gallon 

Velista 6x22oz bottles 

Briskway+Vellsta Multlpak 

Daconil Action+ Appear 2 Multipak 

Oaconil Action+Banner Maxx 2 Multipak 

Daconll Action+Herltage Action Multipak I 
Olvanem+Heritage Action Multlpak ' I/ Heritage Action+Velista Multipak I 



Descrll!tion-Sead Ftrtilizer1 Chemical ~Id 

Encartis 

Navicon 

Maxtima 

Xzemplar 

Honor 

Insignia SC 

Trinity 

Emerald 
Drive XLRS 

Bayleton 

Chipco 26019 Flo 

Chlpco Signature 
Compass 50 wg 

Denslcor 

Exterls Stressgard 
Flata Stressgard 

Indemnify 

Merit 2F 

Proxy 

Tartan Stressgard 

Tetrino 

Talstar P 

Fame SC 

3336F 

26/36 
Torque 

Game On 

Dimension Ultra 

Quall-Pro Suprado 

Mefenoxam 2 AQ 

Pendant SC 

Nufarm TM 4.SF 

Ocean Organics Topsail 
Ocean Organics XP 5-0-0 

Primer Select 

Sixteen 90 

CP Pellets 

Hydro-Cure pellets 

Hydro-Cure Supermax pellets 

!JNITSIZE 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 
11.4 oz bottle 

36Ib. Case 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

50 bag Case 
1 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

22Ib. Case 

l lb. Bottle 

51oz. Bottle 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

17.1 fl oz. Bottle 

5 gallon 

Sgallon 

Sgallon 

1 gallon 
1 gallon 

.5 gallon 

5 gallon 

S gallon 

lgallom 

1 gallon 

8x8x5oz. Case 
1 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

2 gallon 

5 gallon 
5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallons 

5 gallons 

1 Case 

1 Case 

1 Case 

TOM\ of T llllllbul 
Bid 6430 ON CALL Services Fertilizer, Seed, Pesticides 

Page6of 10 

Price i;ier unit 

/Jf'J.. 
I 

,, 

/ 
\V 



D11iSi[iQ1lo!]-~ee~ Fe~ill1.1r1 Chemical Bid 
Emerald isle True Foliar N 

Emerald Isle True Foliar P 

Emerald Isle True Foliar K 

Emerald Isle True Foliar NPK Plus 

Emerald isle True Foliar SI 

Emerald Isle True Foliar Ca 

Emerald Isle True Foliar MgMn 

Emerald Isle CPR 

Emerald isle Panasea Plus 

Emerald isle SeQuentlal Micros Complex 

Emerald Isle Fairway Sequential 
12-0-0 100% Chelated 6%Fe 3% Mn with Umaxx 

Runway marking foam 

lncide Out Tank Cleaner 

Knockdown Defoamer 
20-0-20 Rapid Green Water Soluble 

Blomax 4-0-0 

N30 plus 
Verde-Cal G 

Sustane 5-2-4 

Uflexx 46-0-0 

Earthworks Renovate Plus 
Stressmaster 0-0-31 

Naturesafe 18-0-4 with 1690 

Enhanced Organics Dark Venom 

Proscape 21-22-4 with Mesotrfone 

0-0-50 Micro SOP 

Title Phyte 

Cal Max Granular 

19-0-17 Micro Tru-prill Homogenous Fert. 

24-0-12 Mini Polyon with Fe 

30-0-10 Polyon with Fe 

32-0-5 .058% Aceleprvn .19% Dimension 

34-0-4 Mini .058% Acelepryn .19% Dimension 

!,l~IT~IZ~ 
5 gallon 

5 gallon 
5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 
5 gallon 

S gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

1 case 

1 case 

1 case 

25 lbs 
S gallon 

s gallon 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 
50 lbs 

5 gallon 

50 lbs 

5 gallons 

S0lbs 

50 lbs 

5 gallon 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 
50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 

Town of T rumbuN 
Bid 6430 ON CALL Services Fartllizer, Seed, Peslicides 

Page 7 ol 10 

Pric1 E!!r unit 

N~ 

/ , 
II/? <. tJ() 

AJ/1.. 

I 

"'( 



De~ccjiglQD-~i:ed Fertilizer, Chemlcgl Bi~ 

007 Creeping Bentgrass 
A1-A4 Creeping Bentrgrass 

Luminary Bentrgrass 

Futura Creeping Bentrgrass 

Piranha Bentgrass 

Barricuda Bentgrass 

Penncross Tee2Green Bentgrass 

Barrenburg Yellowjacket coated Perennial Rye 

Trifecta Perennial Rye 

Low Down's Bluegrass 

GLS Resistant Perenlal Rye 

Northeast Rough Mix Supreme 

Link's Fescue Mix 

Double Eagle Perennial Rye 

USGA Fine Greens Topdressing 

Kiln Dried USGA Fine Greens Topdressing 

USGA Spec 60-40 Sand Compost Divot mix 

HD Bunker Sand 

Green Divot mix 

3/4 process stone 
pea stone 

Stone dust 

Cart Path Material 3/8" 

Screened Loam 1/4" 

Address 

1l A~J..r ·ve r...gr /,fn clu.tLfl € 
Email (§µ ~l 1L' t!AJM 

Website 

UNIT SIZE 

25 lbs 

2Slbs 

2Slbs 

2Sibs 

25 lbs 
25 lbs 

25lbs 

2Slbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SOlbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

50 lbs 

50 lbs 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

50 lb bag/lpallet 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 
per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

Print Name 

T e!ephone/'F ax 

Town olTnrmbull 
Bkl 6430 ON CALL Services Fertilizer, Seed, Pesticides 

Page8of10 

Price e!lr unit 

/II!, 

,/ 
I 

:Zo3- '{fl- t)f'f1 
24 Hour Telephne 



-



Town of T rumbul 
Bid 6430 ON CALL Services Fertilizer, Seed, Pesticides 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS ORIGINAL 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @ 2:00 PM 

PROPOSAL (To be submitted with proposal} 

ADDENDA 
The following Addenda have been received. The modifications to the Bfd Documents noted therein have been considered and all costs 
thereto are included in the Base Bid. 

Addenda# 

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) listed on the following items listed on Pages 5 - 9 of this request and certifies that 
the following proposal meets all the specifications and conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications 
requested are dearly and completely noted. Any alternate proposals are presented in a similar format to those requested and 
are attached herein. It is 1111derstood that the Town reserves the right to reject any or all proposals. If yoo cannot supply a quote 
please put NA. 

All proposed pricing shall remain be firm fixed for a period of __ ___.c2........,~--;/IILIPo,fJ -m 1)b.Jl~~Cc,ur 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @2:00 PM 

BID PROPOSAL FORM 

.. *All prices are effective 09/15/2021 * .. 

DescrlRtlon-Seed Feail[zer1 Cbemic~I Bid UNIT SIZE 

Appear2 2 gallon 

Banner Maxx 2 5 gallon 

Barricade 4FL lgallon 

Daconil Action S gallon 

Daconil Ultrex 20 lbs 

Daconll ZN S gallon 

Divanem . 5 gallon 

Headway 1 gallon 

Heritage 61b Jug 

Heritage SC 8x1pt. Case 

lnstrata 5 gallori 

Posterity 105 oz. Jug 

Posterity Forte 1 gallon 

Posterity XT 5 gallon 

Primo 1 gallon/l0gallon tote 

Renown 5 gallon 

Scimitar GC 1 quart 

Secure 5 gallon 

Secure Action 5 gallon 
1 gallon/l0gallon Link 

Subdue Maxx Pak 

Tenacity 1 gallon 

Trimmit2SC 5 gallon 

Velista 6x22oz bottles 

Brlskway+Velista Multipak 

Daconil Action+ Appear 2 Multipak 

Daconil Action+Banner Maxx 2 Multipak 

Daconil Action+Heritage Action Multipak 

Oivanem+Heritage Action Multipak 

Heritage Action+Velista Multipak 

Price ~er unit 

Alo P.>1 cl 
A/<1~,d 

l '/7,.JO( ~ttL', ) 
'111 .)_{. (;,A-A •' 

Dt;,o .c,ofAt. aA~.) 
1,0 . .fO { A£~- n.! 

i'io I!:.,' ti r 

, . 

. '-Is·,_ ,s-/,11- .... _ \ 
.l OS'i .Od(A-c"A 

V ;-1 R ;'--;J 
ffl'I s-o( Jk,_, 
Alu .I>: a 
Ala (3.' ./ 
Alu (},," 

u , 

, .... , 

) 

) 

.J'JI. 7o I .2 iJ.o . 
I, IYf1 ~ (_A1v,, ~ 

# /98'".~ol!A. 
,-

Po '{J.-rJ 
~ 'l 1./? so( Ac-,~ h(. 

;~i/ Ir" I~ 1./0i 

I 

l 
7'iT.J.'n 'Av .. 

.:J J8'¥ }(,,,{A~oA 
I 

LI. 

J <<9 lno/A~ 
I ., 

, JI c, ~ti -

,./..J.J ~/£, 
.Al i <?. id 
JJ~ Gi d 

,A)fJ Bui 
Ah rJ,rJ 



DescrlRtion-Seed Fertlllzer, Chemical Bid UNIT SIZE 
Encartis 2.5 gallon 

Navlcon 2.5 gallon 

Maxtima 2.5 gallon 

Xzemplar 11.4 oz bottle 

Honor 36Ib. Case 

Insignia SC 2.5 gallon 

Trinity 2.Sgallon 

Emerald SO bag Case 

Drive XLR8 1 gallon 

Bayleton 5 gallon 

Chlpco 26019 Flo S gallon 

Chipco Signature 22Ib-. Case 

Compass 50 wg 1 lb. Bottle 

Densicor 51oz. Bottle 

Exteris Stressgard 5 gallon 

FiataStressgard 5 gallon 

Indemnify 17.1 fl oz. Bottle 

Merit 2F 5 gallon 

Proxy 5 gallon 

Tartan Stressgard Sgallon 

Tetrino 1 gallon 

Talstar P 1 gallon 

Fame SC .5 gallon 

3336F 5 gallon 

26/36 Sgallon 

Torque 1 gallom 
Game On 1 gallon 

Dimension Ultra 8x8x5oz. Case 

Quali-Pro Suprado 1 gallon 

Mefenoxam 2 AQ 2.5 gallon · 

Pendant SC 2 gallon 

Nufarm TM 4.SF 5 gallon 

Ocean Organics Topsail 5 gallon 

Ocean Organics XP 5-0-0 Sgallon 

Primer Select 5 gallons 

Sixteen 90 5 gallons 

CP Pellets 1 Case 

Hydro-Cure pellets 1 Case 

Hydro-Cure Supermax pellets 1 Case 

Town ofTrumooll 
Bid 6430 ON CALL Services Fertilizer, Seed, Pesticides 
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Price ~er unit 
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Oescrlgtlon-Seed Fertlllzer1 Chemical Bid UNITSIZ~ 

Emerald isle True Foliar N S gallon 

Emerald isle True Foliar P S gallon 

Emerald Isle True Foliar K S gallon 

Emerald isle True Foliar NPK Plus S gallon 

Emerald isle True Foliar Si 5 gallon 

Emerald Isle True Foliar Ca S gallon 

Emerald isle True Foliar MgMn S gallon 

Emerald Isle CPR 5 gallon 

Emerald isle Panasea Plus 5 gallon 

Emerald isle Sequential Micros Com~ex 5 gallon 

Emerald isle Fairway Sequential Sgallon 

12-0-0 100% Chelated 6%Fe 3% Mn with Umaxx 5 gallon 

Runway marking foam 1 case 

lncide Out Tank Cleaner 1 case 

Knockdown Defoamer 1 case 

20-0-20 Rapid Green Water Soluble 25 lbs 

Biomax 4-0-0 S gallon 

N30 plus 5 gallon 

Verde-Cal G SO lbs 

Sustane 5-2-4 50 lbs 

Uflexx 46-0-0 50 lbs 

Earthworks Renovate Plus 50 lbs 

Stressmaster 0-0-31 S gallon 

Naturesafe 18-0-4 with 1690 SO lbs 

Enhanced Organics Dark Venom S gallons 

Proscape 21-22-4 with Mesotrione SOlbs 

0-0-50 Micro SOP SO lbs 

Title Phyte 5 gallon 

Cal Max Granular SO lb bag 

19-0-17 Micro Tru-priU Homogenous Fert. 50 lb bag 

24-0-12 Mini Polyon with Fe 50 lb bag 

30-0-10 Polvon with Fe 50 lb bag 

32-0-5 .058% Acelepryn .19% Dimension SO lb bag 

34-0-4 Minl .058% Acelepryn .19% Dimension 50 lb bag 

Town ofT,umbuD 
Bid 6430 ON CALL Services Fertilizer, Seed, Pesticides 
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Price l!tr unit 
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Descrl~tlon-Seed Fertlllzer, Chemical Bid UNIT SIZE 
007 Creeping Bentgrass 25 lbs 

Al-A4 Creeping Bentrgrass 251bs 

luminary Bentrgrass 251bs 

Futura Creeping Bentrgrass 25 lbs 

Piranha Bentgrass 25 lbs 

Barricuda Bentgrass 25 lbs 

Penncross Tee2Green Bentgrass 25lbs 

Town ofTrumbu~ 
Bid 6430 ON CALL Services Fert~izer. Seed, Peslicidas 
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Price (!er unit 
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Barrenburg Yellowjacket coated Perennial Rye 2Slbs .<ti K?.~O 
Trifecta Perennial Rye so lbs JI" /8°0 , OCJ 
Low Down's Bluegrass 50 lbs .29, sO 
GLS Resistant Perenial Rye SOlbs ,1g>o. oo 
Northeast Rough Mix Supreme SO lbs ..:J 1/7 .s-o 
Link's Fescue Mix SO lbs :Jlf).S-0 
Double Eagle Perennial Rye 50 lbs I /l'O. O,J 
USGA Fine Greens Topdressing 50 lbs // ,.JS" 
Kiln Dried USGA Fine Greens Topdressing per ton delivered Ai,, 12.. -J 
USGA Spec 60-40 Sand Compost Divot mix per ton delivered ).I<) Ri J 
HD Bunker Sand per ton delivered Alo p, -,.I 
Green Divot mix SO lb bag/lpallet 11 ?~ /7'}o,o 0 
3/4 process stone per ton delivered Alo ~ J 
pea stone per ton delivered Atu R.J 
Stone dust per ton delivered .Ai CJ r,. . ,J 
Cart Path Material 3/8" per ton delivered Aln ~-- cf 
Screened Loam 1/4" per ton delivered /Ju g-J 

Va ll 
I G' ~ I"' ,r.,, t... k fA ~f 

\... Company Na~ By (Signalure) 

~OS W: l~on Av-e11~ 
Address 

S c." +1-
Print Name 

ALorwnlL c_ -r o '28'.sv 
Company Name 

~ /,v L20 J:1 
Date 7 (w) Jo) - "i?] I ~?7yJ / { Fey, ) :)0°6, - lf~I- q7~3 

Telephone/Fax ' 

~) ?ko - 'UC, - !/7 /j 
24 Hour Telephone 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @2:00 PM 

PROPOSAL (To be submitted with proposal) 

ADDENDA 
The following Addenda have been received. The modifications to the Bid Documents noted therein have been considered and all costs 
thereto are included in the Base Bid. 

Addenda# ooaddeoda, ___ _, ___ _, ___ __, ___ _ 

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s} llsted on the following items listed on Pages 5 - 9 of this request and certifles that 
the following proposal meets all the specifications and conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications 
requested are clearly and completely noted. Any alternate proposals are presented In a similar format to those requested and 
are attached herein. It Is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject any or all proposals. If you cannot supply a quote 
please put NA. 

All proposed pricing shall remain be firm fixed for a period of 2 (two) years wjth optional additional year 

Proposal of: Tom lmin. too, 
(COMPANY NAME) 
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TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT 
TASHUA KNOLLS GOLF COURSE 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATIONS 
ON CALL SERVICES FOR 

ADDITIONAL FERTILIZER, GRASS SEED, INSECTICIDES, FUNGICIDES, ETC. 

BID NUMBER 6430 DUE: September 14, 2021 @2:00 PM 

BID PROPOSAL FORM 

-All prices are effective 09/15/2021 ..,. 

Descrletion-Seed Fertlllz~r1 Chemical Bid UNIT SIZE Price eer unit 

Appear2 2 gallon n/a 

Banner Maxx 2 5 gallon n/a 
Barricade 4FL AIJ, Prodiamine 41 2.5 gal 1 gallon t:i.Aa nn 

Oaconil Action S gallon n/a 

Daconil Ultrex 20 lbs n/a 
Daconll ZN 5 gallon n/a 
Divanem .5 gallon n/a 

Headway 1 gallon nla 
Heritage Gib jug n/a 

Heritage SC 8xlpt. Case n/a 

lnstrata 5 gallon n/a 

Posterltv 105 oz. jug n/a 

Posterity Forte 1 gallon n/a 
Posterity XT S gallon n/a 
Primo ALT. T-Nex 2x1 l!al 1 gallon/l0gallon tote tnn nn / 1 oal 

Renown 5 gallon n/a 
Scimitar Ge 1 quart n/a 
Secure ALT. Flex-ouard ,v1 ~al 5 gallon ~,;9si M / 1 oal 

Secure Action S gallon n/a 
1 gallon/10gallon Link 

Subdue Maxx Pak n/a 

Tenacity 1 gallon n/a 
Trlmmlt2SC ALT. Pac-Low 4x1 gal 5 gallon ~36o.on / 1 oal 

Velista 6x22oz bottles n/a 

Briskway+Velista Multipak n/a 

Daconil Action+ Aooear 2 Multipak n/a 

Daconil Action+Banner Maxx 2 Multipak n/a 
Daconil Action+Heritage Action Multipak n/a 

Divanem+Herltage Action Multipak n/a 

Heritage Action+Velista Multipak n/a 



DescriRtlon-Seed Urtlll11r1 Q)~mlcal Bid 

Encartis 

Navicon 

Maxtlma 

Xzemplar 

Honor 

Insignia SC 

Trinity 
. 

Emerald 

Drive XLR8 

Bayleton 

Chipco 26019 Flo 

Chipco Signature "XtraStressszard" 
Compass 50 wg 

Densicor 

Exteris Stressgard 

Fiata Stressgard 

Indemnify 

Merlt2F AlT, 75WSP in 11n v 1 Fi,.... mini 
Proxy 

Tartan Stressgard 

Tetrino 

Talstar P 

Fame SC 

3336F Al T. TM 4 5 2x2.S 2al 
26/36 

Torque 

Game On 

Dimension Ultra 

Quali-Pro Suprado 

Mefenoxam 2 AQ 

Pendant SC 

Nufarm TM 4.SF AIT. TM 4.S ?v? S a.:,I 

Ocean Organics Topsail 

Ocean Organics XP 5-0-0 

Primer Select 

Sixteen 90 

CP Pellets 

Hydro-Cure oellets 

Hydro-Cure Supermax pellets 

!.!NIT~llE 
2.5 gallon 

2.Sgallon 

2.S gallon 

11.4 oz bottle 

361b. case 

2.5 gallon 

2.5 Rallon 

50 bag Case 

-i-gaff&n- 1/2 Gal 
5 gallon 

5 gallon 

221b. Case 

1 lb. Bottle 

51oz. Bottle 
Sgallon 

5 gallon 

17.1 fl oz. Bottle 

5 gallon 

Sgallon 

Sgallon 

1gallon 

1 gallon 

.5 gallon 

S gallon 

5 gallon 

lgallom 

·1-gaUen- 2.5 e:al 
8x8x5oz. Case 

1 gallon 

2.5 gallon 

2 gallon 

5 gallon 

Sgallon 

Sgallon 

S gallons 

Sgallons 

lCase 

1 Case 

1 Case 

Tcwn of Trumbull 
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Pr:l~e ~t!i!Dit 
<;?75 nn 

<:!l n1n nn 

~1 Q7c; nn 

<:171 nn 
<:A 17,; nn 

<:~ 11nnn 

n/a 
~" .:.~n i;n 

<:oAnn 

<;?,770M 

c,-occ nn 

~1nnnn 

n/a 
~e:nnnn 

~'i72 nn 

<;?st4.76 

<:1.100 nn 
<;1 ?I.Ann 

<:?Ac; nn 

<:1.100.nn 

<;4nnnn 

n/a 

Sl.356.75 
CAAi; nn 

n/a 

s11son 
<:1i::i::nn 

n/a 

Pricine not releac:,.,.d 
<;1 ?qc; nn 

n/a 

~""c nn 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 
n/a 

n/a 

n/a 



Dgscrl~llQD-~ed Fe!jilizer1 Chemical Bid 
Emerald isle True Foliar N 

Emerald iSle True Foliar P Turf Rx P+ 
Emerald isle True Foliar K Turf Rx K+ 
Emerald Isle True Foliar NPK Plus 

Emerald isle True Foliar Si Turf R11 c;j 

Emerald Isle True Foliar Ca T11rf Dv ,-,. 

Emerald isle True Foliar MgMn 

Emerald isle CPR 
Emerald Isle Panasea Plus Potent-Sea Plus 
Emerald isle Sequential Micros Complex Rx Mirrn• 

Emerald isle Fairway Sequential Rx Fairwav+ 
12-0-0 100% Chelated 6%Fe 3% Mn with Umaxx 

Runway marking foam 
lncide Out Tank Cleaner 

Knockdown Defoamer 

20-0-20 Raoid Green Water Soluble 
Biomax 4-0-0 
N30 plus 

Verde-Cal G Sili-Cal SS SG 
Sustane 5-2·4 i;,. Danl,:oni,:h 'i..4.'i. c:.r.: 
Uflexx 46-0-0 

Earthworks Renovate Plus 
Stressmaster 0-0-31 

Naturesafe 18-0-4 with 1690 

Enhanced Organics Dark Venom 

Proscape 21-22-4 with Mesotrione 
0-0-50 Micro SOP 
ntle Phyte Nutrite 0-0-26 
Cal Max Granular 
19-0-17 Micro Tru-prill Homogenous Fert. 

24-0-12 Mini Polvon with Fe 
30-0-10 Polyon with Fe 

32-0-5 .058% Acelepryn .19% Dimension 
34-0-4 Mini .058% Acelepryn .19% Dimension 

U~ITSIZE 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 101h 

5 gallon 
SgaJlon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 
5 gallon 
5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 

5 gallon 
1 case 

1 case 

1 case 

25 lbs 
s gallon 

5 aallon 
SO lbs 

50 lbs 
SO lbs 

SO lbs 
5 gallon 
SO lbs 
S gallons 

SOlbs 
SO lbs 
S gallon 

50 lb bag 

SO lb bag 
SO lb bag 

SO lb bag 
50 lb bag 

50 lb bag 

Town of Trumbull 
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Pr~s: ptr ynlt 

n/a 
<::i.c:n nn 

~1t;7 nn 

n/a 
C::Aaa nn 

C:::i.t;:nnn 

n/a 

n/a 
C:.~Rc: nn 

<::i.aann 

C:::1oc nn 

n/a 
<:?ni.. nn 

C::ni..nn 

c::,~i;:nn 
n/a 
n/a 

n/a 
C:::lA nn 

,e_,1.-, M 

n/a 
.e.c:a nn 

n/a 
n/a 

n/a 
C.7'1 nn 

n/a 
.e.,c:n no 

n/a 
nla 
n/a 
n/a 
n/a 

n/a 

Please see "Rx Products• 
note in supporting documen 



DescrJt21IQD•Sees;I Fertlllzer1 Chemical Bid 

007 Creeping Bentgrass 

A1-A4 Creeping Bentrgrass 

Luminary Bentrgrass 

Futura Creeping Bentrgrass 

Piranha Bentgrass 

Barricuda Bentgrass 

Penncross Tee2Green Bentgrass 

Barrenburg Yellowjacket coated Perennial Rye 

Trifecta Perennial Rye 

Low Down's Bluegrass 

GLS Resistant Perenial Rve 

Northeast Rough M ix Supreme 

Link's Fescue Mix 

Double Eagle Perennial Rve 

USGA Fine Greens Topdressing 

Kiln Dried USGA Fine Greens Topdressing 

USGA Spec 60-40 Sand Compost Divot mix 

HD Bunker Sand 

Green Divot mix 

3/4 process stone 

pea stone 

Stone dust 

Cart Path Material 3/8" 

Screened Loam 1/4" / 

UNIT SIZE 

25 lbs 

25Ibs 

25 lbs 

2Slbs 

25 Ibs 

25 lbs 

25 lbs 

2Slbs 

SO lbs 

50 lbs 

SOlbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

SO lbs 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

SO lb bag/lpallet 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

per ton delivered 

rser terr\ielivered,-

Town of Trumbull 
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Price 11er unit 

Market 

n/a 

n/a 

M~rket 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

M,orltat .. 
. . . 
n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

n/a 

/ / 91'1a 

Please see "Seed" note In 
supporting document 

Tom l!Wio, loi:, 
( lYl~HAWA/viv 

Company Name 

13 A Street Budmgton, MA 01803 
Address 

Tom Irwin, Inc. 
Company Name 

09/U9/2021 
Dale 

jeff@tom icwio com & g~r@loroir:wlo com 
Eman 

www lomirwio com 
Webslle 

By (Signature) 

Christopher J Petersen 
Print Name 

Pmsident 
Tille 

j 
V 

781-273-0143 / 781-273-4804 
Telephone/Fax 

781-273-0143 
24 Hour Telephone 


