TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT
BOARD OF EDUCATION

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

PAPER AND SUPPLY BID

BID 6377
DUE: June 1, 2020 @ 2pm
Bid Results Appco Paper & Plastics Corp. Interboro Packaging Gordon Food Service
Isand Park, NY 11558 Montgomery, NY Will decline participation in Bid.
Product
Description | arv | vom | ericE | ALTERNATE | | av | uvom | price | ALTERNATE | | ary | vom | pricE |  ALTERNATE |
BAG SANDWICH 7X7X2 7X7X2 2000 cs $ 8.97 PIPSB 2000 cs $ 11.82 | Count:2,000/Case INT-77-Hvy 2000 cs s - No bid
see sample
BAG SANDWICH WET WAX 6" 6000 cs $ 79.63 BC31750WCS 6000 cs $  9.98 | Count: 2,000/Case INT-428-Med 6000 cs No bid
see sample
BAG POLY 4X2X8 1000 cs $ 4.99 AMA428 1000 cs $ 11.34 | Count:2,000/Case INT-2737-H 1000 cs No bid
see sample
BAG LARGE FOR TRAYS 200 CS $ 13.87 NA5280BPC 200 CS 200 CS No bid
BLEACH CLOROX 6.15% ULTRA "C 6 gal $ 12.99 LAUBLGS 6 gal 6 gal No bid
BOWL FOAM 50z WHITE 1000 cs $ 12.93 MOTH50005 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
BOWL FOAM 8oz WHITE 1000 cs $ 37.99 DA85J20 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
BOWL FOAM 10 oz WHITE 1000 cs $ 40.93 DA10B20 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
BOWL FOAM 12 oz WHITE 1000 cs $ 14.87 MOTH50012 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
BOWL PLASTIC 12 oz WHITE 1000 cs $ 17.93 NY235 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
CLEANER DISH LIQUID 5 gal $ 71.69 PGJOYS 5 gal 5 gal No bid
CLEANER LAUNDRY LIQUID 4 gal $ 18.67 EPLLD 4 gal 4 gal No bid
CLEANER STAINLESS STEEL 12 cans $ 26.79 EP1306 12 cans 12 cans No bid
CLEANER LAUNDRY POWDER 50-25 lbs $ 17.89 SULD25 50 lbs 50 lbs No bid
CLEANER-Fantastik 812/4607 CS $ 20.93 FANTASTIK 12/460Z cs 12/4602 cs No bid
CLEANER - EZ OFF OVEN CLEANER 6CNS CS $ 29.93 BOEZ 6CNS cs 6CNS cs No bid
CUP PORTION 10z PLASTIC 2500 CS $ 17.49 DA100PC 2500 CS 2500 CS No bid
CUP PORTION 2 0z PLASTIC - q
SOUFFLE 2500 cs $ 20.49 MUPL200 2500 cs 2500 cs No bid
CUP PORTION 4 0z PLASTIC 2500 cs $ 32.47 MUPL400 2500 cs 2500 cs No bid
CUP PORTION 5.5 0z PLASTIC 2500 cs $ 41.83 MUPL550 2500 cs 2500 cs No bid
CUP FOAM 60z 1000 cs $ 16.99 DA6J6 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
CUP FOAM 8 oz 1000 cs $ 20.71 DA8J8 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
CUP CONICAL 4 0z PAPER #4F 5000 cs $ 45.99 SWCR204 5000 cs 5000 cs No bid
CUP PAPER PORTION, 1.25 OZ 5000 cs $ 39.93 SW125 5000 cs 5000 cs No bid
CONTAINER FOAM HINGED-3 COMP. 200 $ 14.57 MOTH10103 No bid
CONTAINER CLEAR HINGED 6" SAND 500 cs $ 30.49 YEC181060 500 cs 500 cs No bid
CONTAINER FOAM 40z SQUAT 1000 cs $ 21.63 DA456 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
CONTAINER FOAM 8 0z SQUAT 1000 cs $ 31.43 DA8SJ12 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
CONTAINER FOAM 12 0z SQUAT 500 cs $ 24.29 DA125J20 500 cs 500 cs No bid
CUTLERY FORK HEAVY WHITE 1000 cs $ 11.87 AM HF 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
CUTLERY KNIFE HEAVY WHITE 1000 cs $ 11.87 AM HK 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
CUTLERY TEASPOON HEAVY WHITE 1000 cs $ 11.87 AM HS 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
CUTLERY Fork Medium White Wrapped 1000 cs $ 8.97 LEMFWR 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
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CUTLERY Knife Medium White Wrapped 1000 cs $ 8.97 LEMKWR 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
AUV eEEperm e Wi 1000 s |3 8.97 LEMSWR 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
Wrapped
AUV Slonp Siroem M Wil 1000 s |3 8.97 LEMSSWR 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
Wrapped
U7 ! 250 s |$s 1297 LEFSKSN 250 cs 250 cs No bid
fork/knlfe/spoon/straw/napkln
CUTLERY KIT spork/straw/napkin 1000 cs $ 10.97 LESKS 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
DISH Food Tray 1/4 Ib Wax 1000 cs $ 12.29 FO25 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
DISH Food Tray 1/2 Ib Wax 1000 cs $ 12.93 FO50 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
DISH Food Tray 1LB Wax 1000 cs $ 16.43 FO100 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
DISH Food Tray 2LB Waxed 1000 cs $ 20.73 FO200 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
DISH Food Tray 3LB Waxed 500 CS $ 17.99 FO300 500 CS 500 CS No bid
DOILIE LACE 6" ROUND 1000 pk $ 7.79 BR6P 1000 pk 1000 pk No bid
DOILIE LACE 12" ROUND 500 pk $ 12.99 BR12P 500 pk 500 pk No bid
FILM Vinyl 18" X 2000 i RL $ 11.97 B0182000 1 RL al RL No bid
FILM Vinyl 12" X 2000' i RL $ 8.39 B0122000 1 RL al RL No bid
FILM Vinyl 24"x 2000' 1 RL $ 16.39 B0242000 1 RL al RL No bid
FOIL Roll 18"X500' W1218/W18 i RL $ 14.99 K1318 1 RL al RL No bid
FOIL Sheet 9 x 10.75 3000 cs $ 37.69 K71 3000 cs 3000 cs No bid
FOIL SHEET 12X10.75 3000 cs $ 38.93 K1370 3000 cs 3000 cs No bid
L QU= S 31 e ey 3000 s |$s 3769 K71 3000 cs 3000 cs No bid
(QUILTED)
FUEL GEL CHAFING 72 cs $ 30.89 HOHF 72 cs 72 cs No bid
Elara/JobGuard-Lrg-Pg count: .
GLOVE PLASTIC CLEAR ONE SIZE 1000 BX $ 6.79 PIPG 1000 BX $ 21.80 1,000 see sample 1000 BX No bid
10/100 Med Pride-Lrg-VPFG Count:

LOVE - VINYL - NO POWDER BX 47. PIVGPF 1 BX H 1 BX No bi
GLO O PO! $ 99 G 000 $ 8.90 100/Box see somple 000 o bid
LID FOR 40z FOAM 1000 cs $ 12.93 DA6JL 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
LID FOR 80z FOAM CUP 1000 cs $ 12.97 DAS5JL 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid

1 FOR
LID FOR FOAM 80z SQUAT O::HZO cs $ 18.41 DA12)2 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
1000 FOR
LID FOR 12 0z FOAM SQUAT 125120 cs $ 23.89 DA20JL 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
LID FOR 1 0z PLASTIC - SOUFFLE 2500 cs $ 16.99 MUPL125 2500 cs 2500 cs No bid
LID 4 &5.5 0z PORTION CUPS 2500 cs $ 20.69 MUL400 2500 cs 2500 cs No bid
LID FOR 2 oz CUP 2500 cs $ 17.99 MUL200 2500 cs 2500 cs No bid
LINER Pan Quillon Greaseproof 16X24 1000 cs $ 27.48 SOL624 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
MUG HOT 8 oz PLASTIC WHITE 192 cs $ 59.69 FI208W 192 cs 192 cs No bid
NAPKIN BEVNAP 10X10 2PLY BLACK 600 cs $ 10.99 C1010BK 600 cs 600 cs No bid
NAPKIN BEVNAP 10X10 2PLY RED 600 cs $ 10.99 CO1010R 600 cs 600 cs No bid
NAPKIN BEVNAP 10X10 2 PLY A
600 10.99 co1o010Y
VELLGW cs $ 600 cs 600 cs No bid

G:\Bid Results\Bid Results 2020\RFQ 6377_Results_BOE Paper and Supply 9 Schools 6.1.20.xIsx



TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT
BOARD OF EDUCATION

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

PAPER AND SUPPLY BID

BID 6377
DUE: June 1, 2020 @ 2pm
Bid Results Appco Paper & Plastics Corp. Interboro Packaging Gordon Food Service
Isand Park, NY 11558 Montgomery, NY Will decline participation in Bid.
Product
Description Qry uom PRICE ALTERNATE Qry uom PRICE ALTERNATE QTY uom PRICE ALTERNATE
NAPKIN DINNER 15X17 2 PLY BLACK 600 cs $ 23.97 C01616BK 600 cs 600 cs No bid
NAPKIN DINNER 15X17 2 PLY A
YELLOW 600 cs $ 23.97 COo1616Y 600 cs 600 cs No bid
3000 .
NAPKIN DINNER 15X17 2 PLY WHITE cs $ 26.97 MF2688 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
X 8000 .
NAPKIN Dispenser Tallfold 3.5X6.5 cs $ 21.47 PUTP300 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
OVEN MITT 17 LONG i pc $ 5.49 ADMTT17 1 pc 1 pc No bid
PAD BRILLO HOTEL SIZE 120 cs $ 26.63 PU3030 120 cs 120 cs No bid
PAN FOIL FULL STEA DEEP 21X1 50 40 (=3 $ 28.99 PCA6056 40 cs 40 cs No bid
PAN FOIL FULL STEAM MED 21X1 50 40 cs $ 33.70 PCA6120 40 cs 40 cs No bid
PAPER PATTY 5 1/2 X5 1/2 1000 pk $ 3.52 NOPWP 1000 pk 1000 pk No bid
PLATE 10" WHITE LAMINATE 500 cs $ 34.68 SWR5105 500 cs 500 cs No bid
PLATE FOAM 10.25 3 COMP WHITE 500 cs $ 34.61 DA10CPWF 500 cs 500 cs No bid
PLATE FOAM 6" white 1000 CS $ 12.99 MOTH50006 1000 CS 1000 CS No bid
(AL (RO & WA= ey 500 s |3 12.97 MOTH50009 500 cs 500 cs No bid
COMPARTMENT
PLATE 9" WHITE LAMINATE 500 cs $ 22.37 SWRS9DP 500 cs 500 cs No bid
PLATE PAPER 6" WHITE 1000 cs $ 9.29 PR61 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
PLATE PAPER 6" WHITE UNCOATED 1000 cs $ 9.29 PR61 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
PLATE PLASTIC 10" WHITE ARIS 500 cs $ 44.89 NY10664 500 cs 500 cs No bid
PLATE PLASTIC 6" WHITE IMPAC 1000 cs $ 31.97 NY6664 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
PLATTER 18" FLAT BLACK HEAVY 25 36 cs $ 29.99 FI8801BK 36 cs 36 cs No bid
PLATTER FOAM 7x9 WHITE 500 cs $ 31.69 SWSEL79P 500 cs 500 cs No bid
POT HOLDERS 8.5 x 11.5 TERRYCOLTH 1(8x8) pr $ 10.97 ADSSP812 1 pr 1 pr No bid
z/l:%NGE STAINLESS STEEL KURLY 12 bx $ 4.93 PO8O5P 12 bx 12 bx No bid
STERAMINE SANITIZER TABLETS 600 bx $ 36.79 EDST 600 bx 600 bx No bid
STIRRER PLASTIC COFFEE 5" 1000 cs $ 6.97 REPS 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
TABLECOVER 54X108 WHITE 24;”"’ s |$ 3389 C054108W 25 cs 25 cs No bid
243 ply .
TABLECOVER 82X82 WHITE a5 cs $ 19.79 C08282wW 25 cs 25 cs No bid
TEST KIT CHLORINE 1 vial $ 3.99 K354 1 vial 1 vial No bid
QUAT FOR STERAMINE TEST STRIPS 16 pk $ 44.73 PM202 16 pk 16 pk No bid
TOOTHPICK FRILL CLUB 4" 1000 pk $ 21.97 RECF 1000 pk 1000 pk No bid
TOWELS COTTON TERRY RIB 16X19 1 dz $ 11.93 KA1720 1 dz 1 dz No bid
ECI’SVF\,’ELS eSS SRR IS EL 600 2080| < |$  77.69 CHIB470 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
TRAY FOAM SCHOOL 5 COMPT 500 cs $ 17.59 GE105 500 cs 500 cs No bid
TRAY FOAM SCHOOL 6 COMP 500 cs $ 29.97 GE106 500 cs 500 cs No bid
TRAY FROM BUILD A TRAY 500 cs $ = 500 (=3 500 cs No bid
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TRAY CIRCLE 16" CORRIGATED 125 cs $ 27.39 AL16CC 125 cs 125 cs No bid
50 LB
WRAP DRY WAX 12X12 6000 cs $ 63.39 NO1212 6000 cs 6000 cs No bid
WRAP SUB DRY WAX 12X15 50LB 16 bx $ 63.39 NO1215 10 bx 10 bx No bid
WRAP WAXED 12X10.75 6000 cs $ 44.67 NOMAW 6000 cs 6000 cs No bid
WRAP DRY WAX 12X12 GREEN, RED a
) ) 4. BA:
BLUE. YELLOW 6000 cs $ 64.93 358 6000 cs 6000 cs No bid
YOGURT CUPS-120z Cups clear plastic 1000 cs $ 37.99 MUPET12626 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
YOGURT CUP 9 oz Cups clear plastic 1000 569 cs $ 48.89 MUPET9 500 cs 500 cs No bid
Y RT LIDS-Dx lid 12
hoolju S-Dome lid 120z cup/no 1000 s |$ 2689 AM626NH 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
YOGURT LIDS-Flat 12 oz 1000 cs $ 17.09 AMG626NH 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
YOGURT LIDS - Dome lid 90z no hole 1000 cs $ 29.93 AM662NH 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
CUP - COLD 3 OZ SOFT PLASTIC 2500 CS $ 39.89 NYPC3 No bid
CUP COLD 5 0z SOFT PLASTIC 2500 cs $ 29.99 NYPC5 2500 cs 2500 cs No bid
CUP COLD 7 oz SOFT PLASTIC 2500 cs $ 39.99 NYPC7 2500 cs 2500 cs No bid
BOWL - FOAM 40z WHITE 1000 cs $ 12.93 MOTH5004 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
CUTLERY FORK MED WHITE 1000 cs $ 5.09 AMMF 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
CUTLERY TEASPOON MED WHITE 1000 cs $ 5.19 AMMS 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
CUTLERY KNIFE MED WHITE 1000 cs $ 5.19 AMMK 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
PLACEMATS SUN COLOR 1000 cs $ 18.59 C01014 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
100% RECYCLED AND COMPOSTABLE
PAPER PRODUCTS
10.25" THREE COMPARTMENT PLATES 500 (o) $ 49.83 PCA40C 500 cs 500 cs No bid
KEVALLE4(smooth)/KEFIASH .

5-COMP LUNCH TRAYS 500/240 CS 500 cs 500 cs No bid

/ $49.97/$17.99 (rough) o bl
5COMP ROUND LUNCH TRAYS 250 560 €S $ 19.73 PM246 500 CS 500 CS No bid
7.5X10" OVAL PLATES 500 €S $ 58.49 KE25778 500 CS 500 CS No bid
6" Round Plates 1000 cs $ 39.69 PM248 1000 cs 1000 cs No bid
Kevin Bova

Purchasing Agent
PAPER AND SUPPLY BID
DUE: June 1, 2020 @ 2pm
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