TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF
CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT
AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID # 6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

BID results for BID 6373



Bid 6373
Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment

Page4 of 8
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT 0
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION i
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSON )

THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
BID RESPONSE FORM FOR 6 wrdy A<ongd ¥ €2 clevvmnn y nc.
(Company Name)
RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
Equipment 'rer Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
§ (8hours) {40 hours) (160 hours)
Low Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator
1 {113 Cu Yd. (with operator SN P P un | Pus
2 |[Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd $ A/ 0 $ NG $ MR $ MR
3 [Backhoe-Crawfer Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ MB $ NG $ N 5 $ A/ ﬁ
4  |Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. $ N 6 $ A $ NG $ /\/ 6
5 |Cramer Excavator w/ 50 foot reach $ IN/Q $ WS $ AR sNB
{6  |Crawler Excavator w/ 75 foot reach $ N ﬁ $ I/ $ NI $ ANA
7 Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd. 5 $ $ $
lequipped with the hydraulic rock hammer NG NG NG NR
rawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd.
8 uippedwiﬂlmehy:;lﬁcmckhgm SNG PP G PG VLA
raufic Crawler Excavator 2 yd.
9 lequipped with the hydrauiic rock hammer SNG S NG S/Vfb SMA
10 [Dragline 1 1/2 yd $ N6 $ _Mfg $ Nﬂ) $ NC')
11 {Bucket Loader -Crawler 2 yd $ A/@ $ MNA $ N $ MR
12 |Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd $ NL)) $ M $ A/& 34/@
13 I[Badthoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd. $ N 6 ¥ A/ 6 $ N S A R
|14 Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2 yd $ ap. 00 $ F’ZO@ $ 3} 00D SH'ym. GO
|15 Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 1/2 yd $ qSOO $ qu $ 3.‘6(0-00 315 ZCD.(D
16 [Bulldozer Crawler-100 hp $ A A $ 4 f e $ NI s/\/fﬂ
17 [Bulldozer Crawler-140 hp $N6 $ N& $ U{)) $ N\[S
18 |Bulldozer Crawler-190 hp SNG $ Ajfs $ /\/6 $A/B
19 [Trucks-2 Axle, 6 yd Level Cap $ NG $ ALGS $ MG : NR
PO [Trucks-3 Axle, 13 yd $ $ $
NG NQ ANE | N

—




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 50f9
£ Equipment [Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
=2 (8 hours) {40 hours) {160 hours)
21 |Vibratory Roller 10-12 Tons $ 90.00 $ Z 20.00 53 00 $/WICO
22 |Harley Rake/Tractate(with operator) $ A f’ $ N $ NR $ MR
23 [Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck $ MO $ NR $ NR $ MR
24 |Crane 30T $ AR $J\/6 $ N $/VB
| 5 [Snowplow 42,000 GVWR or Greater w/
% eander ‘i PG P NG PANG
26 [Truck -Triaxle 18 yard Dump $ N $ N $ AR $ MO
{infrared Spot Asphalt Restoration
27 |equipment SN B ANR PR SVR
Sanitary Sewer video equipment (includes . - - .
28 [recorder, labor & vehicles),(8" — 247) size
pipes A 6 AR MO MA
Storm Sewer video equipment w/recorder ’ i ;
29 (12 pipe or larger) $
(includes all labor & vehicles) N F) A ﬂ) /VB /V_B
Push camera (8" pipe or smaller) "
30 lincludes alt labor & vehicies) SNB 1P NA |8 AA S NG
31 [33 Ton Crane Rear Mount $ Nﬁ $_A/6 $ A $/st
32 JUtility Truck w/ tools $ A/(S $ N& $ A/& $ /VB
33 [Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $ /\/ i $ N A $ /V J£S $ /VB




Bid 6373

Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 7 of 9
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional equipment at their disposal (along
with rental rates) that may be available to the town.

Please indicate those items below:

RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
item Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week {Per Month

(% JeMT 40 Cedamec 330250 | ° | $2000.00 | Wg oo
b Coadter TJOOMMNeC $ LS. (X0 SL{ RA0W saa_,igw ‘_‘zq,ﬂgz@
& \bictacn 206 Milec | 831500 | R0 | 504u(0)
d . s s $ $
e. $ $ $ $
f. $ $ $ $
0. $ $ $ $
h. $ $ $ $
i $ $ § $
ji $ $ $ $
k $ $ $ $

|1 $ $ $ $
m. $ $ $ $
n $ $ $ $
0. $ $ $ $
p. $ $ $ $
q. $ $ $ $

End of proposal

TOWN OF TRUMBULL



Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page6of§
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL continued
Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following:
Flagman: $ M 6 JHR Overtime $ N—& __/HR
Laborer: $ N 6 HR Overtime s NI 5 _JHR
Driver: $ N IHR Overtime s NG IHR
Operator $ 116,00 /HR Overtime S__M..Q_O._ JHR
Supervisor: $ f\} ﬂ) _ HHR Overtime $ /Uﬁ _/HR
Material Markup percent_ (O % (Town will not aliow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications requested are clearly and completely noted. Any altemate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are aftached herein. ltis that the Town reserves the right to reject

any or all proposals.
0 ﬂ | v'\ W

Company Name By (Signature)

QQ.OF LP.QZ;&J () \u,mﬂr-,—”pm
Address Pnnmm
/331 Ot)mﬁ(’ 'L0lr CTUAX /) Q:“F‘- < clen {
State & Zip Title
b “(Ojaoao i | T L) ‘-T‘ ‘,U{h"
Date Telephone/Fax

bt'l‘xg-f}:;j(r\j;)’[(iﬁgg';L;m_t.phqt-kmm (A - { (st ¢ ooy
Email Website -



ORIGINAL -

Rental of Conslruction Equipment

Page 4 of 9
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
" PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
- ; .
BID RESPONSE FORM FOR | D{K—{ l/&-AJ Staping J-’Cu.( J\QVJI <
{Company Namef <
RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
£ (8 hours) (40 hours) {160 hours)
Low Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator
1_[1/3 Cu Yd. (with operator) $125. co|${,000.00| 5, 600.00| $20,a0.0¢
2  [Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd $ $ $ $
{3 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ 200,60 $], LGowu $8:oa0.ac $32,ooc,co
4  [Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. $4 35 0o |SL ,14 .00l 8/ 3'Jr Yod 00 553}é Q0,00
5  [Crawler Excavator w/ 50 foot reach $ $ $ $
6 [Crawler Excavator w/ 75 foot reach $ $ $ $
2 Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd. $ $ $ 3
lequipped with the hydraulic rock hammer
Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. . ;
8 |equipped with the hycraulc ock hammer | 200,00 [$81400.00) $13 000,20 | $4¥ 000,00
9 Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. $ $ $ s
uipped with the hydraulic rock hammer
10 |Dragline 1 1/2 yd $ $ $ $
11 |Bucket Loader -Crawler 2 yd $ $ $ $
12 |Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd $175.00 |8 1,400.00|$7,000.00| $28 000 .00
13 |Backhoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd. $ $ $ $
14  [Bucket Loader-Whee! 2 1/2 yd $ $ $ $
15 [Bucket Loader-Whee! 3 1/2 yd ${75.c0 |$!,400.00|87T,000.00( $Q§ 000r.c0
16 [Bulidozer Crawler-100 hp $ $ $ $
17 |Bulldozer Crawler-140 hp $200 g0 |3 Q, Y00,00 $[,‘,2l 009,00 $‘-]5: 000,00
18 [Bulidozer Crawler-190 hp 3 $ $ $
19 [Trucks-2 Axle, 6 yd Level Cap $95.00 |$6¥0.co |8 5, Yoo.00| $/3,60,00
$
PO [Trucks-3 Axle, 13 yd $ $ $
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Bid 6373
Town of Trumbull
Rentai of Construction Equipment
Page 5 of9
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
5 {8 hours) {40 hours) {160 hours)
21 |Vibratory Roller 10-12 Tons $125.00 [$1,080.00 | $5,400.00| $21,400.00
22 |Harley Rake/Tractate(with operator) $135 .00 |81,080.00 |$5,¥00.00 | 32, Lop.o0
23 [Tractor Trailer wi35T Gooseneck $ $ $ $
24 [Crane 30T $ $ $ $
Snowplow 42,000 GVWR or Greater w/
25 | onder $ $ $ $
26 [Truck -Triaxle 18 yard Dump $\\S.oc [5920.00 |$Y,Lod.o0 | $ ¥, Yo.00
[infrared Spot Asphalt Restoration
27 Eniment $ $ $ $
Sanitary Sewer video equipment (includes
28 [recorder, labor & vehicles),(8" - 24”) size $ $ $ $
pipes
Storm Sewer video equipment w/recorder
29 |(12 pipe or larger) $ $ $ $
includes all labor & vehicles)
Push camera (8" pipe or smaller)
30 includes all labor & vehicles) $ § § $
31 |33 Ton Crane Rear Mount $ $ $ $
32 |Utility Truck w/ tools $ (,{ 0D |$ 5-&0,00 $2,Lo0.00| $ IU} Ho0, 00
33 [Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $ $ $ $

Total LandSceping -
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Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull

Rental of Construcion Equipment
Page7of9

TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID # 6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional equipment at their disposal {along
with rental rates) that may be available to the town.

Please indicate those items below:
RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

CAT DbH YL @‘m(y_ $300,00 | $34 D0.00| $12,000.00] $4§,pc0.20
CAT Gub S yd 5245 0o | $1,9%0.00 | 39, Y00 .0 | $39 200,00
CATYU 10y 595, v | $2,280.00( 81\ Hoo.00| $ Y5, kv

CATq50 dyd $245-00 | $1,960,00| $9,¥00.00| $39, 240,
CAT 950 10 J 529500 | $2,a8.00| $ 400,00 | $4s 400 00
CAT 93¢ 4. Sucl $200.00 | $1,00.60($€ poo,00 | $3 0w .0
CAT 38 (bud  |$222.00 | 5\ 77000 $9.870.00] 535530,
CAT 930 3yd | 3175.00 | 51,400.00 | $7,000.00 [ 528,000 .
DuoSap 300DL q\!cl $245.00 | $1,960.00|$ 9,80.00 | $39 00,0
Doosen 3oo . q\/“‘ $2¥5.00 |$2,280.00| $\\, Yoo.00| $HS, bv. o
st 455D $(7S.00 | 84,400,008 T000.00|$2Y,600.00
Pote con 4310 B&:PP” $H4S, co | $3,560.,00| 8 17,%00.00| $7T1,200.00
CBL LYW U\Lpge/ $750.00 | 8 ,000,00 | $30 ov0.00 | $120, 0.0
W\Drba.w\c.‘%’(.kmmr $ 7S.00 |$Goo.00 |$3,000.c0 | $1,00.00
CRT G 90D (oriadey | $750.00 |$ €,000.00] 830 00d.00] 3 RO800.c0
CAT 299 Mo/l | 817500 |$1,400.00 | $7,000.00 | 535,000
Prepbice Loclogler |5175-co [$1,900.es7,000.cc $25 cr o

8D Trock Comast #9500 E74p.00 #35500.00 I/5 200.00

End of proposal

TOWN OF TRUMBULL

Lﬂ Q‘Hacj'\c 0/ ‘ﬁw
G ou/,-/—‘h—\a{ e?v; Prmen &



TOWN OF TRUMBULL

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

PREQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL

Bid 6373
Town of Trumbull

Rental of Construction Equipment

THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID # 6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT
RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
CAT 328DL Bucket/Thumb $245.00 $1,960.00 $9,800.00 $39,200.00
CAT 330DL Bucket/Thumb $245.00 $1,960.00 $9,800.00 $39,200.00
Doosan 300LL Rotating Grapple $325.00 $2,600.00 $13,000.00 $52,000.00
Doosan 300DL Bucket $225.00 $1,800.00 $9,000.00 $36,000.00
Doosan 300DL Rotating Grapple/Saw $335.00 $2,680.00 $13,400.00 $53,600.00
Doosan 225LL Bucket Thumb $300.00 $2,400.00 $12,000.00 $48,000.00
Doosan 225LL Grapple/Saw $335.00 $2,680.00 $13,400.00 $53,600.00
Doosan 225DL Grapple/Saw $300.00 $2,400.00 $12,000.00 $48,000.00
Doosan 225DL Bucket $200.00 $1,600.00 $8,000.00 $32,000.00
Doosan 225DL Log Screw $335.00 $2,680.00 $13,400.00 $53,600.00
Doosan 300DL Stump Shear $335.00 $2,680.00 $13,400.00 $53,600.00
Link Belt Stump Shear $335.00 $2,680.00 $13,400.00 $53,600.00
Doosan 190W Grapple/Rotating $335.00 $2,680.00 $13,400.00 $53,600.00
Doosan 190W Log Screw $335.00 $2,680.00 $13,400.00 $53,600.00
Doosan 225DL Mower $335.00 $2,680.00 $13,400.00 $53,600.00
Doosan 190W Mower $335.00 $2,680.00 $13,400.00 $53,600.00
Kubota 160 Grapple/Thumb $100.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00
Komatsu 4252 Hot Saw $350.00 $2,800.00 $14,000.00 $56,000.00
Sennebogen 718 Grapple/Saw $460.00 $3,680.00 $18,400.00 $73,600.00
Sennebogen 718 Fecon Mower $500.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00 $80,000.00
Single-Axle Dump Truck $75.00 $600.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00
Tri-Axle Dump Truck $115.00 $920.00 $4,600.00 $18,400.00
Class 8 Trailer Dump 30-50 cy $100.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00
Logging Truck $145.00 $1,160.00 $5,800.00 $23,200.00
Chip Truck - 30 yd $145.00 $1,160.00 $5,800.00 $23,200.00
Chip Truck - 60 yd $155.00 $1,240.00 $6,200.00 $24,800.00
Chip Trailer - 115 yd $155.00 $1,240.00 $6,200.00 $24,800.00
Talbert Low Bed - 55 Ton $215.00 $1,720.00 $8,600.00 $34,400.00
Utility Service Truck $65.00 $520.00 $2,600.00 $10,400.00
Terex Haul Truck - 25 Ton $200.00 $1,600.00 $8,000.00 $32,000.00
John Deere Tiger Cat Log Skidder - Grapple/Winch $255.00 $2,040.00 $10,200.00 $40,800.00
Timber Pro Forwarder $375.00 $3,000.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00
Edge 80’ Stacker - Portable Track $100.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00
Sandvik QE 241 Track Screener $175.00 $1,400.00 $7,000.00 $28,000.00
McClosky Trommel Screener/516 $175.00 $1,400.00 $7,000.00 $28,000.00




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 6of 9
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL continued
Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following:
Flagman: 5. 11.08 /HR Overtime s 117-50 R
Laborer: s 19.0p HR Overtime s 117.50 mr
Driver: $ /HR Overtime $ MHR
Operator s 40.00 HR Overtime s [RY .50 mr
Supervisor: g A5.00 HR Overtime s | 5350 mr
Material Markup percent 1 3 % (Town will not allow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications pequested are clearly and completely noted. Any altemate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are attag erein. Itis un od that the Town reserves the right to reject
any or all proposals.

I/O“‘&,l LJLV\A\,SCQ_FJ»-:} : ‘/M'I/

Comp(a:EL ﬁmq,rw &W " By (Signature) /

_P_Q,M;___ Perce, Feva's

Address Print Name

l‘\'a,u.}l i\ CU 06Y a

gm_t;_&_z._ﬂjs.__lp ] Lqr Yo mQ Liney
L”l}ZoZ-o 20% - 140 - {\S S

Dale N Telephone/Fax

bles @ fersmubh producham_totallon dcles ping. oo

Email



Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Paged of8
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID # 6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
BID RESPONSE FORM FOR __M\¢Mlew Qonsi-wc.hn Inc.
{Company Name)
RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
5 {8 hours) (40 hours) (180 hours)
Low Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator $ $ $ $
1 |1/3 Cu Yd. (with operator)
2 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd $ Lo o0 $ Y go_oo $ 77 uoo o | g 5{‘ (o0 0°
3 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ $ $ $
4  |Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. $ $ $ $
5 [Crawler Excavator w/ 50 foot reach $ $ $ $
6 [Crawler Excavator w/ 75 foot reach $ $ $ $
7 Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd. 5 $ $ $
uipped with the hydraulic rock hammer
8 Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ $ 3 $
equipped with the hydraulic rock hammer
9 Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. $ $ $ $
equipped with the hydraulic rock hammer
10 (Dragline 1 1/2 yd $ $ $ $
11 |Bucket Loader -Crawler 2 yd $ $ $ 3
12 |Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd $ $ $ $
13 [Backhoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd. $ $ $ $
14 [Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2 yd 3 $ $ $
15 [Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 1/2 yd $ Qo0 $ <120%° |3 '3,600.°" $ |L|]t{oo.o°
16  |Bulldozer Crawler-100 hp $ $ $ $
17 {Bulldozer Crawler-140 hp $ $ $ $
18 [Bulidozer Crawler-190 hp $ $ $ $
19 [Trucks-2 Axle, 6 yd Level Cap $ 5500 (3 yypee |$ 2 7p00° | $ G 80000
PO [Trucks-3 Axle, 13 yd S50 (3 boo.o |$G 600.° $ 1, 200,00




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbul
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 5 of 9
= Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
= (8 hours) (40 hours) {160 hours)
21 |Vibratory Roller 10-12 Tons $ $ $ $
22 [Harley Rake/Tractate(with operator) $ $ $ $
23 [Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck $ $ $ $
24 [Crane 30T $ 3 $ $
Snowplow 42,000 GVWR or Greater w/
25 L ko $ $ $ $
26 [Truck -Triaxle 18 yard Dump $ gp 00 $ (,40 o® $ 5,200."0 $ 12 Qvo.0°
¥ 3
Infrared Spot Asphalt Restoration
27 Equipment $ $ $ §
Sanitary Sewer video equipment {includes
28 frecorder, labor & vehicles),(8" - 24") size $ $ $ $
ipes
Storm Sewer video equipment w/recorder
29 (12 pipe or larger) $ $ $ $
{includes all labor & vehicles)
Push camera (8" pipe or smaller)
30 Fincludes all labor & vehicles) $ § § $
31 [33 Ton Crane Rear Mount $ $ $ $
32 |Utility Truck wi tools $ spoo  [$ 400° [$9 o0 | ¥ G, 000 00
33 [Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $ $ $ $




Bid 8373

Town of Trumbull

Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 7 of 9

TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)
In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additicnal equipment at their disposal (along

with rental rates) that may be available to the town.

Please indicate those items below:

RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)

item Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

® Bep 0T $ 2000 $ C40.“* |8 3,200°° |8 160007
E Manhole Qv Her § 2400 $ 2ooro | § [o0s. 2 $ ‘/ 4022
= mithing hes $ 2500 $ guvoo |3 f o |§ 4 omeo
d $ § $ $

. $ $ $ $

f $ $ $ $

g $ $ $ ¥

h. $ $ $ $

i. $ $ $ $

J $ $ $ $

k. $ $ $ $

. $ $ $ $

m. $ $ $ $

n. $ $ $ $

o. $ $ $ $

p. $ $ $ $

Q. $ $ $ $

End of proposal




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 6of 9
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL continued
Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following:
Flagman: s 3b°° HR Overtime $ 54.> HR
Laborer: $ 492.00 HR Overtime $ 7 i o /HR
Driver: $ £2.% HR Overtime $ o Mt IHR
Operator $ 60.2° JHR Overtime s_ 0. IHR
Supervisor:. $ W/ N MR Overtime $ L A HR
Material Markup percent /o % (Town will not allow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets ail the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications requested are clearly and completely noted. Any alternate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are attached herein. It is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject
any or all proposals.

MCMICA/ (O,A_S-I’rur_}"g,a I’\C Q‘Z

Company Name By (Signature)
170 Scorr £J), So.re I £d Mendoha
Address Print Name
Zas:ucf , T 06712 wPlem
State & Zip . Title
H-].2020 (13)758-317¢ Go3) 758-%53
Date Telephone/Fax

eég,ma.glu Cons trocton C b Com WAWW. Mealien GonSdprochion et Com

Email Website




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 4 of 8
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL

' ORIGINAL

BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM

BID RESPONSE FORM FOoR United Rentals

(Company Name}
RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
Equipment [Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

3 (8 hours) (40 hours) {160 hours)

Low Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator $ $ $ $
1 {113 Cu Yd. (with operator)
2 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd $ $855.27 19226094 | $5498.77
3 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ $ $ $
4  [Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. $ $ $ $
5  [Crawler Excavator w/ 50 foot reach $ $ $ $
6  [Crawler Excavator wi 75 foot reach $ $ $ $
7 hoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd. $ $ $ $

uipped with the hydraulic rock hammer 1657.27 4486.94 10024.77
8 I::Ekhoe-Cravder Excavator 1 1/2 yd. g $ $ $
ipped with the hydraulic rock hammer
9 ackhoe-Hydraulic Crawier Excavator 2 yd. $ $ $ $
uipped with the hydraulic rock hammer

10 {Dragline 1 1/2 yd ] $ $ $
11 [Bucket Loader -Crawler 2 yd $ $ $ 3
12 {Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd $ $
13 |Backhoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd. $ $37354 |%973 $2361.40
14 |Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2 yd $ $585.96 $1679.43 $4545.29
15  [Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 1/2 yd $ $e84 $205164 | $5131.97
16 [Bulldozer Crawler-100 hp $ $668 $1994 $5170
7' ozer Cimmiee- 140 1p $ 854 $2586.62 | $7485.02
18 |Bulldozer Crawler-190 hp $ 3 $ $
19 [Trucks-2 Axle, 6 yd Level Cap $ $636.32 |$1546.21 | $3981.86
20 (Trucks-3 Axie, 13 yd $ $ s y




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Renta! of Construction Equipment
Page 5 of 9
E Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
= {8 hours) (40 hours) {160 hours)
21 |Vibratory Roller 10-12 Tons $ $495 $1528 $3835
22 [Harley Rake/Tractate(with operator) $ $ $ $
23 [Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck $ $ $ $
24 |Crane 30T $ $ $ $
o5 [Snowplow 42,000 GVWR or Greater w/ $ $ 5 $
nder
26 |Truck -Triaxle 18 yard Dump $ $ $ $
infrared Spot Asphalt Restoration
2 Equipment § § § $
[Sanitary Sewer video equipment (includes
28 |recorder, labor & vehicles),(8" — 24°) size $ $ $ $
ipes
Storm Sewer video equipment wirecorder
29 [(12 pipe or larger) $ $ $ S
(includes all labor & vehicles)
30 Push camera (8" pipe or smaller) $ $ $ $
includes all labor & vehicles)
31 [33 Ton Crane Rear Mount $ $ $ $
32 |Utility Truck w/ tools $ $ $ $
33 [Temparary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $ $ $ $




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull

Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 7 of §

TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)
In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional equipment at their disposal (along

with rental rates) that may be available to the town.

Please indicate those items below:

RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
tem Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
a 9527045 TRUCK DUMP 3 YARD $ $288.70 $811.89 $1856.48
b. TRUCK STAKE 12’ WITH LIFT GATE $ $239.08 $597.69 $1508.56
c. TRUCK PICKUP 3/4 TON 4X4 CREW CAB $ $181 $511.96 $1215.25
d. TRUCK PICKUP 172 TON 4X4 CREW CAB $ $138.30 |%40464 | ®1029.08
e. MINI EXCAVATOR 15000-19999% $ $439.47 $1266.96 | $2947.61
f. MINI EXCAVATOR 10000-14000% $ $321.83 $916.84 $2104.85
g. MINI EXCAVATOR 7400-9199# $ $283.96 $760.18 $1767.10
h. MINI EXCAVATOR 6000-6799# ) $246.11 $677.44 $1613.44
] MINI EXCAVATOR 3000-3999% $ $232.71 |%646.41 | %1531.48
J SCISSOR LIFT 19' ELECTRIC $ $153.07 $256.10 $451.18
k. BOOM 46-50' TOWABLE 5 $31649 |[%848.98 |%1853.68
! BOOM 30-36' TOWABLE $ $286.34 | $742.70 | $1699.48
m. BOOM 40-50' ARTICULATING | $ $300.41 | %793.92 |%$1787.17
n. BOOM 60-64' TELESCOPIC $ $389.08 | $1029.08 | $2490.32
0. BOOM 76-80' TELESCOPIC $ $720.53 $1800.83 | $4069.04
p. $ $ $ $
9. $ $ $ $

End of proposal




Bid 6373
Town of Trumbull
Rental of Censtruction Equipment

Page 6 of 8
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

PROPOSAL continued
Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following:
Flagman: ] _/HR Overtime $ /HR
Laborer: $ _IHR Overtime $ HR
Driver: $ __JHR Overtime $ JHR
Operator $ __{HR Overtime ¢ MR
Supervisor: $ _/HR Overtime $ /HR
Material Markup percent__ % (Town will not allow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications requested are clearly and completely noted. Any altemate proposals

are presented in a similar format to those requested and are attached herein. It is understood that the T rves the right to reject

any or all proposals.

United Rentals (North America), Inc Alan Johnson

Company Name By (Signature) VV
552 HOUSATONIC AVE Alan Johnson

Address Print Name

BRIDGEPORT, CT 06604 Area General Manager

State & Zip Title

04/06/20 877-874-4468

Date Telephone/Fax

__govrents@ur.com unitedrentals.com

Email Website



Bid 6373

Town of Trumbult

Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 4 of 9

TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID # 6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
BID RESPONSE FORM FOR Nd{\ﬁ Bres Cou‘k KO
(éompany Name)

RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)

Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
5 {8 hours) (40 hours) {160 hours)
Low Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator - &
1 [1/3 Cu Yd. (with operator) £ AkX05 $ Lf 4 $ 3 k0. $ $
2 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 34 ydgax32e |8 qo~ |8 .7 |$ §
3 [Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 12ydgpzso  |$ (35~ (8 loso~ |$ $
4  [Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. s4e, [$ t70.7 |8 1%60 |3 $
5  |Crawler Excavator wi 50 footreach c it 3ys |8 (70" |3 1%60.7 |§ $
6 (Crawler Excavator w/ 75 foot reach $ $ $ $
Backhoe-Crawler Excavater 3/4 yd. c At 225 - -
7 lequipped with the hydraulic rock hammer S /6o $ 1280, § $
Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd.c 44335 - -
; equipped with the hydraulic rock hammer § /éo. sl $
9 Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. $ $ $ $
equipped with the hydraulic rock hammer
10 |Dragline 1 1/2 yd $ $ $ $
11 [Bucket Loader -Crawler 2 yd 4450 $ 10.7 (5§ 5607 |$ $
12 [Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd CA+955¢ $ o~ |$ 5600 |8 $
13 [Backhoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd.C At 414 S 4.7 |S Yov,~ |8 $
14 [Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2yd .~ At 455 $ 70.” $ S5e.” |$ $
15 Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 1/2yd ¢ A+ G4 $ 2. |8 LYo~ |§ $
16 (Bulldozer Crawler-100hp -, A4 Q% $ 5‘ - | Hq0,” |§ $
17 [Bulldozer Crawler-140hp ¢~ AT Db $ §5° |$ b~ | $
18 (Bulldozer Crawler-190 hp $ $ $ $
19 |Trucks-2 Axle, 6 yd Level Cap $ $ $ $
$
PO [Trucks-3 Axle, 13 yd 3 $ $




//@ﬁ\l gros.

Bid 6373
Town of Trumbuil

Rental of Construction Equipment

f
H/'E'”LW* opem{“, Page 5 of &
£ Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
2 {8 hours) (40 hours) {160 hours)
21 |Vibratory Roller 10-12 Tons - Bmag $ yg- | Dbo.” |3 $
22 JHarley Rake/Tractale(with operator) 4} $ 3¢5~ $ 28~ |3 $
23 [Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck 55tam. |8 55 ~ [$ UYUO,™ |$ $
24 |Crane 30T $ $ $ $
2 ISnowplow 42,000 GVWR or Greater w/ $ 3 $ $
jsander
26 {Truck -Triaxle 18 yard Dump pwg o f $ 35,7 |5 2¥0.7 |$ $
Infrared Spot Asphalt Restoration
27 Equipment $ $ $ )
Sanitary Sewer video equipment (includes
28 [recorder, labor & vehicles),(8" - 24) size $ $ $ $
ipes
Storm Sewer video equipment wirecorder
29 [(12 pipe or larger) $ $ $ $
(includes all labor & vehicles)
Push camera (8" pipe or smaller)
30 (includes all labor & vehicles) S § $ i
31 {33 Ton Crane Rear Mount $ $ $ $
32 |Utility Truck w/ tools $ $ $ )
33 [Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $ $ $ $




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull

Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 7 of 9

TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID # 6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional equipment at their disposal (along
with renlal rates) that may be available to the town.

Please indicate those items below:

RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
Item Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
2 |ASV otk S S |3 5~ |8 300~ | ;
b ASY Joteek Shid Sleam |3 35— |8 950~ |8 3
c. A8V 5 trd Shid Fer |8 4S,— |3 3s0.” |3 3
i CATM3IS Ribbes Vi Fraaab| 8 907 |8 p0.— |8 $
e [CAtm3o Rebbetie Frandin| 8 LOS — |8 P00 |9 ?
L Moy 30t o fucdtuk |8 557 |8 440 |9 5
g CAC 1) Grade $ 70,7 |% 0.7 |8 5
h $ $ $ $
. $ $ $ $
j § $ $ 5
k. $ $ $ $
l. $ $ $ 3
m $ $ $ $
n. $ $ $ $
0. $ $ $ $
p. $ $ $ $
q $ 3 $ $

End of proposal



Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Paged of 9
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
BID RESPONSE FORM FOR Uéq"t gras @wL AL
{Cémpany Name)
RENTAL RATE (WITH@llF OPERATOR)
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
E (8 hours) (40 hours) {160 hours)
. =
Low Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator z e - LR "
1 [113.Cu Yd. (with operator) v 265 $ w0 |8 w1 qqe0- | §
2 [Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd 4075 $ 158~ |8 [t $ &loo.- $ Koo
3 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 12ydpyeso |3 906~ 3 (oo |§ g0~ $ 32000.”
4  |Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd.%; $ 375 $ (gnn- |Y d9a- Y
§ [Crawler Excavator w/ S0 footreach CAT 345" |$ 335, |[$ - $ gqunn” $ 3) 60
6 [Crawler Excavator w/ 75 foot reach $ $ $ §
Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd.cAt )5 . - = oos "
d equipped with the hydraulic rock hammer $ ‘;‘;g- § g A e $ 351
Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. C4«22$ % w - s6d>"
8 equipped with the hydraulic rock hammer 5 35 e § qgeco. b e
9 Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawter Excavator 2 yd. $ 3 $ $
lequipped with the hydraulic rock hammer _
10  |Dragline 1 1/2 yd $ $ $ $
11 Bucket Loader -Crawler 2yd (" At 945L $ (357 |S rose - |8 sus— $ 400
12 [Bucket Loader-Crawler 3yd ¢ At 955, $ U557 |8 pogo.m |8 Sl S Ol g0
13 [Backhoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd. ¢ 4 4/ $ 15~ |8 9)o- $ Y4p60.” $ 1y,4006."
14 Bucket Loader-Wheel 212yd ¢ At 9%0  |$ [35.- (8 (080 |$ S § Jlp8
15 [Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 122 yd ¢ At 4 $ 145 | L6~ | S | 8 d)2ea”
16 [Bulldozer Crawler-100hp -t 0% $ (o |8 W S “m- $ (9,360,
17 [Buldozer Crawler-140hp ¢ A+ Db $ (507 |8 (b |8 ot $ J oo~
18 [Bulldozer Crawler-190 hp $ $ $ $
19 [Trucks-2 Axie, 6 yd Level Cap $ $ $ $
$
D0 [Trucks-3 Axle, 13 yd $ $ $
|




pegybns

Bid 6373
Town of Trumbut
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page50f 9
|
£ Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
= (8 hours) (40 hours) {160 hours)
21 |Vibratory Rolier 10-12 Tons ﬁw‘{ $ wo- |$ - |8 9o~ | § L9600
22 |Harley Rake/Tractate(with operator) Agu $ oo $ Yoo~ $ Hood." $ 16,000,
23 [Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck &Sy, $ (.- |8 ©ro |§ Y4oo- $ 17.600."
24 (Crane 30T $ $ $ $
Snowplow 42,000 GVWR or Greater w/
25 |odar $ $ $ $
26 [Truck -Triaxle 18 yard Dump ke $ ap- |8 307 |8 3boo | 8 1440
Infrared Spot Asphalt Restoration
27 e $ $ 3 $
[Equipment
Sanitary Sewer video equipment (includes
28 [recorder, labor & vehicles),(8" - 24") size $ $ $ $
ipes
Storm Sewer video equipment wirecorder
29 |(12 pipe or larger) $ $ $ $
{includes all labor & vehicles) ]
Push camera (8" pipe or smaller)
e {includes all labor & vehicles) $ $ $ $ |
31 {33 Ton Crane Rear Mount $ $ $ $
32 |Utility Truck w/ tools $ $ $ $
33 [Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $ $ $ $




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbus
Rental of Construction Equipment
/U@zﬁ? 8‘45 Page 7 of 9
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID # 6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional equipment at their disposal (along
with rental rates) that may be available to the town.

Please indicate those items below:

RENTAL RATE (WITHASI OPERATOR)

Item Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

o A3V 50 Frack Sked Fear § 40, |8 7307 |8 3600 |S (4ue0
b. AS0 20 T reck SttidS¥er $ (0o~ |% geo.” |$ Yoaooo |$ G, —
c ASVDS TSI Sor |3 (1 |3 we0.m |8 UMoO” | S vy 400,
d ORT 1315 Rubbortve Bradde |8 155~ |3 | 7aok” |8 200~ |8 gegso.:
e CAMSD RubbetueGawly | S (700 |8 13607 |8 bewm |8 phaco
s CA (G roder 5 135 |$ (of0. |$ SY0.m |5 M6,
g Moy Wior oM Radtnch |8 120~ |$ qpo.” |$ A |$ (2w
h. $ $ $ $

. $ $ $ $

J $ $ $ $

k. $ $ $ $

l. $ $ $ $

m. $ $ $ $

n. $ $ $ $

0. $ $ $ $

p. $ $ $ $

Q. $ $ $ $

End of proposal
TOWN OF TRUMBULL



Bid 6373

Town of Trumbuil
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 6of9
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID # 6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL continued
Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following:
Flagman: $ HR Overtime $ HR
Laborer: s 557 /HR Overtime § 5= /HR
Driver: $ 55— JHR Overtime s 75" MR
Operator $ 65~ HR Overtime - .- HR
Supervisor: § IO~ JHR Overtime $ loS. JHR
Material Markup percent /o % (Town will not allow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications requested are clearly and completely noted. Any allernate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are attached herein. It is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject
any or all proposais.

/03—?\% gf‘b‘.') 0@)" .LL&

Company Name By (Signature)
£50 Wain St Lsywan 1S Aoy 4
Address Print Name J/
Pokroe. Cho6eLp CES [ Moven
State & Zip Title -
2.24-20 Js3 L6FoLsy
Date Telephone/Fax
N\ bfb e asl.com s ; CoV

Email Y Website



TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

Bid 6373

Yown of Trumbull

Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 4 of

BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
S Ou 7%?/00/?3 Mé"‘/f LL L,
(Company Name)
RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
Equipment [Per Hour Per Day Per Waok Per Month
H (8 hours) 40 hours) (160 hours)
| ow Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator $ $ $ $
1__]1/3 Cu Yd. (with operator)
2 [Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 34 yd $ $ $ $
3 Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ $ $ $
4  [Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. $ $ $ $
§  [Crawler Excavator wi-6@ foot reach (,zr') S X80 |STRO- e |8 360000 | 8/ 1w 0]
6 [Crawler Excavator w/ 75 foot reach $ $ $ $ i
2 Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd. $ $ $ $
ipped with the hydraulic rock hammer
8 ckhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ s $ $
ipped with the hydraulic rock hammer
|9 ckhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. 3 s $ $
uipped with the hydraulic rock hammer
10 [Dragline 1 12 yd $ $ $ $
11 |Bucket Loader -Crawler 2 yd $ $ $ $
12 Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd $ $ $ $
13 [Backhoe-Whee! Loader 1/2 yd. $ $ $ $
14 [Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2 yd 8457 00 |SOR0- 0|4 R600-00\ $/G% e 20
15 [Bucket Loader-Wheej 3 1/2 yd $ $ $ $
16 {Bulldozer Crawler-100 hp $ $ $ $
17 Bulidozer Crawler-140 hp $ $ $ $
18 [Bulldozer Crawler-190 hp $ $ $ i $
19 [Trucks2 Axle, 6 yd Level Cap $:05- )0 |8,700-2p |8 Joo9 20 | $ S pp0-00
$
0 [Trucks-3 Axle, 13 yd s 35-00 gyﬂ 00 3/5[00'&0 S5622-bo




Town of Trumbudl
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 5 of §
£ Equipment {Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
k-] {8 hours) (40 hours) (160 hours)
21 Mibratory Roller 10-12 Tons SE .00 |SFR0-0p |$/600-00 | $ 45 M- 00
22 Harley Rake/Tractate{with operator) $ $ $ $
23 [Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck $ $ $ $
24 Crane 30T $ $ $ $
42,000 GVWR or Greater w/
25 prowmow $ $ s s
26 [Truck -Triaxie 18 yard Dump $ $ $ $
nirared Spot Asphalt Restoration
27 ke cuipment $ $ $ $
itary Sewer video equipment (includes
28 e , labor & vehicles),(8" - 247) size $ $ $ $
Sewer video equipment w/recorder
29 K12 pipe or larger) $ $ $ $
includes ail labor & vehicles)
tamera (8" pipe or smaller) $ $ $ K
includes all labor & vehicles)
31 [33 Ton Crane Rear Mount $ $ $ $
32 |Utility Truck wi tools $65.00 |$.500-00 |$R600-00 | $ /4 %00-00
$ $ $ $

33 {Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass




Bid 6373

Town of Tnambutl
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page6of 9
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL continued
Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following:
Flagman: s 60-00 Overtime s 40 R
Laborer: s b0- 00 HR Overtime s b0
Driver: s L0090 Overtime s L0
Operator s 4000 Overtime s 00-00
Supervisor: s. 7500 MR Overtime s 7500  mm
Matorial Markup percent__ /2% (Town will not aliow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications requested are clearly and completely noted. Any altemate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are attached herein. It is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject
any or all proposals.

é"F Ou%oéol et i Lred L %
\J

By (Sgfiature)
70 Bax 062 m_cggwd T~ [Fabrrz)
ﬂ/ﬂﬁt’f CT oEges pwner [ggeraliz
¢/ 22020 Cell- 203-258- /45
Date TelephonesFax
fGF Outcloor. mfHCe —

E""@G%:/-@om Horsle



A H dii A’Iﬂf S Bid 6273

MU o ofof

con Tov'nn of Tr_umbull
opera’or or driwer 7er Avuys e 4 of 8
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
BIDRESPONSEFORMFOR_ /1257 rons [Exc aval 1N
{Company Name)
RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
Equipment Ter Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
E (8 hours) (40 hours} (160 hours)
Low Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator $ $ $ $
1__ /3 Cu Yd. (with operator) [25. .09 j0009)® 5000.0d * 2000068
£_Pagion ool Exrer 40 Y [49.0V 1% 120093 5L 00.04 ® 22 %0004
3  |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ /(;- ki $ /320.09 $ ££00.00 $2£ 400.9)
4  [Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. $ ;‘1 5, 90 $ {$00. 0() $ 7ﬂ00 J J| $ ?55'(90 loV
5 |Crawler Excavator w/ 50 foot reach $ N A___j $ $ -
6 [Crawler Excavator w/ 75 foot reach $ A / B 18 $ |8 .
Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd. o _
7 loquipped with the hydraulic rock hammer Sarofay |1 1390.005925009] 37000
ackhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. o XA -
8 Equipped with the hydraulic rock hammer $4g_eé.,., 52 L5009 $/3 259.99] ¥ 5 3000.04
9 E:ckhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. $ A $ _ $ s
uipped with the hydraulic rock hammer 7 Ll?d [£300 6520000
0 |Dragline 11/2yd sm/ H T+ s 15 _—
11 [Bucket Loader -Crawler 2 yd $/50,00 |¥1200.0|% ¢ 000.4) $24%000.00
12 |Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd $ /1/ A T §
13 |Backhoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd. Tz p) 137¢0.00|%3%00.907] % ]%20p.
14 [Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2 yd $ 7;”/": $ 1Y00.00 $ 7000 $ 2%004, 0 )
IS [Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 1/2 yd $ $/500 0d $ g00. 0 § 3£009 )@
16 bulldozer Crawler-100 hp $ ’r”";gi $ 15 50.00 $777‘y.0‘7 $ 20 000. O
" et i
17 |Bulldozer Crawler-140 hp $ e i Sl 250 y¢ $ 750.ad *}Fﬂﬂo, y
18  |Bulldozer Crawler-190 hp $ i $ 1950 (7(: $ 29 ‘:,"7‘0' $ 37303' )
19 [Trucks-2 Axle, 6 yd Level Cap $ $ $ $
$
PO [Trucks-3 Axle, 13 yd $ $ $
! 60.07" Y%0.09 | 2900.09 %00,07




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 5 of 9
3 Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
= (8 hours) {40 hours) (160 hours)
A
21 |Vibratory Rofter 10-12 Tons S e, i $ /000,00 $ 5000-00 $ 20000 O3
2 pariey Rapa/ Tl perei) Yot des|¥12 00,63 6ogo. pi| * 2400000
23 [Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck SWA —— $ $
24 [Crane 30T $ (VA - $
ISnowplow 42,000 GVWR or Greater wf
25 ander ¢ l/A— T $ »
£ [k Triede 16 yeed Dimp $70.09 (56002 1%2%60.00] *1200.00
Infrared Spot Asphalt Restoration
27 fe quipment WA : .
Sanitary Sewer video equipment (includes
28 Fecorder, labor & vehicles),(8" - 24") size $ $ =
pos s
Storm Sewer video equipment w/recorder
29 |12 pipe or larger) $ 43 3
(includes al labor & vehicles) Vo ?/%7
Push camera (8" pipe or smaller) T
30@@@11@«&@%} d o p e $
31 [33 Ton Crane Rear Mount $ /A h % -3
32 Utiity Truck w/ tools S £0.00(% cc50,00[% 2%00.00| $ 7600, ()
33 [Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $ $ $ $




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page7 of 9
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional equipment at their disposal {along
with rental rates) that may be available to the town,

Please indicate those items below:

RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)

item Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

2 250 gL doges|P 100 00 |¥ ¥00.0Q 7000 py | % {40009/
> 20 2’}{@_ AF 20.07 % 4000|832 00.00%)2 500. W
% 955 TD bucker losgd (0000 §00.00]% 7000.04| % (£000.

d. $ $ $ $

e. $ $ $ $

f $ $ $ $

g $ $ $ $

h. $ $ $ )

. $ $ $ $

j $ $ $ $

k $ $ $ $

I $ $ $ )

m. $ $ $ $

n. $ $ $ $

0. $ $ $ $

p. $ $ $ $

q $ $ $ $

End of proposal
TOWN OF TRUMBULL



Bid 6373

) © Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page6of9

TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID # 6373 DUE: April 7, 202¢ @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL continued

Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following:

Flagman: $ 35.0U mR Overtime $ _20.00mr
Laborer: $ “0.0J MR Overtime $ RO mr
Driver: $ 40.0¢ _mr Overtime $ €0 62 mr
Operator $ 9500 MR Overtime $ €2 0IMR
Supervisor: $ 60.00 MR Overtime $ 70 04 mr
Material Markup percent _JL% {Town will not allow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications requested are clearly and completely noted. Any altemate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are attached herein. [t is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject
any or all proposals.

/VQ'q}L/‘ar“ /_:'—)rcql/a/)ng 47)”1 %

Company Name By4{Signature)
J@Sff;a/“e%, /2/ Jim  Macfron,
Address Print Name
Eaglon <1 0(6(2 owrt e
State & Zip Tite
4/=>/2020 203 2¢(5557
Date Telephone/Fax

Mas/)ronsexca valing. L7t
Email Website




RELIABLE EXCAVATING CO,, INC. Bid 6373

15 Bates Place, Danbury, CT 06810 Town of Trumbull
Ph: (203) 743-4856, Fax: (203) 743-7316 2 :
Web. www.reliableexcavatingco.com Rental ofConshudmné%uelp:n;n;
E-mail’ reliableco@sbcglobal.nat
Geica TOWN OF TRUMBULL
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HiIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID #6373 DUE: April7,2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
BID RESPONSE FORM FOR Reliable Excavating Co., Inc.
{Company Name)

RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

E (8 hours) {40 hours) (160 hours)

- ‘{?swc‘ffﬁ‘:‘m;;i_ﬁ- Bxcavalor |¢  42500{$ 1,00000({$ 5000.00{$ 20000.00
2 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd $ 100001 % BOO.OO | $  4,00000{% 16,000.00
3 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ 12500 |$  1,00000|$% 500000($ 20,000.00
4  |Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2yd.| $ 160.00|$  1,20000 %  6,00000]$% 24,000.00
5 {Crawler Excavator w/ 50 foot reach No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 |Crawler Excavator w/ 75 foot reach No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 Basi"h"a'a’i;‘”f:; i"ﬁ;ﬂ;“rg:k’fm $  17500($  140000($  7,000.00 |$ 28,000.00
8 Bﬁmwiﬁ”ﬂzi‘z&r‘:ﬁrl;i:fﬁm $  17500]|$ 140000($ 7.00000|$ 28,000.00
g |Packlos crawerExcavator 2yd equbbedl s 20000 |s  160000|S 800000 |$ 3200000
10 |Dragline 1 1/2 yd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 |Bucket Loader-Crawler 2 yd $ 12500 | § 1,000.00 | § 5,000.00 {$ 20,000.00
12 |Bucket Loader-Crawier 3 yd $ 12500 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 5,000.001% 20,000.00
13 |Backhoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd. $ 90.00 | % 720.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 14,400.00
14 |Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2 yd $ 125.00 | § 1,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
15 |Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 1/2 yd $ 150001 § 1,200.00 | 6,00000[$ 24,000.00
16 |Bulldozer Crawler-100 hp $ 10000 | § 800.00 | § 4,000.00 | $ 16,000.00
17 {Bulldozer Crawler-140 hp $ 15000} % 1,20000% § 6,00000{% 24,000.00
18 |Bulldozer Crawler-190 hp $ 20000 | $ 1,600.00 | 8,000.00 | $ 32,000.00
19 {Trucks-2 Axe, 6yd Level Cap $ 75.001 8% 600.001 $ 30000018 12,000.00
20 |Trucks-3 Axe, 13yd $ 10000 | § 800.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 16,000.00




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbult
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page50f 7
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
5 (8 hours) (40 hours) (160 hours)
21 |Vibratory Roller 10-12 Tons $ 10000 | § 800.00 | % 4,000.00{ $ 18,000.00
22 {Harly Rake/Tractate(with operator) $ 12500{$ 1,00000{$ 500000|$ 20,000.00
23 |Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck $ 125.00 | § 1,000.00{ % 5,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
24 [Crane 30T No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ey {Showplow 2,000 GYIWR or Creater $  17500($ 140000{$ 7.00000($ 28,000.00
wisander
26 |Truck-Triaxe 18 yard Dump $ 125.00 | $ 100000 | $ 5,00000 | $ 20,000.00
g7 |Infrared Spot Asphalt Restoration No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Equipment
Sanitary Sewer video equipment (includes
28 |recorder, labor & vehicles),(8"-24") size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
pipes
Storm Sewer video equipment wirecorder
29 {(12 pipe or farger) (inctudeds aff labor & No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
vehicles)
Push camera (8" pipe or smaller) (includes : . : .
30 ol ishior & vahicias] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 |33 Ton Crane Rear Mount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 |Utility Truck w/ toois $ 150.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 6,00000|%$ 2400000
33 |Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass $ 500.00 | $ 400000 |% 20,000.00|% 80,000.00

RELIABLE EXCAVATING CO.,, INC.
15 Bates Place, Danbury, CT 06810
Ph: (203) 743-4856, Fax: (203) 743-7316
Web: www.reliableexcavatingco.com
E-mail: reiiableco@sbcglobal.net



Bid 6373

RELIABLE EXCAVATING CO,, INC. Town of Trumbll

15 Bates Place, Danbury, CT 06810 Rental of Construction Equipment
Ph: (203) 743-4856, Fax: (203) 743-7316 Page 7 of 7

Web: www.reliableexcavatingco.com

E-mail: reliableco@sbeglobal.net TOWN OF TRUMBULL
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April7,2020 @ 2:00 PM

PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

in addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional
equipment at their disposal (along with rental rates) that may be available to the town.

Please indicate those items below:

RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)

ltem Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

a. Roller 1-3 Ton $ 50001 % 400.00 | $ 2,00000 1% 7,999.90
b. Roller 3-5 Tons $ 7500 % 600.00 | § 3,00000|§ 11,8900.90
c. Roller 5-8 Tons $ B5001$% 68000 1%  340000(% 13,599.90
d. Roller Dirt Compactor 10-20 Tons $ 100.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 4,00000(|% 15,999.90
e Blow Knox Paver 14' PF115 $ 150.00 | $ 1,20000{$ 6,000.001% 23,999.90
£ Air Compressor/fHammer $ 75.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 3,00000|% 11,9990
g. Cement Mixer $ 50.00 | 40000 | § 200000 | $ 7,996.80
h. Cut off saw 14" $ 25001 % 20000 | § 1,00000 | $ 3,899.90
i Concrete/Asphalt 16"-18" Saw $ 5000 % 400.00 | $ 2,00000 | % 7,999.90
] Concrete/Asphalt 36" Road Saw $ 75.001 % 600001 % 3,000001§ 11,9082.90
k. Skid Steer New Holland 180-L $ 10000 | § 800.00 | $ 400000 [ $ 15988.90
1. Skid Steer New Holtand 180-L w/broom| $ 100.001 $ 80000{$ 400000{1% 1599990
m. how Holand 18" Miller for Asphalt 1§ 25000{s  200000($ 1000000 s 39,999.90

oncrete

n. Pump 2-3" $ 2500} % 20000 | $ 1,000.00 | § 3,999.90
o. Curb Machine 4"-8" mold $ 7500 | § 600.00 | § 3,00000 % 11,999.90
p. Trench Box $ 100.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 4,000001% 15999.80
q. Road Plates $ 75.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 300000 % 11,999.90




Bid 6373

RELIABLE EXCAVATING CO., INC. Town of Trumbull

15 Bates Place, Danbury, CT 06810 Rental of Construction Equipment
Ph: (203) 743-4866, Fax: (203) 743-7316 Page 8

Web: www.reliableexcavatingco.com

E-mail: reliableco@sbceglobal.net TOWN OF TRUMBULL
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April7,2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional
equipment at their disposal (along with rental rates) that may be available to the town.

Please indicate those items below:

RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)

item Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month

r. Jumping Rammer or Plate Tamper $ 50001% 400001 % 2000008 7,999.90
s. Excavator PC-78 $ 10000 | $ 800.00 | § 4,00000|9% 15999.90
t. Excavator PC-228 $ 12500 |$ 1,00000|$ 500000 |$ 19,999.90
u. Excavator PC-308 $ 15000 [$  1,20000|$ 600000 |$ 23,999.90
v. Brush Stump Grinder $ 25000 [$ 200000{$ 10,00000}% 39,999.80
w. 1995 Brush Wood chipper $ 7500 | $ 60000 [$  3,00000|% 11,999.90
X. Road Grader $ 20000 |[$ 160000|$ 8000.00!$ 3199080
y. Komatsu PC78 5/8 cy $ 12500($ 100000|$ 500000{% 19,999.90
2. :322:?;,5’;?"?‘:; Backhoe/Trench | ¢ 412500|$  1,00000($ 500000]$ 19,999.90
aa. smgf?grygamoemem $  15000|$ 120000{$ 600000|$ 23999.90
bb. Excavator/Hybreak Hammer 3,500lbs | $ 200001 % 1,600.00 | $ 8,000.00 (% 31,999.90
cc. John Doere 510C 4x4 1,000 Hybreaker| . 12500{$  100000{$ 500000 {$ 19.999.90
dd. John Deere 410C 4x4 Extenhoe $ 100.00 | $ 800.00 |$  4,00000|$ 15999.80
ee. John Deere York Rake 7' $ 100.00 | $ 800.00{$  4,00000|$% 15999.90
ff. Utility Trailer 10 Tons $ 75.00 | $ 600.00|$  3,00000|% 11,999.90
gg. Low bed 40 Tons $ 12500 ({$ 1,00000|$ 500000|$% 19,999.90
hh. Low bed to move Machines 50 Tons | $ 150.00 [ $ 120000 $ 6,00000|% 23,900.90




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 9
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID # 6373 DUE: Aprii7,2020 @ 2:00PM
PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)
In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request, responders are requested to list any additional
equipment at their disposal (along with rental rates) that may be avaiiable to the town.
Please indicate those items below:
RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
ltem Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
ii. CAT D25 Hal truck $ 200001 % 1,600001 % 8,000.001% 31,999.90
i Screener Reeds RD90 $ 15000 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 6,000.00 | § 23,999.90
kk. Sander or Salter $ 7500 | $ 600.00|% 3,00000}% 1199980
. Hay Blower $ 100.00 ( $ B00.OO|$  4,000.00|% 15999.90
mm. Dozer D5 $ 125.00 | $ 1,00000$ 500000}% 19,999.80
nn. Dozer D8K Ripper $ 250.00 | $ 2,000.00|$ 10,00000|% 39,998.90
00. Track Crusher 36x42 $ 500.00 | § 400000 |$ 20,000.00]|$% 79,999.90
Pp. Foreman $ 60.00 | § 48000|% 240000|%  9,599.90
qq. Mason Labor $ 60.00 | % 480.00 (| § 2,400.00 | $ 9,599.90
. Mechanic with Tools $ 65.00 | $ 52000 $ 260000(|§ 10,388.90
SS. Carpenter with tools $ 75.00 | § 60000({$ 300000|% 11,999.90
tt. Truck with hand tools $ 100.001{ $ 800.001 % 4000.00{% 15999.80
uu. Tree Crew with Truck and Chipper $ 350001 % 2,80000|% 1400000|9% 55990080
w. randecape 4 Man Crewwith Truckand | s 25000 200000 1000000 [  39,999.90
ww,  [iemationalGcy 4300 plow 11'wih 1g  20000s  160000(S  8000.00|$ 31,008.90

RELIABLE EXCAVATING CO., INC.
15 Bates Place, Danbury, CT 06810
Ph: (203) 743-4856, Fax: (203) 743-7316
Web: www.reliableexcavatingco.com
E-mail: reliableco@sbcglobal.net




TOWN OF TRUMBULL
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment

ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL

THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021

BID #6373 DUE: April7,2020 @ 2:00PM

PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

Also inciude hourly rates and pricing for the following:

50.00 /HR Overtime 3 65.00 /HR
50.00 HR Overtime $ 65.00 HR
60.00 MR Overtime $ 75.00 HR
60.00 /HR Overtime $ 75.00 MR
60.00 /HR Overtime 3 7500 MR

Flagman: 3
Laborer: $
Driver: $
Operator: $
Supervisor: $
Material Markup percent

15 % (Town will not allow more then 15%) recommendation is 10%

Page6of 7

The undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and ceriffies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
condiions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specificaions requested are clearly and completely noted. Any aitemnate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are atlached herein. It is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject

any or alf proposats.

Reliable Excavating Co., Inc.

Company Name

By

15 Bates Place-Unit#1, Danbury, CT 06810 Angelo W. Grossi Sr.

Address

Connecticut 06810

State & Zip

April 7, 2020

Date

reliableco@sbcglobal.net

Email

Print Name

President

Title

Tel, 203-743-4856 / Fax. 203-743-7316

TelephonefFax

na

Website

RELIABLE EXCAVATING CO., INC.
15 Bates Place, Danbury, CT 06810
Ph: (203) 743-4856, Fax: (203) 743-7316
Web: www.reliableexcavatingco.com
E-mail. reliableco@sbeglobal.net



Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 4 of 9
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION E
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND P L Lt
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL FORM
s responseFornFor RED (oncid Teoaktg Co WL
(Company Name)
RENTAL RATE (WITHQUT OPERATOR)
Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
£ {8 hours) (40 hours) {160 hours)
Low Ground Pressure Crawler Excavator $ $ $ $
1 |173 Cu Yd {with operator)
Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd $ $ $ $
3 |Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. $ $ $ $
4 Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd $ 300 $ 2400 |3 2060 | $ L4B0COD
5  |Crawler Excavator wi 50 foot reach $ $ $ $
6 |Crawler Excavator wi 75 foot reach $ $ $ $
7 Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 3/4 yd. 5 5 $ $
equipped with the hydraulic rock hammer
8 Backhoe-Crawler Excavator 1 1/2 yd. g $ $ $
equipped with the hydraulic rock harmmer
g Backhoe-Hydraulic Crawler Excavator 2 yd. $ 5 g $
equipped with the hydraulic rock hammer
10 |Dragline 1 1/2 yd § $ 38 $
11 (Bucket Loader -Crawler 2 yd b $ $ b
12 |Bucket Loader-Crawler 3 yd $ $ L $
13  |Backhoe-Wheel Loader 1/2 yd. $ $ 3 $
14  [Bucket Loader-Wheel 2 1/2 yd $ $ 5 $
15 |Bucket Loader-Wheel 3 1/2 yd § Z 25 1800 |¥ C’ 000 | ® 36 00O
16  |Bulldozer Crawler-100 hp $ 3 $ b3
17 |Bulldozer Crawler-140 hp $ $ $ 3
18 |Bulldozer Crawler-190 hp $ $ $ $
19 [Trucks-2 Axle, 6 yd Level Cap $ $ $ 3
$
0 [Trucks-3 Axle, 13 yd $ $ $




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Rental of Construction Equipment
Page 50of 9
£ Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
2 {8 hours) (40 hours) {160 hours)
21 |Vibratory Roller 0-12 Tons $ § $ $
22 |Harley Rake/Tractate(with operator) $ $ $ $
23 [Tractor Trailer w/35T Gooseneck $ $ $ $
24 |Crane 30T $ $ $ 3
Snowplow 42,000 GVWR or Greater w/
25 vl 5 $ $ $
26 [Truck -Triaxle 18 yard Dump 5 110, |8 a830 |3 UYoo | $ 1 16oe
Infrared Spot Asphalt Restoration
i Equipment § § $ 3
Sanitary Sewer video quipment (includes
28 [recorder, labor & vehicies),(8" - 247) size $ $ $ $
ipes
Storm Sewer video equipment wirecorder
29 {{12 pipe or larger) $ $ $ $
{includes all iabor & vehicles)
Push camera (8" pipe or smaller}
1 fincludes all labor & vehicles) 3 . : .
31 [33 Ton Crane Rear Mount $ $ $ $
32 [Utility Truck w/ tools $ $ 3 $
33 [Temporary Pumps for Sewage Bypass 3 3 % $




Bid 6373

Town of Trumbult

Rental of Construction Equipment

Page 7 of 8

TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

PROPOSAL FORM (Continued)

In addition to the equipment specified in the bid request. responders are requested lo list any additional equipment at their disposal (along
with rental rates) that may be available to the town.

Please indicate those items below

RENTAL RATE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)

Item Equipment Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month
a 5 $ $ $
b. \ s ) ) s
¢ _\\ $ $ $ $
g A\ s s s )
e N\ N s 5 5 5
f NS ; ; ;
9. \ $ $ $ $
h $ $ $ $
. $ $ $ $
J $ $ $ $
k $ $ $ $
! $ $ $ $
m $ $ $ $
n $ $ $ $
0 $ $ $ $
p. $ $ $ $
q $ $ $ $
End of proposal

TOWN OF TRUMBULL



Bid 6373

Town of Trumbull
Renlal of Construction Equipment
Page 6 of 9
TOWN OF TRUMBULL
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
ON CALL RENTAL OF CONSTRUCTION & HIGHWAY EJUIPMENT AND PERSONNEL
. THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021
BID #6373 DUE: April 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM
PROPOSAL continued
Also include hourly rates and pricing for the following:
Flagman: $ HR Overtime $ HR
Laborer: $ HR Overtime $ /HR
Driver: $ Z5 JHR Overtime s 37,50 m
Operator s 0 MR Overtime s &GO MR
Supervisor: $ HR Overtime 3 HR
Material Markup percent % (Town will not allow more than 15%) recommendation is 10%

Thie undersigned hereby submits proposal(s) for the request noted above and certifies that this proposal meets all the specifications and
conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the specifications reguested are clearly and completely noted. Any alternate proposals
are presented in a similar format to those requested and are attached herein. It is understood that the Town reserves the right to reject
any or all proposals.

ReD Goaert Tewexing (b
Company Name By (&fgnature)
550 (emmerce DR. THOMAS BENNE T
Address Print Name
State & Zip Title
3-19q-Z2020 203-3¢7- 9104
Date Telephone/Fax

ReED CoﬁCL—\T@.’:‘_(.u;{_(Nq@é\m&t{ RED Coad.a"t(auc_muc-] . Comy

Email Website



