TOWN OF TRUMBULL, CONNECTICUT
BOARD OF EDUCATION
REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL
TRUMBULL HIGH SCHOOL TENNIS COURTS

BID 6187

BID RESULTS: 6187

DUE: May-26,2016-@2:00PM

Friday May 27, 2016, @ 2pm

Company NAME: DEERING CONSTRUCTION

Item #1 — Preparation/Removals

Base Bid Price: $69,700.00

Item #2 — Drainage Work

Base Bid Price: $15,500.00

Item #3 — Tennis Court Net Post Footings and Center Strap Anchors

Base Bid Price: $6,700.00

Item #4 - Fencing

Base Bid Price: $68,600.00

Item #5 — Paving

Base Bid Price: $69,200.00

Item #6 - Court Surface Work (6 Courts)

Base Bid Price: $49,300.00

Item #7 — Court Entry Modifications

Base Bid Price: $1,000.00

Item #8 — Net Posts, Nets and Center Straps

Base Bid Price: $4,200.00




Item #9 - Windscreens

Base Bid Price: $6,400.00

Total 1-9 $290,600.00

ALTERNATE BID PRICING:

Item #1 — Eliminate the Perimeter Curb

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $12,000.00

Item #2 — Eliminate One Coat of Acrylic Color

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $9,000.00

Item #3 — Maintain Existing Fence Posts

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $11,000.00

Total with Paving $258,600.00 With No Alts = 290,600.00

Adding- ITEM #10 = POST TENSION CONCRETE Total Bid Price add Items 1 through 9

$ NO POST TENSION CONCRETE BID

Company NAME: ATWATER PAVING
Item #1 — Preparation/Removals

Base Bid Price: $30,239.00

Item #2 — Drainage Work

Base Bid Price: $15,150.00

Item #3 — Tennis Court Net Post Footings and Center Strap Anchors

Base Bid Price: $6,710.00

Item #4 - Fencing

Base Bid Price: $66,360.00




Item #5 — Paving

Base Bid Price: $107,201.00

Item #6 - Court Surface Work (6 Courts)

Base Bid Price: $47,586.00

Item #7 — Court Entry Modifications

Base Bid Price: $4,800.00

Item #8 — Net Posts, Nets and Center Straps

Base Bid Price: $4,235.00

Item #9 - Windscreens

Base Bid Price: $6,435.00

ALTERNATE BID PRICING:

Item #1 — Eliminate the Perimeter Curb

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $14,500.00

Item #2 — Eliminate One Coat of Acrylic Color

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $9,000.00

Item #3 — Maintain Existing Fence Posts

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $10,800.00

Total with Paving $254,416.00 With No Alts = 288,716.00

Adding- ITEM #10 = POST TENSION CONCRETE Total Bid Price add Items 1 through 9

$ NO POST TENSION CONCRETE BID




Company NAME: ACE TENNIS COURT BUILDERS

Item #1 — Preparation/Removals

Base Bid Price: $900.00

Item #2 — Drainage Work

Base Bid Price: $7,500.00

Item #3 — Tennis Court Net Post Footings and Center Strap Anchors

Base Bid Price: $4,000.00

Item #4 - Fencing

Base Bid Price: $49,200.00

Item #5 — Paving

Base Bid Price: SNA SUBMITTING POST TENSION CONCRETE

Item #6 - Court Surface Work (6 Courts)

Base Bid Price: $53,778.00

Item #7 — Court Entry Modifications

Base Bid Price: $300.00

Item #8 — Net Posts, Nets and Center Straps

Base Bid Price: $2,200.00

Item #9 - Windscreens

Base Bid Price: $5,850.00

ALTERNATE BID PRICING:

Item #1 — Eliminate the Perimeter Curb

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): __ NA post tension slab extends past fence post




Item #2 — Eliminate One Coat of Acrylic Color

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $9,850.00

Item #3 — Maintain Existing Fence Posts

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $10,800.00

Adding- ITEM #10 = POST TENSION CONCRETE Total Bid Price add Items 1 through 9
$ 308,928.00 with Post tension concrete

Total with post Tension $308,928.00 With No Alts = $329,578.00

Company NAME: SPORT-TECH CONSTRUCTION
Item #1 — Preparation/Removals

Base Bid Price: $68,900.00

Item #2 — Drainage Work

Base Bid Price: $25,300.00

Item #3 — Tennis Court Net Post Footings and Center Strap Anchors

Base Bid Price: $14,700.00

Item #4 - Fencing

Base Bid Price: $69,320.00

Item #5 — Paving

Base Bid Price: $106,840.00

Item #6 - Court Surface Work (6 Courts)

Base Bid Price: $46,100.00

Item #7 — Court Entry Modifications

Base Bid Price: $20,000.00




Item #8 — Net Posts, Nets and Center Straps

Base Bid Price: $3,000.00

Item #9 - Windscreens

Base Bid Price: $8,160.00

Total 1-9 $ 362,320.00

ALTERNATE BID PRICING:

Item #1 — Eliminate the Perimeter Curb

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): 20,000.00

Item #2 - Eliminate One Coat of Acrylic Color

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $6,000.00

Item #3 — Maintain Existing Fence Posts

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $15,000.00

Adding- ITEM #10 = POST TENSION CONCRETE Total Bid Price add Items 1 through 9
$ with Post tension concrete and all items 1-9 =$ 367,000.00

Total with post Tension $367,000.00 With No Alts = $408,000.00

Company NAME: R.S. SITE AND SPORTS

Item #1 — Preparation/Removals

Base Bid Price: S 35,794.56

Item #2 - Drainage Work

Base Bid Price: $19,053.97




Item #3 — Tennis Court Net Post Footings and Center Strap Anchors

Base Bid Price: $6,633.20

Item #4 - Fencing

Base Bid Price: $57,072.30

Item #5 — Paving

Base Bid Price: S 94,625.07

Item #6 - Court Surface Work (6 Courts)

Base Bid Price: $46,968.00

Item #7 — Court Entry Modifications

Base Bid Price: $5,021.25

Item #8 — Net Posts, Nets and Center Straps

Base Bid Price: $4,088.07

Item #9 - Windscreens

Base Bid Price: $1,928.16

Total 1-9$ 271,184.58

ALTERNATE BID PRICING:

Item #1 — Eliminate the Perimeter Curb

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $11,000.00

Item #2 — Eliminate One Coat of Acrylic Color

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $6,700.00

Item #3 — Maintain Existing Fence Posts

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $4,000.00

Adding- ITEM #10 = POST TENSION CONCRETE Total Bid Price add Items 1 through 9



$ 198,440.49 *** could be only for Post tension concrete in place of item #5 and not 1
through 9

Total Price $ 249,484.58 With no alts = $ 374,999.51 ** Note —in Lieu of Milling or Reclaiming
the existing Asphalt install New Post Tensioned concrete slab over existing Asphalt they would
decut $ 27,100 so their total for Post tension over existing would be $347,899.51

Company NAME: G. PIC & SONS

Item #1 — Preparation/Removals

Base Bid Price: $75,000.00

Item #2 — Drainage Work

Base Bid Price: $24,000.00

Item #3 — Tennis Court Net Post Footings and Center Strap Anchors

Base Bid Price: $8,000.00

Item #4 - Fencing

Base Bid Price: $72,000.00

Item #5 — Paving

Base Bid Price: $90,000.00

Item #6 - Court Surface Work (6 Courts)

Base Bid Price: $48,000.00

Item #7 — Court Entry Modifications

Base Bid Price: $2,500.00

Item #8 — Net Posts, Nets and Center Straps

Base Bid Price: $5,000.00

Item #9 - Windscreens

Base Bid Price: $7,500.00




TOTAL 1-9 = $332,000.00

ALTERNATE BID PRICING:

Item #1 — Eliminate the Perimeter Curb

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $21,000.00

Item #2 - Eliminate One Coat of Acrylic Color

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $10,000.00

Item #3 — Maintain Existing Fence Posts

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $10,000.00

Adding- ITEM #10 = POST TENSION CONCRETE Total Bid Price add Items 1 through 9

$_ 332,000.00 With No Alts =$ 373,000.00

Company NAME: TIL INDUSTRIES — dba- DALTON TRACK & TENNIS

Item #1 — Preparation/Removals

Base Bid Price: S NO BID

Item #2 - Drainage Work

Base Bid Price: S NO BID

Item #3 — Tennis Court Net Post Footings and Center Strap Anchors

Base Bid Price: S NO BID

Item #4 - Fencing

Base Bid Price: S NO BID

Item #5 — Paving

Base Bid Price: S NO BID

Item #6 - Court Surface Work (6 Courts)



Base Bid Price: $25,527.00

Item #7 — Court Entry Modifications

Base Bid Price: S NO BID

Item #8 — Net Posts, Nets and Center Straps

Base Bid Price: S NO BID

Item #9 - Windscreens

Base Bid Price: S NO BID

ALTERNATE BID PRICING:

Item #1 — Eliminate the Perimeter Curb

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): S NO BID

Item #2 - Eliminate One Coat of Acrylic Color

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): $4,000.00

Item #3 — Maintain Existing Fence Posts

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): S NO BID

Adding- ITEM #10 = POST TENSION CONCRETE Total Bid Price add Items 1 through 9

$ $ NO BID

Total Item #6 only S 25,527.00




Company NAME: CLASSIC TURF

Item #1 — Preparation/Removals

Base Bid Price: $5,000.00

Item #2 — Drainage Work

Base Bid Price: $10,000.00

Item #3 — Tennis Court Net Post Footings and Center Strap Anchors

Base Bid Price: $5,000.00

Item #4 - Fencing

Base Bid Price: $40, 00.00

Item #5 — Paving—POST TENSION CONCRETE

Base Bid Price: $200,000.00

Item #6 - Court Surface Work (6 Courts)

Base Bid Price: $100,000.00

Item #7 — Court Entry Modifications

Base Bid Price: $5,000.00

Item #8 — Net Posts, Nets and Center Straps

Base Bid Price: $2,500.00

Item #9 - Windscreens

Base Bid Price: $2,500.00

TOTAL 1-9 - $ 370,000.00

ALTERNATE BID PRICING:

Item #1 — Eliminate the Perimeter Curb

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): N/A



Item #2 - Eliminate One Coat of Acrylic Color

Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): N/A

Item #3 — Maintain Existing Fence Posts
Alternate Bid Price (Deduct): N/A
Adding- ITEM #10 = POST TENSION CONCRETE Total Bid Price add Items 1 through 9

$ With No Alts = $370.00.00

Kevin J Bova Purchasing Agent




