

WATER POLLUTION CONTROL AUTHORITY
Town of Trumbull
CONNECTICUT

TOWN HALL
(203) 452-5048



5866 MAIN STREET
TRUMBULL, CT 06611

SEPTEMBER 24, 2014
7:00 p.m. Long Hill Room

MEETING AGENDA

1. Minutes to previous meeting
2. Contract 4:
 - Progress Report
3. Wright-Pierce Update
 - Phase 3
 - Phase 4
 - I/I Study
4. Old Business:
5. New Business:
 - Owens, Schine & Nicola: monthly invoices
 - Ury & Moskow: monthly invoices
 - Water Meter discussions
 - 634 Old Town Road
 - 6448 Main Street – Aquarion Water Consumption adjustment
 - Account 20100000 522210 Reimbursable Services to General Fund
6. Executive Session:
 - It is anticipated that the WPCA will vote to go into executive session to discuss preliminary drafts and/or notes as set forth by C.G.S. 1-210 (b)(1), matters concerning public officials or employees per C.G.S. 1-200 (6) and/or discuss with the Town Attorney strategy and negotiations with respect to pending litigation as defined by 1-200(6) and/or to discuss attorney client-privileged information as set forth by 1-210 relating to the following:
 - Mark IV – Contract 3 and Contract 4
 - Regionalization and/or re-negotiation of Bridgeport sewer treatment contract
 - Assessment – 72 Old Dike Road
 - WPCA Personnel
7. Any other business that may come before the Authority.

Owens, Schine & Nicola, P.C.

799 Silver Lane
P.O. Box 753
Trumbull, CT 06611

Ph:203-375-0600

Fax:203-375-5003

Town of Trumbull
5866 Main Street
Trumbull, CT 06611

September 16, 2014

Attention: Maria Pires

File #: 14010-04038

Inv #: 13793

RE: Mihaley - Town of Trumbull WPCA Sewer Assessment Appeal

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	LAWYER
Jul-02-14	Review correspondence from health district re: variance for septic and connection to public sewers.	0.80	DJK
	Correspondence to Attorney Tahlburg.	0.50	DJK
Aug-11-14	Correspondence to Attorney Tahlberg	0.10	DJK
	Totals	<hr/> 1.40	\$280.00
	Total Fee & Disbursements		<hr/> \$280.00
	Previous Balance		1,742.50
	Previous Payments		1,742.50
	Balance Now Due		<hr/> \$280.00

**TIMEKEEPER
SUMMARY**

DJK	1.40	\$280.00
-----	------	----------

Owens, Schine & Nicola, P.C.

799 Silver Lane
P.O. Box 753
Trumbull, CT 06611

Ph:203-375-0600

Fax:203-375-5003

Town of Trumbull
5866 Main Street
Trumbull, CT 06611

September 16, 2014

Attention: Maria Pires

File #: 14010-04015

Inv #: 13791

RE: BRIDGEPORT REGIONALIZATION SEWER AGREEMENT

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	LAWYER
Jul-01-14	Finalize complaint. Prepare for Marshal service. Correspondence with Marshal. Telephone call with client re: Bridgeport WPCA clerk.	2.50	DJK
	Reviewing draft of rate appeal complaint and revising same. Reviewing service statute and drafting service letter. Working on resolving service related issue.	3.80	DLC
Jul-03-14	Review Marshal return. E-file complaint with court.	0.50	DJK
	Organize injunction and rate appeal file. Scan in relevant exhibits for trial, discovery, prepare, file relevant discovery and review W&P memo's.	2.50	DJK
Jul-10-14	Correspondence from Attorney Dion. Review December action filed by Bridgeport. Review request for transfer to complex litigation.	1.50	DJK
	Legal research re: motion to dismiss.	0.50	DJK
	Meeting with DJK re: motion for complex lit. Perform research re: same.	1.00	DLC
Jul-11-14	Perform additional legal research re: motion to dismiss and prior pending action doctrine.	0.50	DLC
Jul-13-14	Drafting motion to dismiss collections and declaratory judgement action filed by Bridgeport. Legal research re: motion.	4.50	DJK

Jul-14-14	Drafting motion to dismiss.	3.50	DJK
	Review and revise motion to dismiss. Perform legal research re: same.	3.00	DLC
Jul-15-14	Drafting motion to dismiss. Drafting motion for contempt and sanctions. Compiling exhibits.	4.50	DJK
	Review and revise motion for contempt. Perform legal research re: same. Draft affidavits re: motion for contempt and motion to dismiss. Draft emails to client re: coordination of affidavit execution.	2.00	DLC
Jul-16-14	Perform research re: complex litigation transfers. Draft objection to complex lit. motion. File same on docket and draft email to opposing counsel. File motion to dismiss on docket and draft email to opposing counsel. File motion for contempt on docket and draft email to opposing counsel.	6.50	DLC
Jul-17-14	Review e-mail from C. Kurtz re: rate appeal complaint; review docket and download complaint and send to C. Kurtz	0.20	DLC
Jul-23-14	Review short calendar marking; review pleading and perform research; draft and file objection; telephone conference with DJK re: same	1.00	DLC
Jul-24-14	Correspondence to First Selectman re State Representative Letter Revisions	2.50	DJK
Aug-11-14	Correspondence from Court re status/Order to Consolidate/Conference with DLC	0.30	DJK
Aug-18-14	Meeting with Vidia Water Representative	0.50	DJK
Aug-19-14	Review objection to motion to dismiss in Bridgeport's collection action; review motion to re: same; advise DJK on need for reply brief	0.70	DLC
Aug-25-14	Correspondence from Attorney Hug/Review Request to Revise	0.50	DJK
Aug-26-14	Correspondence from/to Attorney Heath	0.10	DJK
Sep-10-14	Preparation for Status Conference/Lay out scheduling and briefing order	1.50	DJK
Sep-11-14	Attendance at Status Conference with Judge Bellis	2.50	DJK
	Correspondence to clients re potential Mediation	0.20	DJK

Sep-12-14	Telephone call from/to First Selectman's Office	0.10	DJK
	Memo to File re Status Conference	0.30	DJK
	Correspondence to Attorney Hug	0.10	DJK
	Totals	47.30	\$9,460.00

DISBURSEMENTS

Jul-02-14	Legal Research Charges	575.21	
	Totals	\$575.21	
	Total Fee & Disbursements		\$10,035.21
	Previous Balance		47,961.40
	Previous Payments		47,961.40
	Balance Now Due		\$10,035.21

**TIMEKEEPER
SUMMARY**

DJK	28.60	\$5,720.00
DLC	18.70	\$3,740.00

Owens, Schine & Nicola, P.C.

799 Silver Lane
P.O. Box 753
Trumbull, CT 06611

Ph:203-375-0600

Fax:203-375-5003

Town of Trumbull
5866 Main Street
Trumbull, CT 06611

September 16, 2014

Attention: Maria Pires

File #: 14010-04037

Inv #: 13792

RE: Von Stein - Town of Trumbull WPCA

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	LAWYER
Jun-09-14	Review file and docket re: status of reclaim. Draft email to RAZ re: same. Draft a request for argument re: discovery objection. Draft note to file.	0.50	DLC
Jun-17-14	Email exchanges with L. Guiluzza re: discovery. Draft and file on docket motion for order re: privilege log.	1.50	DLC
Jun-19-14	Correspondence to/from Attorney Guizman.	0.50	DJK
Jun-27-14	Review file and prep it for DJK re: argument on motion to strike, objections and draft request for argument and file on docket.	1.00	DLC
Jun-29-14	Prepare for oral arguments re: motion to strike.	0.50	DJK
Jun-30-14	Attendance at court re: motion to strike.	2.00	DJK
	Telephone call with Town Engineer.	0.20	DJK
Aug-07-14	Telephone call with Town Engineer	0.10	DJK
Aug-20-14	Review file re: discovery compliance; draft email to L. Guilluzia re: same; review Practice Book re: closing pleadings; draft and file cert of closed pleadings	0.80	DLC
Aug-29-14	Correspondence to Defendant re Gini's Depo	0.20	DJK
Sep-10-14	Telephone call with Attorney Gulliazi	0.20	DJK

Totals	7.50	\$1,500.00
Total Fee & Disbursements		\$1,500.00
Previous Balance		240.00
Previous Payments		240.00
Balance Now Due		\$1,500.00

**TIMEKEEPER
SUMMARY**

DJK	3.70	\$740.00
-----	------	----------

DLC	3.80	\$760.00
-----	------	----------

Owens, Schine & Nicola, P.C.

799 Silver Lane
P.O. Box 753
Trumbull, CT 06611

Ph:203-375-0600

Fax:203-375-5003

Town of Trumbull
5866 Main Street
Trumbull, CT 06611

September 16, 2014

Attention: Maria Pires

File #: 14010-04035

Inv #: 13794

RE: Mark IV - Contract 4 Litigation

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	LAWYER
Jul-10-14	Drafting answers, SD's and counterclaims re: complaint.	3.50	DJK
	Meeting with DJK re: special defense, counterclaims and third party complaint.	1.00	DLC
Jul-27-14	Drafting, Answer, SD's, Counterclaim/Review Bid Docs, Contract/All Correspondence from/to Mark IV to Town	5.00	DJK
Jul-28-14	Correspondence to T&B re improper paid change orders	0.20	DJK
	Drafting Answers, SD's and Couterclaims/E-mail correspondence to Attorney Moskow & PW Director/Telephone call with Fred Maiscia	5.50	DJK
	Review revised complaint and draft answer and counterclaims	0.90	EVW
	Meet with Dennis Kokenos re: revised complaint and answer counterclaim	0.90	EVW
Aug-04-14	Review correspondence from Attorney Cohan; correspondence to client re meeting correspondence to Attorney Cohan	2.00	DJK
Aug-05-14	Correspondence to clients re I & P answers	0.20	DJK
Aug-06-14	Review file and being drafting interrogatories and production request	2.00	DLC

	Review file and continue drafting interrogatories and production request	5.50	DLC
Aug-07-14	Telephone call with Town Engineer	0.10	DJK
Aug-08-14	Review file and continue drafting interrogatories and production request	5.50	DLC
Aug-11-14	Review/Revise Interrogatories & Request for Production	1.00	DJK
Aug-17-14	Finalize Interrogatories & Request For Production/Drafting Notice of Service/Correspondence to Attorney Chase/E-File Notice of Service of ROGS	1.50	DJK
Aug-18-14	Correspondence to Attorney Cohane	0.20	DJK
	Correspondence from Court	0.20	DJK
Aug-19-14	Review Mark IV Discover, Requests/Prep for Discovery, Meeting with client	1.00	DJK
	Meeting with Public Works Director/Town Engineer/Attorney Moskow/ T & B re Discovery Compliance	2.00	DJK
Aug-20-14	Correspondence to Frank Smeriglia outlining discover request/docs needed/Interrogatories to Answer	1.50	DJK
	E-mail to/from Attorney Cohane	0.20	DJK
Sep-05-14	Correspondence to Paul Kollmeyer re Testimony/Deposition	0.20	DJK
Sep-08-14	Attendance at Status Conference/Prep for Status Conference	1.50	DJK

Totals	41.60	\$8,320.00
--------	-------	------------

Total Fee & Disbursements	\$8,320.00
--------------------------------------	-------------------

Previous Balance	1,560.00
------------------	----------

Previous Payments	1,560.00
-------------------	----------

Balance Now Due	\$8,320.00
------------------------	-------------------

**TIMEKEEPER
SUMMARY**

DJK	25.80	\$5,160.00
-----	-------	------------

DLC	14.00	\$2,800.00
-----	-------	------------

EVW	1.80	\$360.00
-----	------	----------