

WATER POLLUTION CONTROL AUTHORITY
Town of Trumbull
CONNECTICUT

TOWN HALL
(203) 452-5048



5866 MAIN STREET
TRUMBULL, CT 06611

MAY 28, 2014
7:00 p.m. Long Hill Room

MEETING AGENDA

1. Minutes to previous meeting
2. Contract 4:
 - Progress Report
3. Wright-Pierce Update
 - Phase 3
 - Phase 4
 - I/I Study
4. Old Business:
5. New Business:
 - Owens, Schine & Nicola: monthly invoices
 - Ury & Moskow: monthly invoice
 - Town of Fairfield Sewer Department: bypass invoice
 - Discussions for Town of Trumbull proposed 2014-15 user rates
 - Operating budget – “extraordinary item” account 20100000 578805
6. Executive Session:
 - It is anticipated that the WPCA will vote to go into executive session to discuss preliminary drafts and/or notes as set forth by C.G.S. 1-210 (b)(1) and/or discuss with the Town Attorney strategy and negotiations with respect to pending litigation as defined by 1-200(6) and/or to discuss attorney client-privileged information as set forth by 1-210 relating to the following:
 - Mark IV – Contract 3 and Contract 4
 - Regionalization and/or re-negotiation of Bridgeport sewer treatment contract
7. Any other business that may come before the Authority.

WATER POLLUTION CONTROL AUTHORITY
Town of Trumbull
CONNECTICUT

TOWN HALL
(203) 452-5048



5866 MAIN STREET
TRUMBULL, CT 06611

MINUTES
Water Pollution Control Authority Meeting
April 23, 2014

Members Present:

Fred Palmieri, Vice Chairman
Laura Pulie
Timothy Hampford, Secretary (arrived 7:10)
John Gray, Alternate (voting)
Paul Whetstone, Alternate (voting)

Members Absent:

Jeffrey Wright, Chairman

Also Present:

Frank M. Smeriglio, PE, Town Engineer
Dennis Kokenos, Esq. Town Attorney (arrived 7:11)
Christine Kurtz, Wright-Pierce

Vice chairman Palmieri called the April 23, 2014 WPCA meeting to order at 7:05 p.m. and informed the commission chairman Wright is not able to attend the meeting this evening so he will lead the meeting in his absence.

1. Minutes to previous meetings.

March 26, 2014. There were no questions, comments or modifications regarding the March 26, 2014 Minutes. The vice chairman called for a motion to accept the Minutes as presented. MOTION made Pulie seconded Gray to accept the March 26, 2014 Minutes as presented. No discussion. MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

2. Contract 4.

Progress report.

Frank Smeriglio said the milling contractor is expected to come into Trumbull next week and will do a couple of small little roads outside of the sewer project and then Carrousel, Copper Kettle, North Stowe and Kingsbury the four roads in the contract 4 area. That work will probably start towards the end of next week and then followed by the paving contractor. He said we are probably a week away from doing a few punch list items on some of the easement properties and it is still a little too cold to plant grass. There is still one easement that he needs to coordinate with the owner to restore the property. Another item to note is that there are two properties on Dogwood that have been working with Mark IV's insurance company because there are cracks in their houses and Attorney Kokenos is involved with the status of them. Frank summarized the damage complaints and discussion included location of the properties, blasting, vibrations from excavating, precondition and pre-blast surveys.

3. Wright-Pierce Update.

Phase 3, Phase 4, I/I Study and Clean Water Fund. Christine Kurtz said she spoke with Frank and they are going to submit Phases 1, 2 and 3 into the SSES or Sanitary Sewer Evaluation Studies that were the result of the I/I study to the DEEP for their review and approval. Shortly following that they will submit Phase 4. This goes hand and hand with the new clean water fund as new reserves in the current and upcoming clean water fund list for pump station rehab and I/I construction and rehabilitation. With the 20 percent grant 80 percent loans it is a new reserve and you just want DEEP to know that the Town of Trumbull is working on satisfying all the aspects in the violations. At this point Phases 1, 2 and 3 should be submitted now.

Phase 4. Christine Kurtz said the last piece of the field work the CCTV the closed circuit TV of the sewers. They are about 50 percent complete with the work in this study area. She noted looked at the area by Beaches pool that Joe Solemene wanted checked, areas of concern and manholes around Beardsley and there were no any big finds of leaking water. She noted they probably have some room to add extra footage to add in extra pipes.

Clean Water Fund. The comment period closed on the 21st of April and with these two reserves on the clean water fund list she has been asking George Hicks at the DEEP about the particulars of some of Trumbull's upcoming projects. So, as a result of that those comments are going in under the comment period of the clean water fund application. That helps because these reserves are new and shows that Trumbull is interested in using some of these funds. She spoke with George Hicks today and he thinks those reserves will stay on the list and he thinks they will go fast because its funding that hasn't been there in the past. She spoke with him specifically about the rehab that's ready to go to bid if we can get the design documents into them for review and approve it he thinks the finalized list will be ready in about six weeks or sooner. All that could probably line up nicely to get the 20/80 on that project. Then the next project would be Beardsley and the design and construction of Beardsley. The way he would like to administrate these new funds is to get the design contract approved, the towns pay for them upfront, you put one application in but only after it goes to bid and then we get reimbursed for design. With all this new funding there is going to be a lot more work for them to administer so they don't want too many applications coming in from one particular project. So the recommendation that she would suggest is that once we are ready to go to design get the design contracts into them for approval and then get the application in once it goes to bid.

Frank Smeriglio asked the following question: Say with our phase 2 I/I design that we have that we are reviewing right now, if those plans were completed in two weeks and we're ready to go out to bid and we submit an application into the state for money, how long do you think we would have to wait or put the actual activity on hold until we know if we are approved or not? Christine said it is going to be a first come first bases so you are going to be one of the first people on line for that money because you're not even asking for design money you didn't get the contract approved so they can't even give you design money. As soon as the plans go in all they have to do is approve the plans and then wait for the bids to come in so she doesn't think it's going to hold up the projected time line at all. You put the application in after bids so you would have to have 30 day bid period at least. Commissioner Pulie commented that the I/I is for removal and not for the studies it's for the actual removal and construction. She asked about Stonehouse Road or Roosevelt Drive areas that have been identified and where manholes show signs of infiltration. Frank said we're actually just about done with the needed work in the Roosevelt area. There are other roads in that area that we videoed outside of Wright Pierce and we saw there are leaks and his plan is to show Christine where those areas are to put that as part of the I/I project for 2015. There are four different categories of what we can ask for in the grant so we just have to get the right projects into the right grants. Then what will happen is putting in applications with what these are associated with and then he will present them to the commission to move them forward. He has to balance to make sure he doesn't just put everything on hold and that we still proceed with doing something. If we think it going to take six, seven months to find out if they are going to be approved maybe he could put in the 2014 capital plan projects versus some of our older last year's projects. The Chairman asked if there were any other questions and there were none.

4. Old Business:

5120 Main Street: Usage charge to State of Connecticut. Frank said this was discussed last month and put on hold because we weren't sure if the state demolished the building, if the lot was still considered a lot, or if it was part of the right-of-way. He determined that they knocked down the house and the property was discontinued as a property and made into the state right-of-way. The commissioners reviewed the packet Frank passed out which included: April 3, 2014 letter from the state explaining it is part of Route 15 right-of-way; an e-mail from our licensed surveyor Steven Earley who reviewed the drawing and confirmed the state's findings; sheet showing the property (the former lot) highlighted in pink/red; and an aerial showing the lot is not there anymore. The lot was made part of Route 15 right-of-way and is part of a buffer for the highway. This property was also removed from the grand list. We charged the state the maintenance fee every year since 2000 for a total of \$1,768.15 and they are asking for that back. The state is looking for a refund and the question is do we give them back 1 year, 5 years, 10 years or nothing? Attorney Kokenos said the state is not an exempt entity and if they owned a piece of property in Trumbull and used it and there was sewer use they would have to pay the sewer use fee. The billing timeframe was discussed and Frank said we have been charging since the house was demolished because it was not removed. Frank explained if you knocked down your house you still pay the \$27.00 because it is still on the grand list, but this property was made into a part of a road and its use changed. Questions and comments followed regarding procedures, demolition permit notice, use change missed and notifications for sewer and tax departments. The state has been paying this for almost 15 years and Attorney Kokenos said that is an issue too. He said if was a where someone just made their lot bigger or consumed another lot and they continued to get a bill they certainly would have brought it to our attention a lot quicker and the state never bothered to do that and they just continued to pay the bill. Discussion followed. Attorney Kokenos said normal course is if someone had a problem they would have brought it to our attention and if there was an issue where you didn't think it was supposed to be taken out then they would have the statutory right to bring an appeal. He said that obviously has lapsed and the state has no right to that appeal. They are not an exempt property, they would have to pay the maintenance fee under any other circumstance, the time to take an appeal to it has lapsed, but if it's something that is brought to your attention now you still have the discretion if you want to reverse it, then you certainly can. He explained the procedures and the process regarding notice that goes out every year that sets the sewer rates and appeal information. It was noted the state didn't do anything over the years and kept paying. Further discussion followed.

Frank said if the land was considered a park then we could probably still charge the state, but the only 2 entities that can convert a piece of land to a right-of-way is either the town or the state. Setting a precedent is not an issue because if someone knocks down a house it is still a lot and they still have to pay the maintenance fee. Frank noted the maintenance charge is no longer being charged.

Vice chairman Palmieri asked if there is a motion on this.

Motion made Pulie that we don't pay it and we don't reimburse them for the past 14 years from 2000 and from here on just cease to bill them which we have done. There was no second. The vice chairman asked if there were any other motions. Commission Hampford asked for recommendations. Frank recommended a reimbursement. Questions included reasons for reimbursement, full or partial refund, why did it take so long and why did they keep paying?

The vice chairman asked for a motion.

MOTION made Hampford seconded Gray that we reimburse the State and refund the \$1,768.15 in full. No discussion. ONE OPPOSED (Pulie) MOTION CARRIED.

The vice chairman requested Frank take care of this matter.

Attorney Kokenos noted for the record that this in no way should establish any precedent as far as the maintenance fee for building lots or any of those scenarios. This seems to have been a clerical error where any other resident would have brought it to the WPCA's attention much sooner. The fact that the state did not do that certainly they are culpable, but in any other instance a rate appeal would have to be brought. The only reason this

is being entertained is because it was a clerical error that normally is brought to the town's attention much, much sooner.

5. New Business.

Owens, Schine & Nicola Monthly Invoices:

Invoice 13611: Mark IV – Contract 4 Litigation - \$280.00;

Invoice 13615: Bridgeport Regionalization Sewer Agreement - \$14,436.00;

Invoice 13616: Von Stein vs. Town of Trumbull WPCA - \$240.00.

Attorney Kokenos summarized the invoices:

#13611 there hasn't been much action in this matter recently and will discuss this more in executive session;

#13615 has to deal with the declaratory judgment action his office filed as well as the motion to confirm the arbitration award. They had a significant amount of work on this matter in the last month and will expand on that more in executive session. It was a very much time intensive type of situation.

#13616 is an assessment appeal that they continue to try to get resolved and he will also go into this a little more in executive session.

The commissioners reviewed the three invoices.

There being no comments the vice chairman called for a motion to accept the three invoices as presented.

MOTION made Pulie seconded Hampford to approve payment of invoice numbers 13611, 13615 and 13616 for Owens, Schine & Nicola. No discussion. MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

Ury & Moskow Invoice: Invoice 62074: Litigation v Regional Water Authority \$712.50. Attorney Kokenos explained attorney Moskow is assisting his office with respect to reviewing strategy and what we are going to do moving forward which is why there is this invoice.

The commissioners reviewed the invoice.

There being no comments the vice chairman called for a motion to make payment on invoice 62074 as presented.

MOTION made Pulie seconded Gray to approve payment of invoice number 62074 for Ury and Moskow. No discussion. MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

Attorney Kokenos said there is a retainer agreement with his office with regards to the City of Bridgeport litigation. In that retainer agreement the WPCA has already authorized them if there is a need to consult or deal with outside counsel that they are allowed to do so. He explained that is why this invoice is addressed to his office and why it is being brought to the WPCA in that manner.

6. Executive Session.

MOTION made Palmieri seconded Gray to move into executive session to discuss preliminary drafts and/or notes as set forth by C.G.S. 1-210(b)(1) and/or discuss with the Town Attorney strategy and negotiations with respect to pending litigation as defined by 1-200(6) and/or to discuss attorney client-privileged information as set forth by 1-210 relating to the following:

- Mark IV – Contract 3 and Contract 4
- Regionalization and/or re-negotiation of Bridgeport Sewer Treatment Contract

No discussion. MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

Remaining in the executive session will be Commissioners Fred Palmieri, Laura Pulie, Tim Hampford, John Gray and Paul Whetstone, Attorney Dennis Kokenos, Frank Smeriglio, Christine Kurtz.

At 7:38 p.m. the tape recorder was turned off, the clerk left the room and the Commission went into executive session.

At 8:33 p.m. the clerk was called back into the room and the recorder was turned on.

MOTION made Palmieri seconded Pulie to move out of executive session at 8:33 p.m. and to state no vote was taken. No discussion. MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

The vice chairman asked for a motion with regard to the supplemental appropriation discussion that was held in executive session and the motion was made by commissioner Hampford and seconded by commissioner Pulie. Discussion: Frank said as part of the 2013-2014 budget when we were going through the budget process in January 2013 our line item 5222204 sets aside dollars to pay Bridgeport. Subsequent to our budget process the city of Bridgeport raised their sewer user rates approximately 35%. We set our sewer usage rates accordingly, but what we have to do is go to the board of finance to request a supplemental appropriation to increase our line item to pay the city of Bridgeport to account for that 35% increase in rates. Frank handed out and went over paperwork he will be presenting to the board of finance. He went over the summary on page 2 and the balance needed in the amount \$1,120,000.00. He explained we would take that money from our operations account and then because we are collecting the revenue to account of this that money gets put back into our operating account at the end of the year. Commissioner Pulie wanted it noted that this is a line item transfer and not an increase in bills. Frank reiterated it is really a transfer from our operating account to our line item account and then our revenue gets transferred into our operating account.

The vice chairman asked if there was any further discussion on this motion. Hearing none he asked for the vote. MOTION made Hampford seconded Pulie for a supplemental appropriation in the amount of \$1,120,000.00. Discussion. MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

7. Any other business that may come before the Authority.

Contract 5 area sewer project. Frank said in the last two weeks there have been about five to eight residents calling or coming in asking about the status of the project. They are worried about their septic systems. He told them he would send a correspondence to the health department saying that there was a potential for a sewer project, these are the roads and for them to outline their health concerns for that area. What he has been telling residents is that there were preliminary plans completed about three years ago, but he considers them preliminary plans. That if there is a health concern in that area the next step is for him to outline a scope of what he believes needs to be done to those plans to bring them up to construction plans, get an estimate and its all contingent on if the health department has concerns. It was noted the plans for south Nichols contract 5 area were based on the specs from around twenty years ago. Commissioner Pulie said there is new technology out there if they have to repair their septic system that wasn't available 20 years ago. This is not going to happen next year so if they have systems that are failing there are repairs that may have to be made. Contract 5 is the south Nichols area.

There being no other business before the Authority, vice chairman Palmieri asked for a motion to adjourn the April 23, 2014 meeting.

MOTION made Pulie seconded Gray to adjourn the April 23, 2014 WPCA meeting at 8:45 p.m. No discussion. MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

Submitted by,

Joyce Augustinsky
Clerk of the Commission

Owens, Schine & Nicola, P.C.

799 Silver Lane
P.O. Box 753
Trumbull, CT 06611

Ph:203-375-0600

Fax:203-375-5003

Town of Trumbull
5866 Main Street
Trumbull, CT 06611

May 23, 2014

Attention: Maria Pires

File #: 14010-04015

Inv #: 13683

RE: BRIDGEPORT REGIONALIZATION SEWER AGREEMENT

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	LAWYER
Apr-01-14	Review marshal return. Efile all motions at court. Correspondence to First Selectman and Chairman of Commission.	2.50	DJK
	Finalize motion for order and notice. Efile with court. Correspondence to defendants.	0.50	DJK
Apr-08-14	Correspondence from W&P. Review requested docs from Attorney Proto.	0.50	DJK
	Correspondence from Bridgeport re: march invoice. Correspondence to Attorney Hug. Correspondence to Frank Smeriglio.	1.00	DJK
	Correspondence from court re: hearing. Correspondence from Attorney Kiskar.	0.30	DJK
Apr-11-14	Correspondence from Robinson & Cole.	0.10	DJK
	Telephone call with First Selectman.	0.10	DJK
Apr-14-14	Correspondence from Town Clerk re: tax warrant. Legal research re: injunction re: Alices tax warrant. Outline injunction. Conference call with client re: tax warrant. Conference with DLC, RJN and EVW re: injunction.	2.50	DJK
Apr-15-14	Drafting application for injunction, summons, order to show counsel, affidavit or Marsillio and order re: ex past injunction.	9.00	DJK

	Perform legal research re: application for ex parte post commencement injunction.	2.50	DLC
Apr-16-14	Revise affidavit of Marsillio. Meeting at Town Hall re: executed affidavit.	0.70	DJK
	Revise application for injunction and memorandum of law.	1.50	DJK
	Finalize application of injunction. Prepare exhibits.	2.50	DJK
	Telephone call with Attorney Proto.	0.20	DJK
	Telephone call with John Marsillio.	0.10	DJK
	Telephone call with Travelers Insurance re: potential coverage.	0.20	DJK
	Reviewing and revising pleadings re: ex parte application for temporary injunction. Perform additional legal research re: same.	6.00	DLC
Apr-22-14	Correspondence to commission and Palmeiri re: update and injunction.	0.70	DJK
	Telephone call with Attorney Moskow.	0.50	DJK
	Correspondence from Town Clerk re: demand. Correspondence to clients re: potential garnishment.	0.20	DJK
	Review Marshal return and instruct paralegal on docketing re: injunction motion.	0.10	DLC
Apr-23-14	Correspondence to Town Engineer re: response to Bridgeport billing.	1.00	DJK
Apr-24-14	Conference with EVW, DLC and RJN re: injunction hearing.	1.50	DJK
	Correspondence to Attorney Proto.	0.10	DJK
	Review EPA sewer user guidelines and federal regulations re: sewer use fees.	2.50	DJK
	Injunction prep planning meeting. Perform legal research for DJK per planning meeting re: irreprehable harm.	5.00	DLC
	Meeting with Bob Nicola, Dennis Kokenos and Darin Callahan re: injunction hearing Bridgeport Superior court.	0.60	EVW

	Research and prepare outline as to legal elements and proof required in an application for injunction.	0.90	EVW
Apr-25-14	Litigation planning meeting with DJK re: injunction hearing. Participate in telecom with Pierce Wright.	1.00	DLC
	Legal research on issue of injunction and legal standards of proof and evidentiary issues.	0.90	EVW
Apr-27-14	Preparation for injunction hearing.	3.00	DJK
Apr-28-14	Preparation for injunction hearing.	7.00	DJK
	Review case law provided by DJK re: injunction. Hearing prep.	1.50	DLC
	Meeting with Dennis Kokenos to strategize about case.	0.40	EVW
	Prepare subpoena William Robinson WPCA.	0.30	EVW
	Prepare subpoena Veronica Jones - Tax Collector Bridgeport.	0.30	EVW
	Legal research re: Bpts WPCA legal authority to issue tax warrant upon Trumbull.	0.30	EVW
	Telephone conference with Gerry Broderick, Marshal re: subpoena and service and correspondence to him.	0.30	EVW
	Review WPCA (Trumbull) meeting agenda, minutes and motions for 2012-2014	1.40	EVW
Apr-29-14	Preparation for injunction hearing. Drafting reply brief.	6.50	DJK
	Meeting with Commissioner Hampford re: injunction hearing.	1.50	DJK
	Meeting with John Marsillio and Frank Smeriglio re: injunction hearing.	1.50	DJK
	Review objection to injunction. Perform legal research. Draft reply brief.	8.50	DLC
	Meeting with Tim Hanford Town of Trumbull to prepare for injunction hearing.	1.20	EVW
	Meeting with John Marsillio re: Town of Trumbull injunction hearing preparation.	0.90	EVW

	Prepare direct examination questions for Veronica Jones, Tax Collector.	0.80	EVW
	Prepare direct exam questions for Peter Harris Director of Finance WPCA.	0.90	EVW
	Legal research tax warrant under C6S 12-162.	0.50	EVW
	Review defendant Bridgeport WPCA's objection and motion to dismiss.	0.60	EVW
Apr-30-14	Attendance in court re: application for injunction and motion to dismiss.	3.50	DJK
	Review motion to dismiss. Perform legal research. Start drafting objection and memorandum of law.	6.50	DLC
	Finalize direct exam of WPCA rep Peter Harris.	0.40	EVW
	Appear in court Bridgeport Superior for injunction and motion to dismiss.	3.20	EVW
May-01-14	Prepare for oral arguments re: motion to dismiss. Review and finalize objection to motion to dismiss.	2.50	DJK
	Review motion to dismiss. Continue performing legal research. Finish drafting objection and memorandum of law re: same.	5.00	DLC
	Telephone conference with Russell Liscov.	0.20	EVW
	Email Russell Liscov.	0.30	EVW
	Review file as to exhibits for objection motion to dismiss.	0.40	EVW
	Review spreadsheet from Bridgeport WPCA as to payments by Trumbull and amounts due and owing (claimed) by Bridgeport WPCA.	0.30	EVW
	Telephone conference with Dennis from DEEP as to issue of Bridgeport setting rate sewer usage by Trumbull residents.	0.30	EVW
May-02-14	Attendance at court re: motion to dismiss and app. to confirm award.	4.50	DJK
	Attend hearing re: motion to dismiss. Attend exhibit marking meeting re: injunction hearing.	6.00	DLC
	Prepare witness list and list of exhibits and organize.	1.20	EVW

	Appear in court to mark exhibits to be used in hearing on monday 5-5-14. Review Peter Harris's file (2013).	2.50	EVW
	Prepare stipulation re: subpoena on Veronica Jones, Tax Collector.	0.80	EVW
	Telephone conference with Russell Liscov re: stipulation on Veronica Jones, Tax Collector.	0.30	EVW
May-04-14	Preparation for injunction hearing.	2.50	DJK
May-05-14	Attendance at court re: injunction hearing.	7.00	DJK
	Prepare for hearing. Review all subpoenaed records from Peter Harris, Director of Finance WPCA. Finalize x-exam of Peter Harris and finalize stipulation Veronica Jones.	2.10	EVW
	Attend injunction hearing at Bridgeport Superior Court before Judge Rodcliffe.	4.50	EVW
May-08-14	Correspondence from client re: Bridgeport proposed budget. Review notice and budget.	0.50	DJK
	Correspondence to clients re: hearing.	0.20	DJK
	Correspondence to Commissioner Wright and Palmeiri. Correspondence to Commissioner Pulie. Correspondence to Frank Smeriglio.	1.50	DJK
May-12-14	Telephone call with Christine Kurtz.	0.20	DJK
	Correspondence from Christine Kurtz.	0.10	DJK
May-15-14	Correspondence to Attorney Proto.	0.80	DJK
	Travel to and attend scheduling conference.	1.00	DLC
May-16-14	Meeting with Public Works Director and Town Engineer.	2.00	DJK
	Memo to file. Open new file.	0.40	DJK
	Perform legal research re: exhaustion of administrative remedies.	1.00	DLC
May-19-14	Prepare for public hearing. Conference with RJN and DLC. Legal research re: exhaustion. Correspondence to/from experts.	3.50	DJK

	Correspondence from W&P. Outline objection for Public hearing. Review W&P memo.	1.00	DJK
May-20-14	Preparation for public hearing. Drafting objection and affidavit of sewer administrator. Attendance at public hearing.	4.50	DJK
	Perform legal research and work with DJK re: hearing submissions. Telecoms and email changes with client and expert. Attend hearing.	7.00	DLC
	Totals	<u>160.30</u>	\$33,400.00

DISBURSEMENTS

Apr-22-14	On Account of Fees and Disbursements	812.00	
May-02-14	On Account of Fees and Disbursements	90.00	
May-05-14	On Account of Fees and Disbursements	59.40	
	Totals	<u>\$961.40</u>	
	Total Fee & Disbursements		<u>\$34,361.40</u>
	Previous Balance		14,436.00
	Previous Payments		14,436.00
	Balance Now Due		<u>\$34,361.40</u>

**TIMEKEEPER
SUMMARY**

DJK	82.40	\$16,480.00
DLC	51.10	\$10,220.00
EVW	26.80	\$6,700.00

Owens, Schine & Nicola, P.C.

799 Silver Lane
P.O. Box 753
Trumbull, CT 06611

Ph:203-375-0600

Fax:203-375-5003

Town of Trumbull
5866 Main Street
Trumbull, CT 06611

May 23, 2014

Attention: Maria Pires

File #: 14010-04035

Inv #: 13684

RE: Mark IV - Contract 4 Litigation

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	LAWYER
Apr-11-14	Telephone call with Attorney Cohane.	0.10	DJK
Apr-14-14	Drafting objection to complex litigation application. Correspondence to court. Correspondence to Attorney Cohane.	2.00	DJK
Apr-22-14	review reply to objection to complex litigation.	0.50	DJK
May-20-14	Correspondence from court.	0.10	DJK
	Totals	<hr/> 2.70	\$540.00
	Total Fee & Disbursements		<hr/> \$540.00
	Previous Balance		280.00
	Previous Payments		280.00
	Balance Now Due		<hr/> \$540.00

**TIMEKEEPER
SUMMARY**

DJK	2.70	\$540.00
-----	------	----------

URY & MOSKOW, L.L.C.

883 Black Rock Turnpike
Fairfield, CT 06825

Ph:(203) 610-6393

Fax:(203) 610-6399

Town of Trumbull

May 06, 2014

Owens Shine & Nicola
799 Silver Lane
Trumbull, CT 06611

Attention: Robert Nicola

File #: 10408

Inv #: 62130

RE: Contract Dispute- Town of Trumbull v Mark 4 Construction, et al

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Mar-26-14	Review of documents - Print and review judicial docket; retrieve revised complaint; retrieve defendant Mark IV's motion strike/memo of law; plaintiff's objection thereto.	0.50	125.00	SDO
Apr-02-14	Review of documents in preparation for upcoming court hearing on April 7th: retrieve and/or print 3 motions to strike; 3 memorandum of law in support of motions to strike; 3 objections and memorandum of law in support of objections; print/review Mark IV's amended motion to strike; mark up judicial docket regarding particular defendants/particular counts; list respective counts on motions/objections; prepare grid of 21 counts with correspondence docket entry nos.	2.00	500.00	SDO
	Review of documents - review of defendant Mark IV Construction Co.'s motion to strike, amended motion to strike, memorandum of law in support of motion to strike, including common law; review of plaintiff's objection and memorandum of law in support of objection, including common law.	1.50	375.00	SDO
Apr-03-14	Review of documents in preparation for hearing: Defendant Moutinho's motion to strike, memorandum of law in support of motion along with common law; plaintiff's objection and memorandum of law along with common law; print and reproduce several cases.	1.50	375.00	SDO

	Review of documents in preparation for hearing - review defendant DellaBitta's motion to strike and memorandum of law in support of; review Plaintiff's objection and memorandum of law.	1.00	250.00	SDO
Apr-07-14	Prepare oral argument; attendance at Waterbury Superior Court complex litigation for hearing (motions to strike, objections thereto).	3.50	875.00	SDO
Apr-23-14	Preparation of pleading - substituted complaint after motion to strike.	2.00	630.00	NLM
	Total Fees	12.00	<u>\$3,130.00</u>	

Total Invoice	<u>\$3,130.00</u>
----------------------	--------------------------

Previous Balance	\$6,519.62
Previous Payments	\$6,519.62

Balance Due Now	<u>\$3,130.00</u>
------------------------	--------------------------

4/29/14

TOWN OF FAIRFIELD SEWER DEPARTMENT
Invoice for Trumbull Bypass

RECEIVED
MAY 05 2014
Moln
ENGINEERING

Start bypass 14:00 4/10/14, End bypass 16:30 4/11/14 =
26.5 hours = 1,590 minutes

All flows assumed at 20gpm
1,590min x 20gpm = 31,800 gallons

Gallons Discharged 31,800

Divided by 748 = Units 42.52

X 2.90 = \$ 123.31

Employees oversight (4hrs) \$ 110.30

Total cost for bypass \$ 233.61

Please make check payable to:

Town of Fairfield
Attn: Sewer Department
725 Old Post Road
Fairfield, CT 06824

Invoice due upon receipt.